City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 3, 2019
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Hot Applied Thermoplastic and Permanent Prefabricated Ennis-Flint, Inc. Pathmark Traffic Equipment, Swarco Industries, LLC.
Pavement Markings LLC.
4161 Piedmont Parkway, Suite
6100011372 DS 370 4435 Hunter Road 270 Rutherford Lane
Greensboro, San Marcos Columbia
Est. Annual [NC 27410 TX 78666 TN 38401
Item Description Qty 800-331-8118
1 4 inch wide white line, 90 LNFT 50
Price Each $67.30 $155.00 No Bid
Price Total $3,365.00 $7,750.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. PM600100 Swarco 3490
2 24 inch wide white line, 15 LNFT 2,000
Price Each $63.50 $149.00 No Bid
Price Total $127.000.00 $298,000.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. 8430566 Swarco 3502
3 Riaht White Arrow (per each), 2 per pack 8' 2" x 6' 3" 15
Price Each $140.30 $310.00 No Bid
Price Total $2,104.50 $4,650.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. 8330241R Swarco 3546
4 Left White Arrow (per each), 2 per pack 8' 2" x 6' 3" 30
Price Each $140.30 $310.00 No Bid
Price Total $4.,209.00 $9,300.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. 8330241L Swarco 3545
5 Word "ONLY" (per word), 1 per box 8' tall 50
Price Each $100.43 $220.00 No Bid
Price Total $5.021.50 $11,000.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. 8130102 Swarco 3639
6 Straight White Arrow (per each) 2 per pack 9'10" x 3' 3" 20
Price Each $120.99 $268.00 No Bid
Price Total $2,419.80 $5,360.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. 8330240 Swarco 3550
7 Railroad Crossing Symbol, including two R's, crossbuck and 3 transverse
bars (per each), 2 ea. "R" and 1 ea. "X" 24" wide material 6' 6" 20
Price Each $192.28 $429.00 No Bid
Price Total $3,845.60 $8,580.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Swarco 3644
PMK8130103ASP1
8 Symbol, Bicycle Rider with Helmet, 6' 6" x 3' 4" x 90 mil, Left facing 20
Price Each $304.34 $680.00 No Bid
Price Total $6,086.80 $13,600.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc.
PM602006L Swarco 3573
9 Arrow, Bike Straight 6' x 90 mil. 50
Price Each $130.15 $299.00 No Bid
Price Total $6.507.50 $14,950.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Swarco 3525
PM602005-5pk
10 Numbers "0" through "5" PN 813002-#, Color: White, Size 8' 30
Price Each $30.51 $65.00 No Bid
Price Total $915.30 $1,950.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Swarco 3640
813002#
11 Black Out Line, Model # 84151064BKQ equal, packs should include
pre-mark sealer PM 125BK Q30' 12" Blackout Line or approved equal,
30 LNFT per box 2,000
Price Each $61.38 $245.00 No Bid
Price Total $122,760.00 $490,000.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Flint
8451064BKQ 8451064BKQ
12 Shrk Teeth PM125W/BK Q15 BD w/1.5" contrast border,
12" x 18", 125 MIL 200
Price Each $137.28 $105.00 No Bid
Price Total $27,456.00 $21,000.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Swarco 3567
8232503CONT
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 3, 2019
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Hot Applied Thermoplastic and Permanent Prefabricated Ennis-Flint, Inc. Pathmark Traffic Equipment, Swarco Industries, LLC.
Pavement Markings LLC.
4161 Piedmont Parkway, Suite
6100011372 DS 370 4435 Hunter Road 270 Rutherford Lane
Greensboro, San Marcos Columbia
Est. Annual [NC 27410 TX 78666 TN 38401
Item Description Qty 800-331-8118
13 Black Out Line equal, packs should include pre-mark sealer PM 125BK Q30" 4"
Blackout Line or approved equal, 90 LNFT per box 100
Price Each $45.37 $170.00 No Bid
Price Total $4,537.00 $17,000.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint,Inc. Flint
8452060BKQ 8452060BKQ
14 Right White Arrow w/black border (per each), 2 per pack 8' 2" x 6' 3"
plus black border 4" 30
Price Each $142.21 $188.00 No Bid
Price Total $4,266.30 $5,640.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Swarco 4148
PM300100RCONT|
15 Left White Arrow w/black border (per each), 2 per pack 8' 2" x 6' 3"
plus black border 4" 30
Price Each $142.21 $188.00 No Bid
Price Total $4,266.30 $5,640.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Swarco 4147
PM300100LCONT|
16 Straight White Arrow w/black Border (per each) 1 per box 9'10"x 3' 3"
plus black border 4" 15
Price Each $154.82 $204.00 No Bid
Price Total $2,322.30 $3,060.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Swarco 4151
PM300110CONT]
17 PreMark Sealer, 4 liter Bucket, 624206-4 or equal 50
Price Each $44.10 $65.00 No Bid
Price Total $2,205.00 $3,250.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Flint 624206-4
64206-4
18 PM125WH Q30' BD 12" White lines 120
Price Each $63.50 $150.00 No Bid
Price Total $7,620.00 $18,000.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Swarco 3496
8431064
19 PM125WH/BK Q15' BD 12" WH Line/W3" Black Contrast 120
Price Each $88.96 $199.00 No Bid
Price Total $10,675.20 $23,880.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Flint PM6303034cont
PM60303034CONT|
20 PM125YW Q90' BD 4"X3" Yellow Line 300
Price Each $71.82 $160.00 No Bid
Price Total $21,546.00 $48,000.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Swarco 3491
PM600101
21 12in Chevron Arrow, 12x9x5 300
Price Each $115.37 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $34,611.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc.
8230127HS
22 4in Yellow with Black Border, 4"x3"' per pack 30
Price Each $106.62 $141.00 No Bid
Price Total $3,198.60 $4,230.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Swarco 4129
8431560YCONT]
23 Shared Lane Symbols, 9'4" x 3'4' 30
Price Each $156.48 $400.00 No Bid
Price Total $4,694.40 $12,000.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Swarco 3792
PM60833
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 3, 2019
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Hot Applied Thermoplastic and Permanent Prefabricated Ennis-Flint, Inc. Pathmark Traffic Equipment, Swarco Industries, LLC.
Pavement Markings LLC.
4161 Piedmont Parkway, Suite
6100011372 DS 370 4435 Hunter Road 270 Rutherford Lane
Greensboro, San Marcos Columbia
Est. Annual |NC 27410 TX 78666 TN 38401
Item Description Qty 800-331-8118
24 Bundy, 5"x5" 140/pk 200
Price Each $54.11 $135.00 No Bid
Price Total $10,822.00 $27,000.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Swarco 4275
8430055BK (140/box)
25 Super Bundy 8"x8" 80/pk 100
Price Each $81.66 $300.00 No Bid
Price Total $8,166.00 $30,000.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Flint 8544056 (80/box)
8434056
26 12" White Line/W 3" Black Contrast, 12"x3 100
Price Each $88.96 $199.00 No Bid
Price Total $8,896.00 $19,900.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Flint
PM603034CONT] PM603034cont
27 12" White Line, 12" 100
Price Each $63.50 $150.00 No Bid
Price Total $6,350.00 $15,000.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Sworco 3496
8431064
28 Black Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Material, Spray formulation 50 Ibs bags
Palletized & shrink wrapped 44,000
Price Each $0.50 $0.8325 $0.575
Price Total $22,000.00 $36,630.00 $25,300.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. Ennis 884607| Swarco /Ib.
844602
29 White Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Material, Spray formulation 50 Ibs bags
Palletized & shrink wrapped 44,000
Price Each $0.59 $0.675 $0.61
Price Total $25,960.00 $29,700.00 $26,840.00
Manufacturer & Model No.: Ennis-Flint, Inc. DIJ TXW Swarco
884490 /lb.
Delivery days 14 days 30 days 15 days
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total: $493,827.10 $1,185,070.00 $52,140.00
Estimated Annual Award: $493,827.10
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