

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 1, 2019			Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
For: Purchase of Cargo and Passenger Van's			Gunn Chevrolet, LTD	Jim Bass Ford, Inc	Ancira Motor Company	Cowboy Motors	Grande Truck Center	Grapevine DCJ, LLC	Silsbee Ford
6100011158 LD			16550 IH35 N.	4032 W. Houston Harte Expwy San Angelo, TX 76901 325-949-4621	10807 IH10M West San Antonio, TX 78230 210-558-1500	1305 Hwy 96 Bypass Silsbee, TX 77656	4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219	2601 William Tate Grapevine, TX 76051	1211 U.S. Hwy 96N Silsbee, TX 77656
Item	Description	QTY	Selma, TX 78154 210-599-5000						
1	DELETED:								
2	8501- 10,000 GVWR Van 15 passenger LOW ROOF, SWING DOOR:	1							
	Price Each:		\$30,436.00	\$33,164.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$35,133.00	No Bid	\$32,662.65
	Total:		\$30,436.00	\$33,164.00			\$35,133.00		\$32,662.65
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2019 Chevrolet 3500 Ext Express 15 Passenger Van CG33706	2019 Ford Transit			2019 Ford Transit 15 Pass Wagon		2019 Ford Transit T-350
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):		GM LV1 Gas V6 4.3 L 276 HP	Ford 3.7 L V6, 275 HP			Ford 3.7 V6 Gas, 275 H.P.		3.7 L V6
	Transmission Offered:		5MV HD Automatic	Ford 6 speed automatic			Ford 6 Speed Automatic W/OD		6 - Spd Auto
	Warranty:		3yr or 36,000K BTB 5yr or 100,000K powertrain	3 yrs. or 36,000 miles bumper to bumper. 5 yrs. or 60,000 miles powertrain			36 Months or 36,000 Miles		36m/36,000 Bumper to Bumper, 5yr/60,000 Powertrain
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Gunn Chevrolet, LTD	Any Ford Dealer Nationwide			Grande Truck Center		Local Dealer
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		16550 IH35N, Selma, TX 78154	Any Ford dealer within City limits			4562 IH-10 East, San Antonio, TX 78219		Local Dealer
	Delivery:		180 Days	100-120 Days			130-150 Days		120 Days
	Production Cut-off Date:		8/16/2019	5/31/2019			5/31/2019		5-1-19
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:		5/2/2019	5/30/2019			5/20/2019		5-1-19
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		Not Provided	Yes			No		No

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 1, 2019			Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
For: Purchase of Cargo and Passenger Van's			Gunn Chevrolet, LTD	Jim Bass Ford, Inc	Ancira Motor Company	Cowboy Motors	Grande Truck Center	Grapevine DCJ, LLC	Silsbee Ford
6100011158 LD			16550 IH35 N.	4032 W. Houston Harte Expwy San Angelo, TX 76901 325-949-4621	10807 IH10M West San Antonio, TX 78230 210-558-1500	1305 Hwy 96 Bypass Silsbee, TX 77656	4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219	2601 William Tate Grapevine, TX 76051	1211 U.S. Hwy 96N Silsbee, TX 77656
Item	Description	QTY	Selma, TX 78154 210-599-5000						
3	8501- 10,000 GVWR Van Window- 12 passenger LOW ROOF BI-FUEL PROPANE, SWING DOORS: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Fuel System Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	 \$39,718.00 \$79,436.00 2019 Chevrolet 3500 Ext 12 Passenger Express Van CG33706 GM L96 Gas/Ethanol V8, 6.0L 341 HP MYD 6 HD Automatic Gas/Ethanol, Propane NAT-G (See Quote) 3yr or 36,000K BTB 5yr or 100,000K PT Gunn Chevrolet, LTD 16550 IH35N, Selma, TX 78154 180 Days 8/16/2019 5/2/2019 Not Provided	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$44,561.00 \$89,122.00 2019 Ford Transit 14 Pass Wagon Ford 3.7 V6 Gas, 275 H.P. Ford 6 Speed Automatic W/OD Nat G ICOM JTG II Bi Fuel Propane 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Grande Truck Center 4562 IH-10 East, San Antonio, TX 78219 130-150 Days 5/31/2019 5/20/2019 No	No Bid	\$40,380.65 \$80,761.30 2019 Ford Transit T-350 3.7 L V6 6 - Spd Auto Gas/Propane Not Provided Local Dealer Local Dealer 120 Days 5-1-19 5-1-19 No

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 1, 2019			Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
For: Purchase of Cargo and Passenger Van's			Gunn Chevrolet, LTD	Jim Bass Ford, Inc	Ancira Motor Company	Cowboy Motors	Grande Truck Center	Grapevine DCJ, LLC	Silsbee Ford
6100011158 LD			16550 IH35 N.	4032 W. Houston Harte Expwy San Angelo, TX 76901 325-949-4621	10807 IH10M West San Antonio, TX 78230 210-558-1500	1305 Hwy 96 Bypass Silsbee, TX 77656	4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219	2601 William Tate Grapevine, TX 76051	1211 U.S. Hwy 96N Silsbee, TX 77656
Item	Description	QTY	Selma, TX 78154 210-599-5000						
4	8501- 10,000 GVWR Van 15 passenger MED ROOF, SLIDE DOOR: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	\$34,388.00 \$34,388.00 2019 Ford Transit Ford 3.7 V6, 275 HP Ford 6 speed automatic 3 yrs. or 36,000 miles bumper to bumper. 5 yrs. or 60,000 miles powertrain Any Ford Dealer Nationwide Any Ford dealer within City limits 100-120 Days 5/31/2019 5/30/2019 Yes	No Bid	No Bid	\$37,616.00 \$37,616.00 9.4% \$3,228.00 2019 Ford Transit 15 Pass Wagon Ford 3.7 V6 Gas, 275 H.P. Ford 6 Speed Automatic W/OD 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Grande Truck Center 4562 IH-10 East, San Antonio, TX 78219 130-150 Days 5/31/2019 5/20/2019 No	No Bid	\$35,039.17 \$35,039.17 2019 Ford T-350 Transit 3.7 L V6 6 - Spd Auto 36m/36,000 Bumper to Bumper, 5yr/60,000 Powertrain Local Dealer Local Dealer 120 Days 5-1-19 5-1-19 No

Prepared by Purchasing 5/1/2019

4 of 7

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 1, 2019			Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local
For: Purchase of Cargo and Passenger Van's			Gunn Chevrolet, LTD	Jim Bass Ford, Inc	Ancira Motor Company	Cowboy Motors	Grande Truck Center	Grapevine DCJ, LLC	Silsbee Ford
6100011158 LD			16550 IH35 N.	4032 W. Houston Harte Expwy San Angelo, TX 76901 325-949-4621	10807 IH10M West San Antonio, TX 78230 210-558-1500	1305 Hwy 96 Bypass Silsbee, TX 77656	4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219	2601 William Tate Grapevine, TX 76051	1211 U.S. Hwy 96N Silsbee, TX 77656
Item	Description	QTY							
6	8501- 10,000 GVWR CARGO VAN, LOW ROOF, SWING DOOR:	1							
	Each Price:		\$26,410.13	\$35,498.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$29,542.00	No Bid	\$36,754.77
	Total:		\$26,410.13	\$35,498.00			\$29,542.00		\$36,754.77
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2019 Chevrolet 2500 Ext Cargo Van CG23705	2019 Ford Transit			2019 Ford Transit Van		2019 Ford T-250 Transit
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):		GM LV1 Gas V6, 4.3L 276 HP	Ford 3.7 V6, 275 HP			Ford 3.7 V6 Gas, 275 H.P.		3.7 L V6
	Transmission Offered:		5MV HD Automatic	Ford 6 speed automatic			Ford 6 Speed Automatic W/OD		6 - Spd Auto
	Warranty:		3yr or 36,000K BTB 5yr or 100,000K PT	3 yrs. or 36,000 miles bumper to bumper. 5 yrs. or 60,000 miles powertrain			36 Months or 36,000 Miles		36m/36,000 Bumper to Bumper, 5yr/60,000 Powertrain
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Gunn Chevrolet, LTD	Any Ford Dealer Nationwide			Grande Truck Center		Local Dealer
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		16550 IH35N, Selma, TX 78154	Any Ford dealer within City limits			4562 IH-10 East, San Antonio, TX 78219		Local Dealer
	Delivery:		180 Days	100-120 Days			130-150 Days		120 Days
	Production Cut-off Date:		8/16/2019	5/31/2019			5/31/2019		5-1-19
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:		5/2/2019	5/30/2019			5/20/2019		5-1-19
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		Not Provided	Yes			No		No

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 1, 2019			Local		Non-Local			Local		Non-Local			Local		Non-Local		Non-Local	
For: Purchase of Cargo and Passenger Van's			Gunn Chevrolet, LTD		Jim Bass Ford, Inc		Ancira Motor Company		Cowboy Motors		Grande Truck Center		Grapevine DCJ, LLC		Silsbee Ford			
6100011158 LD			16550 IH35 N.		4032 W. Houston Harte Expwy San Angelo, TX 76901 325-949-4621		10807 IH10M West San Antonio, TX 78230 210-558-1500		1305 Hwy 96 Bypass Silsbee, TX 77656		4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219		2601 William Tate Grapevine, TX 76051		1211 U.S. Hwy 96N Silsbee, TX 77656			
Item	Description	QTY	Selma, TX 78154 210-599-5000															
7	Minimum 9,350 lbs. GVWR CARGO VAN, HIGH ROOF, SLIDE DOOR: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid		\$36,869.00 \$36,869.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$39,134.00 \$39,134.00 6.1%		No Bid		Withdrew \$32,779.72 \$32,779.72			
					2019 Ford Transit						2019 Ford Transit Van, Note: Max GVWR 9000 lbs.				2019 Ford T-350 Transit			
					Ford 3.7L V6, 275 HP						Ford 3.7 V6 Gas, 275 H.P.				3.7 L V6			
					Ford 6 speed automatic						Ford 6 Speed Automatic with Over Drive				6 - Spd Auto			
					3 yrs. or 36,000 miles bumper to bumper.						36 Months or 36,000 Miles				36m/36,000 Bumper to Bumper, 5yr/60,000 Powertrain			
					5 yrs. or 60,000 miles powertrain													
					Any Ford Dealer Nationwide						Grande Truck Center				Local Dealer			
					Any Ford dealer within City limits						4562 IH-10 East, San Antonio, TX 78219				Local Dealer			
					100-120 Days						130-150 Days				120-160 Days			
					5/31/2019						5/31/2019				5-1-19			
					5/30/2019						5/20/2019				5-1-19			
					Yes						No				No			

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 1, 2019			Local		Non-Local		Local		Non-Local		Local		Non-Local		Non-Local	
For: Purchase of Cargo and Passenger Van's			Gunn Chevrolet, LTD		Jim Bass Ford, Inc		Ancira Motor Company		Cowboy Motors		Grande Truck Center		Grapevine DCJ, LLC		Silsbee Ford	
6100011158 LD			16550 IH35 N.		4032 W. Houston Harte Expwy San Angelo, TX 76901 325-949-4621		10807 IH10M West San Antonio, TX 78230 210-558-1500		1305 Hwy 96 Bypass Silsbee, TX 77656		4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219		2601 William Tate Grapevine, TX 76051		1211 U.S. Hwy 96N Silsbee, TX 77656	
Item	Description	QTY														
8	Mini Vans for Surveillance: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Prompt Payment Discount: Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Payment Terms: Total:	4	No Bid	No Bid		\$22,178.00 \$88,712.00 0.34%	\$22,103.00 \$88,412.00	\$26,790.00 \$107,160.00	\$23,130.00 \$92,520.00	No Bid						
						2019 Dodge Grand Caravan	2019 Dodge Caravan	2020 Ford Transit Connect Wagon. Note: 4 Cylinder 162 H.P., 15 Gallon Fuel Tank								
						Pentastar 3.6 L, V6, 283HP 6 Spd Automatic	3.6 L, V6. 6-Spd. Auto	Ford I4 2.0 L Gas, 162 H.P. Ford 8 Speed Automatic Select Shift								
						3 yr/36,000 bumper to Bumper, 5 yr/100,000 powertrain	36, mo/36,000 Bumper to Bumper, 5yr/	36 Months or 36,000 Miles								
						Ancira Motor Company	Local Dealer	Grande Truck Center								
						10807 IH10 West, San Antonio, TX 78230	Local Dealer	4562 IH-10 East, San Antonio, TX 78219								
						120-150 Days 5/1/2019 '5/1/2019	120 Days 5-1-19 5-1-19	24-30 Weeks 6/1/2019 5/31/2019								
						No	No	No								
						Net 30	Net 30	Net 30								
						\$136,282.13	\$209,289.00	\$88,712.00	\$88,412.00	\$413,463.00	\$92,520.00	\$288,307.95				
	Total Award:		\$136,282.13	\$140,627.00	\$88,712.00											

Gunn Nissan LTD bid Item 1 Only which has been deleted and will be rebid at a late date.
Silsbee Ford withdrew, the delivery date passed and could not be ordered.