City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 8, 2019 Non-Local Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local
CDSI, Inc. DBA Business Transformation [International Building Mountaintop Pressure Washing the |Winco of South Texas Window Genie
Annual Contract For Window Washing Champion Diversified Company, Inc. Services Technology Comm LLC [Bluegrass
For: Services for the Alamodome Services
6100011154 MAB 25711 Creekside Cove 2022 Fifteenth Avenue |9705 Burnet Road, #203 (10787 West EIm Lane |244 Forest Hill Drive 130 W. Turbo 501 Pondview Dr.
Estimated |Boerne, Columbus, Austin, Avondale, Lexington, San Antonio, Killeen,
Item Description Annual TX 78006 GA 31909 TX 78758 AZ 85323 KY 40509 TX 78216 TX 76542
Cycles 210-260-1884
INTERIOR NAS NAS NAS
1 South Side 2
Price Per Cycle $2,500.00 $3,600.00 $1,700.00 $6,200.00 No Bid $2,530.00 $3,398.00
Total Price $5,000.00 $7,200.00 $3,400.00 $12,400.00 $5,060.00 $6,796.00
2 North Side 2
Price Per Cycle $2,500.00 $3,600.00 $1,700.00 $6,200.00 No Bid $2,530.00 $3,398.00
Total Price $5,000.00 $7,200.00 $3,400.00 $12,400.00 $5,060.00 $6,796.00
3 East Side 2
Price Per Cycle $2,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,700.00 $6,200.00 No Bid $1,181.00 $1,818.00
Total Price $5,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,400.00 $12,400.00 $2,362.00 $3,636.00
4 West Side 2
Price Per Cycle $2,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,700.00 $6,200.00 No Bid $1,181.00 $1,818.00
Total Price $5,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,400.00 $12,400.00 $2,362.00 $3,636.00
EXTERIOR
5 South Side 2
Price Per Cycle $3,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,800.00 $6,200.00 No Bid $3,850.00 $4,622.00
Total Price $6,400.00 $4,800.00 $3,600.00 $12,400.00 $7,700.00 $9,244.00
6 North Side 2
Price Per Cycle $3,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,800.00 $6,200.00 No Bid $3,850.00 $4,622.00
Total Price $6,400.00 $4,800.00 $3,600.00 $12,400.00 $7,700.00 $9,244.00
7 East Side 2
Price Per Cycle $3,200.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $6,200.00 No Bid $1,500.00 $1,818.00
Total Price $6,400.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $12,400.00 $3,000.00 $3,636.00
8 West Side 2
Price Per Cycle $3,200.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $6,200.00 No Bid $1,500.00 $1,818.00
Total Price $6,400.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $12,400.00 $3,000.00 $3,636.00
*$7,400.00
Subtotal $45,600.00 $37,200.00 $28,000.00 $99,200.00 $36,244.00 $46,624.00
Payment Terms 2% 10 Days Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2.5% 15 Days
Prompt Paymet Discount $912.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,165.60
Estimated Annual Total $44,688.00 $37,200.00 $28,000.00 $99,200.00 No Bid $36,244.00 $45,458.40

Estimated Annual Award

$44,688.00




