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ORDINANCE 2 Q 1 Q - Q 5 - ) Q - Q 4 2 8 
APPROVING ·CONTRACTS WITH ANCIRA MOTOR 
COMPANY, JIM BASS FORD, INC., AND GUNN 
CHEVROLET, LTD TO PROVIDE CITY DEPARTMENTS 
WITH TWELVE REPLACEMENT CARGO AND 
PASSENGER VANS FOR A TOTAL COST OF $365,621.13. 
FUNDING IS AVAILABLE FROM THE FY 2019 
EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND 
BUDGET. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with cargo and passenger 
vans;and 

WHEREAS, the vehicles will be used by various City departments for hauling supplies, project 
support, transporting individuals for community center programs and for transporting park and 
road maintenance crews throughout the City; and 

WHEREAS, Gunn Chevrolet, LTD submitted the lowest bids for items 2, 3, and 6, for a total 
cost of $136,282.13; and 

WHEREAS, Jim Bass Ford, Inc., submitted the lowest bids for items 4, 5, and 7, for a total cost 
of $140,627.00; and 

WHEREAS, the bid submitted by Ancira Motor Company (Item 8), a City Business as defined 
by the City's Local Preference Program, is within 3 percent of the lowest bid, which was from 
Cowboy Motors, a bidder which is not a City Business; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The low responsive bids from Ancira Motor Company (Item 8), Jim Bass Ford, 
Inc. (Items 4, 5, and 7), and Gunn Chevrolet, LTD (Items 2, 3, and 6) to provide the City of San 
Antonio with twelve replacement cargo and passenger vans for a total cost of $365,621.13 is 
hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance 
deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation is attached hereto and 
incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection 
in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department. 

SECTION 2. It is found and declared that, pursuant to the City's Local Preference Program, 
passed by ordinance number 2013-03-21-0167 and as amended by ordinance number 2014-11-
13-0923, Ancira Motor Company (Item 8), a City Business, is entitled to award. 
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SECTION 3. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $365,621.13 is available in Fund 
72001000, Cost Center 3503200001 and General Ledger 5709080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2019 
budget. 

SECTION 4. Payments, not to exceed the budgeted amount of $365,621.13, are authorized to 
Ancira Motor Company, Jim Bass Ford, Inc., and Gunn Chevrolet, LTD and should be 
encumbered with purchase orders. 

SECTION 5. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director 
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the 
City Manager or designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, SAP Project 
Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP Cost Centers, 
SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL Accounts as 
necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance. 

SECTION 6. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight or more 
affirmative votes; otherwise, it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 30th day of May, 2019. 

Ron Nirenberg 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
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Agenda Item: 6 ( in consent vote: 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27A, 27B, 
27C) 

Date: 05/30/2019 

Time: 09:35:28AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: Ordinance approving contracts with Ancira Motor Company, Jim Bass Ford, Inc., and Gunn Chevrolet, 
LTD to provide City departments with twelve replacement cargo and passenger vans for a total cost of 
$365,621.13. Funding is available from the FY 2019 Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund 
(ERRF) Budget. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, 
Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not 

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Ron Nirenberg Mayor X 

Roberto C. Trevino District 1 X 

ArtA. Hall District 2 X X 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 X X 

Rey Saldana District 4 X 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 X 

Greg Brockhouse District 6 X 

Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X 

Manny Pelaez District 8 X 

John Courage District 9 X 

Clayton H. Perry District 10 X 
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Exhibit I 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation Exhibit I 

Opened: March 1, 2019 

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local 
For: Purchase of Cargo and Passenger Van's Gunn Chevrolel , LTD Jim Bass Ford, Inc Ancira Molor Company Cowboy Motors Grande Truck Center Grapevine DCJ , LLC Silsbee Ford 

6100011158 LD 16550 IH35 N. 4032 W . Houston 10807 IH1 OM Wesl 1305 Hwy 96 Bypass 4562 IH-10 East 2601 William Tate 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N 
Harle Expwy 

Selma, San Angelo, San Antonio, Silsbee, San Antonio, Grapevine, Silsbee, 

Item Description QTY TX 78154 TX 76901 TX 78230 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 77656 
210-599-5000 325-949-4621 210-558-1500 

1 DELETED: 

2 8501 - 10,000 GVWR Van 15 passenger 1 
LOW ROOF, SWING DOOR: 

Price Each: $30,436.00 $33,164.00 No Bid No Bid $35,133.00 No Bid $32 ,662.65 
Total: $30,436.00 $33,164.00 $35,133.00 $32 ,662.65 
Year, Make & Model Offered : 2019 Chevrolet 3500 2019 Ford Transit 2019 Ford Transit 15 2019 Ford Transit T-

Ext Express 15 Pass Wagon 350 
Passenger Van 

CG33706 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered GM LV1 Gas VS Ford 3. 7 L V6, Ford 3.7 VS Gas, 3.7 L V6 
(Include SAE Net HP): 4.3 L 276 HP 275 HP 275 H.P . 

Transmission Offered: 5MV HD Automatic Ford 6 speed Ford 6 Speed 6- Spd Auto 
automatic Automatic W/OD 

Warranty: 3yr or 36,000K BTE 3 yrs. or 36,000 miles 36 Months or 36,000 36m'36,000 Bumper to 
5yr or 100,000~ bumper to bumper. Miles Bumper, 5yr/60,000 

powertrain 5 yrs. or 60,000 miles Powe rt rain 
powertrain 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Any Ford Dealer Grande Truck Center Local Dealer 
Nationwide 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 16550 IH35N, Selma, Any Ford dealer within 4562 IH-10 East, Local Dealer 
TX 78154 City limits San Antonio, 

TX 78219 

Delivery: 180 Days 100-120 Days 130-150 Days 120 Days 
Production Cut•off Date: 8/ 16/2019 5/31 /2019 5/31 /2019 5-1-19 

Last day order can be placed without missing 5/2/2019 5/30/2019 5/20/2019 5-1-19 
cut-off date: 

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Not Provided Yes No No 
date: 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 1, 2019 
Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Cargo and Passenger Van's Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Jim Bass Ford, lnc Ancira Motor Company Cowboy Motors Grande Truck Center Grapevine DCJ , LLC Silsbee Ford 

6100011158 LO 16550 IH35 N. 4032 W. Houston 10807 IH10M Wesl 1305 Hwy 96 Bypass 4562 IH-10 East 2601 William Tate 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N 
Harte Expwy 

Selma, San Angelo, San Antonio, Silsbee, San Antonio, Grapevine, Silsbee, 

Item Description QTY TX 78154 TX 76901 TX 78230 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 77656 
210-599-5000 325-949-4621 210-558-1500 

3 8501-10,000 GVWR Van Window- 12 2 
passenger LOW ROOF Bl-FUEL PROPANE, 
SWING DOORS: 

Price Each: $39,718.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $44,561 .00 No Bid $40,380.65 
Total : $79,436.00 $89,122.00 $80,761 .30 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2019 Chevrolet 3500 2019 Ford Transit 14 2019 Ford Transit 

Ext 12 Passenger Pass Wagon T-350 
Express Van CG33706 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered GM L96 Gas/Ethanol Ford 3. 7 V6 Gas, 3.7 L V6 
(Include SAE Net HP) : VB, 6.0L 341 HP 275 H.P. 

Transmission Offered: MYD 6 HD Automatic Ford 6 Speed 6- Spd Au to 
Automatic W/OD 

Fuel System Offered: Gas/Ethanol , Propane Nat G ICOM JTG II Bi Gas/Propane 
NAT-G (See Quote) Fuel Propane 

Warranty: 3yr or 36,000K BTE 36 Months or 36,000 Not Provided 
5yr or 100,000K PT Miles 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grande Truck Center Local Dealer 

Warranty Service Facility Address: 16550 IH35N, Selma, 4562 IH-10 East, Local Dealer 
TX 78154 San Antonio, 

TX 78219 

Delivery: 180 Days 130-150 Days 120 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: 8/16/2019 5/31 /2019 5-1-19 
Last day order can be placed without missing 5/2/2019 5/20/2019 5-1 -19 
cut-off date : 

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Not Provided No No 
date: 

.. 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened : March 1, 2019 
Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Cargo and Passenger Van's Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Jim Bass Ford, Inc Ancira Motor Company Cowboy Motors Grande Truck Center Grapevine DCJ , LLC Silsbee Ford 

6100011158 LO 16550 IH35 N. 4032 W. Houston 10807 IH1 OM West 1305 Hwy 96 Bypass 4562 IH-10 East 2601 William Tate 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N 
Harte Expwy 

Selma, San Angelo, San Antonio, Silsbee, San Antonio, Grapevine, Silsbee, 

Item Description QTY TX 78154 TX 76901 TX 78230 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 77656 
210-599-5000 325-949-4621 210-558-1500 

4 8501-10,000 GVWR Van 15 passenger MED 1 
ROOF, SLIDE DOOR: 

Price Each : No Bid $34,388.00 No Bid No Bid $37,616.00 No Bid $35,039 .17 
Total : $34,388.00 $37,616.00 $35,039.17 
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 9.4% 
and local bid : 

Price Differential : $3,228.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered : 2019 Ford Transi 2019 Ford Transit 15 2019 Ford T-350 

Pass Wagon Transit 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 3. 7 V6, 275 HP Ford 3. 7 V6 Gas, 3.7 L V6 
(Include SAE Net HP): 275 H.P. 

Transmission Offered: Ford 6 speed Ford 6 Speed 6 - Spd Auto 
automatic Automatic W/O0 

Warranty: 3 yrs. or 36,000 miles 36 Months or 36,000 36m/36,000 Bumper to 
bumper to bumper. Miles Bumper, 5yr/60,000 

5 yrs. or 60,000 miles Powertrain 
powertrain 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Any Ford Dealer Grande Truck Center Local Dealer 
Nationwide 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Any Ford dealer within 4562 IH-10 East, Local Dealer 
City limits San Antonio, 

TX 78219 

Del ivery: 100-120 Days 130-150 Days 120 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: 5/31 /2019 5/31/2019 5-1-19 

Last day order can be placed without missing 5/30/2019 5/20/2019 5-1 -19 
cut-off date: 

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Yes No No 
date: 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 1, 2019 
Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Cargo and Passenger Van 's Gunn Chevrolel , LTD Jim Bass Ford, Inc Ancira Motor Company Cowboy Motors Grande Truck Genier Grapevine DCJ , LLC Silsbee Ford 

6100011158 LD 16550 IH35 N. 4032 W. Houslon 10807 IH10M Wesl 1305 Hwy 96 Bypass 4562 IH-10 Easl 2601 William Tale 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N 
Harle Expwy 

Selma, San Angelo, San Antonio, Silsbee, San Antonio, Grapevine, Silsbee, 

llem Description QTY TX 78154 TX 76901 TX 78230 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 77656 
210-599-5000 325-949-4621 210-558-1500 

5 8501-10,000 GVWR Van 15 passenger 2 
HIGH ROOF, EXTENDED: 
Price Each: No Bid $34,685.00 No Bid No Bid $37,878.00 No Bid $35,155.17 
Tolal: $69,370.00 $75,756.00 $70,310.34 
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 9.2% 
and local bid : 
Price Differential : $6,386.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 20 19 Ford Transl 2019 Ford Transil 15 2019 Ford Transil T 

Pass Wagon (Nol 350 
EXlended) due lo max 
sealing wilh eXlended 

is 14 passengers 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 2019 Ford 3.7 V6, 275 Ford 3. 7 V6 Gas, 3.7 L V6 
(Include SAE Nel HP) : HP 275 H.P. 

Transmission Offered: Ford 6 speed Ford 6 Speed 6- Spd Auto 
automatic Automalic W/OD 

Warranty: 3 yrs. or 36,000 miles 36 Monlhs or 36,000 36m/36,000 Bumper lo 
bumper to bumper. Miles Bumper, 5yr/60,000 

5 yrs. or 60,000 miles Powertrain 
powertrain ..... 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Any Ford Dealer Grande Truck Center Local Dealer 
Nationwide 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Any Ford dealer wilhin 4562 IH-10 East, Local Dealer 
Cily limils San Antonio , 

TX 78219 

Delivery: 100-120 Days 130-150 Days 120 Days 
Produclion Cul-off Dale: 5/31 /2019 5/31 /2019 5-1 -19 

Lasl day order can be placed wilhoul missing 5/30/2019 5/20/2019 5-1-19 
cul-off dale : 

Can bidder provide bid ilems afler cul-off Yes No No 
dale: 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 1, 2019 
Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Cargo and Passenger Van 's Gunn Chevrolel, LTD Jim Bass Ford, Inc Ancira Motor Company Cowboy Motors Grande Truck Center Grapevine DCJ , LLC Silsbee Ford 

6100011158 LD 16550 IH35 N. 4032 W. Houston 10807 IH10M West 1305 Hwy 96 Bypass 4562 I H-10 East 2601 William Tate 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N 
Harte Expwy 

Selma, San Angelo, San Antonio, Silsbee, San Antonio, Grapevine, Silsbee, 

Item Description QTY TX 78154 TX 76901 TX 78230 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 77656 
210-599-5000 325-949-4621 210-558- 1500 

6 8501-10,000 GVWR CARGO VAN, LOW 1 
ROOF, SWING DOOR: 

Each Price: $26,410.13 $35,498.00 No Bid No Bid $29,542.00 No Bid $36,754.77 
Total : $26,410.13 $35,498.00 $29,542.00 $36,754.77 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2019 Chevrolet 2500 2019 Ford Transit 2019 Ford Transit Van 2019 Ford T-250 

Ext Cargo Van Transit 
CG23705 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered GM LV1 Gas V6, 4.3L Ford 3.7 V6, 275 HP Ford 3. 7 V6 Gas, 3.7 L V6 
(Include SAE Net HP): 276 HP 275 H.P. 

Transmission Offered: 5MV HD Automatic Ford 6 speed Ford 6 Speed 6 - Spd Auto 
automatic Automatic W/OD 

Warranty: 3yr or 36,000K BTE 3 yrs. or 36,000 miles 36 Months or 36,000 36m/36,000 Bumper to 
5yr or 100,000K PT bumper to bumper. Miles Bumper, 5yr/60,000 

5 yrs. or 60,000 miles Powertrain 
powertrain 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Any Ford Dealer Grande Truck Center Local Dealer 
Nationwide 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 16550 IH35N, Selma, Any Ford dealer within 4562 IH-1 O East, Local Dealer 
TX 78154 City limits San Antonio, 

TX 78219 

Delivery: 180 Days 100-120 Days 130-150 Days 120 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: 8/16/2019 5/31 /2019 5/31 /2019 5-1-19 

Last day order can be placed without missing 5/2/2019 5/30/2019 5/20/2019 5-1-19 
cut-off date: 

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Not Provided Yes No No 
date : 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 1, 2019 
Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Cargo and Passenger Van's Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Jim Bass Ford, Inc Ancira Motor Company Cowboy Motors Grande Truck Center Grapevine DCJ , LLC Silsbee Ford 

6100011158 LD 16550 IH35 N. 4032 W. Houston 10807 IH10M West 1305 Hwy 96 Bypass 4562 IH-10 East 2601 William Tate 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N 
Harte Expwy 

Selma, San Angelo, San Antonio, Silsbee, San Antonio, Grapevine, Silsbee, 

Item Description QTY TX 78154 TX 76901 TX 78230 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 77656 
210-599-5000 325-949-4621 210-558-1500 

7 Minimum 9,350 lbs. GVWR CARGO VAN, 1 
HIGH ROOF, SLIDE DOOR: Withdrew 
Price Each : No Bid $36,869.00 No Bid No Bid $39,134.00 No Bid $32,779.72 
Total : $36,869.00 $39,134.00 $32,779.72 
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 6.1 % 
and local bid: 
Price Differential : 
Year, Make & Model Olfered: 2019 Ford Transi 2019 Ford Transit Van, 2019 Ford T-350 

Note: Max GVWR Transit 
9000 lbs. 

Specilic Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 3.7L V6, 275 HP Ford 3. 7 V6 Gas, 3.7 L V6 
(Include SAE Net HP): 275 H.P. 
Transmission Offered: Ford 6 speed Ford 6 Speed 6- Spd Auto 

automatic Automatic with Over 
Drive 

Warranty: 3 yrs. or 36,000 miles 36 Months or 36,000 36m/36,000 Bumper to 
bumper to bumper. Miles Bumper, Syr/60,000 

5 yrs. or 60,000 miles Powertrain 
powertrain 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Any Ford Deale, Grande Truck Center Local Dealer 
Nationwide 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Any Ford dealer within 4562 IH-1 O East, Local Dealer 
City limits San Antonio, 

TX 78219 
Delivery: 100-120 Days 130-150 Days 120-160 Days 
Production Cut-elf Date: 5/31 /2019 5/31/2019 5-1-19 
Last day order can be placed without missing 5/30/2019 5/20/2019 5-1-19 
cut-elf date : 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-elf Yes No No 
date: 
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Opened : March 1, 2019 
Local 

For: Purchase of Cargo and Passenger Van's Gunn Chevrolet, LTD 

6100011158 LD 16550 IH35 N. 

Selma, 
Item Description QTY TX 78154 

210-599-5000 

8 Mini Vans for Surveillance: 4 
Price Each: No Bid 
Total : 
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 
and local bid : 
Price Differential : 
Prompt Payment Discount: 
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: 

Year, Make & Model Offered: 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE Net HP) : 
Transmission Offered: 

Warranty : 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 

Delivery: 
Production Cut-off Date : 
Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date: 

Payment Terms : Net30 

Total : $136,282.13 
Total Award : $136,282.13 

Gunn Nissan LTD bid Item 1 Only which has been deleted and will be rebid at a late date. 
Silsbee Ford withdrew, the delivery date passed and could not be ordered. 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Non-Local Local 
Jim Bass Ford, Inc Ancira Motor Company 

4032 W. Houston 10807 IH10M West 
Harte Expwy 
San Angelo, San Antonio , 
TX 76901 TX 78230 
325-949-4621 210-558-1500 

No Bid $22,178.00 
$88,712 .00 

0.34% 

2019 Dodge Grand 
Caravan 

Pentastar 3.6 L, V6, 
283HP 

6 Spd Automatic 

3 yr/36,000 bumper to 
Bumper, 5 yr/100,000 

powertrain 

Ancira Motor Company 

10807 IHl0 West, San 
Antonio, TX 78230 

120-150 Days 
5/1/2019 
'5/1/2019 

No 

Net 30 Net 30 

$209,289.00 $88,712.00 
$140,627.00 $88,712.00 

Prepared by Purchasing 5/1/2019 

Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local 
Cowboy Motors Grande Truck Center Grapevine DCJ , LLC Silsbee Ford 

1305 Hwy 96 Bypass 4562 I H-10 East 2601 William Tate 1211 U.S. Hwy 96N 

Silsbee, San Antonio, Grapevine, Silsbee, 
TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 77656 

$22,103.00 $26,790.00 $23,130.00 No Bid 
$88,412.00 $107,160.00 $92,520.00 

' 2% 
$90,669.60 

2019 Dodge Caravan 2020 Ford Transit 2019 Dodge Grand 
Connect Wagon. Note: Caravan SE 
4 Cylinder 162 H.P., 15 

Gallon Fuel Tank 

3.6 L, V6. Ford 14 2.0 L Gas, Dodge 3.6 L V6, 
162 H.P. 283 HP 

6-Spd . Auto Ford 8 Speed 6 Spd Automatic 
Automatic Select Shift 

36, mo/36,000 Bumper 36 Months or 36,000 3yr/36,000 miles, 
to Bumper, 5yr/ Miles 5yr/100,000 mile 

limited powertrain 

Local Dealer Grande Truck Center Any Dodge Dealer 

Local Dealer 4562 IH-1 0 East, Any Dodge Dealer 
San Antonio, 

TX 78219 
120 Days 24-30 Weeks 70-100 Days 

5-1-19 6/1/2019 July 2019 
5-1-19 5/31 /2019 May 15, 2019 est. 

No No Not Provided 

Net 30 Net 30 2%, 10 Days Net30 

$88,412.00 $413,463.00 $92,520.00 $288,307.95 
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