
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 2, 2019

Local Local Non-Local Non-local Non-local

For: Annual Contract for Pest Control Services - BESD Pied Piper Pest Control LLC ABC Home & Commercial Services Hill Country Pest Control Orkin, LLC Pestmaster Services of San Antonio

                  LB 12103 Jones Maltsberger 10644 N. Interstate 35 877 Harper Road 2800 NE Loop 410, #107 2441 Nacogdoches Rd., Suite 715

Item Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio, 

TX 78247

(210) 826-2030

San Antonio, TX 

78233

Kerrville, TX 

78028

San Antonio, TX 

78218

San Antonio, TX 

78217

   NAS NAS NAS 

A1.1 Animal Care Services (ACS) 12

 Price per Month  $45.00 No Bid $30.00 $110.00 $25.00

 Total Price  $540.00 $360.00 $1,320.00 $300.00

A1.2 City Hall 12      

 Price per Month  $45.00 No Bid $55.00 $150.00 $25.00

 Total Price  $540.00 $660.00 $1,800.00 $300.00

A1.3 City Modular Bldgs- 10, 11, and restroom facility, 506 

Dolorosa

12      

 Price per Month  $25.00 No Bid $20.00 $50.00 $25.00

 Total Price  $300.00 $240.00 $600.00 $300.00

   

A1.4 Development Services - One Stop 12      

 Price per Month  $60.00 No Bid $65.00 $104.00 $35.00

 Total Price  $720.00 $780.00 $1,248.00 $420.00

   

A1.5 Emergency Operations Center (EOC) 12

 Price per Month  $40.00 No Bid $45.00 $89.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $480.00 $540.00 $1,068.00 $240.00

A1.6 Fleet Administrative/Fleet Garage Shop 12

 Price per Month  $40.00 No Bid $40.00 $69.00 $25.00

 Total Price  $480.00 $480.00 $828.00 $300.00

A1.7 International Center 12

 Price per Month  $65.00 No Bid $60.00 $150.00 $55.00

 Total Price  $780.00 $720.00 $1,800.00 $660.00

A1.8 Municipal Courts (Frank Wing) Building 12

 Price per Month  $90.00 No Bid $95.00 $155.00 $95.00

 Total Price  $1,080.00 $1,140.00 $1,860.00 $1,140.00

6100010318

GROUP A  MONTHLY PEST CONTROL MAINTENANCE
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 2, 2019

Local Local Non-Local Non-local Non-local

For: Annual Contract for Pest Control Services - BESD Pied Piper Pest Control LLC ABC Home & Commercial Services Hill Country Pest Control Orkin, LLC Pestmaster Services of San Antonio

                  LB 12103 Jones Maltsberger 10644 N. Interstate 35 877 Harper Road 2800 NE Loop 410, #107 2441 Nacogdoches Rd., Suite 715

Item Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio, 

TX 78247

(210) 826-2030

San Antonio, TX 

78233

Kerrville, TX 

78028

San Antonio, TX 

78218

San Antonio, TX 

78217

6100010318

A1.9 Municipal Plaza 12

 Price per Month  $75.00 No Bid $75.00 $155.00 $65.00

 Total Price  $900.00 $900.00 $1,860.00 $780.00

   

A1.10 Plaza de Armas 12

Price per Month $35.00 No Bid $55.00 $89.00 $25.00

 Total Price  $420.00 $660.00 $1,068.00 $300.00

A1.11 Public Safety Answering Point (PSAP) 12

Price per Month $40.00 No Bid $45.00 $89.00 $25.00

 Total Price  $480.00 $540.00 $1,068.00 $300.00

   

A1.12 Public Safety Headquarters (PSHQ) 12

Price per Month $120.00 No Bid $125.00 $165.00 $145.00

 Total Price  $1,440.00 $1,500.00 $1,980.00 $1,740.00

A1.13 Public Safety Technology Center (PSTC) 12

Price per Month $45.00 No Bid $55.00 $89.00 $40.00

 Total Price  $540.00 $660.00 $1,068.00 $480.00

A1.14 Record Storage Facility/Vital Statistics 12

Price per Month $40.00 No Bid $45.00 $69.00 $30.00

 Total Price  $480.00 $540.00 $828.00 $360.00

   

A1.15 SAFD FIRE Training Academy 12

Price per Month $95.00 No Bid $45.00 $69.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $1,140.00 $540.00 $828.00 $240.00

A1.16 SAPD Heliport 12

Price per Month $15.00 No Bid $10.00 $35.00 $10.00

 Total Price  $180.00 $120.00 $420.00 $120.00

   

A1.17 SAPD Police Training Academy/Range/Armory 12

Price per Month $65.00 No Bid $55.00 $160.00 $40.00

 Total Price  $780.00 $660.00 $1,920.00 $480.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 2, 2019

Local Local Non-Local Non-local Non-local

For: Annual Contract for Pest Control Services - BESD Pied Piper Pest Control LLC ABC Home & Commercial Services Hill Country Pest Control Orkin, LLC Pestmaster Services of San Antonio

                  LB 12103 Jones Maltsberger 10644 N. Interstate 35 877 Harper Road 2800 NE Loop 410, #107 2441 Nacogdoches Rd., Suite 715

Item Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio, 

TX 78247

(210) 826-2030

San Antonio, TX 

78233

Kerrville, TX 

78028

San Antonio, TX 

78218

San Antonio, TX 

78217

6100010318

A1.18 SAPD Property & Storage 12

Price per Month $60.00 No Bid $85.00 $104.00 $25.00

 Total Price  $720.00 $1,020.00 $1,248.00 $300.00

   

A1.19 Service Center New Northwest 12

Price per Month $40.00 No Bid $35.00 $79.00 $10.00

 Total Price  $480.00 $420.00 $948.00 $120.00

A1.20 Service Center New Southeast 12

Price per Month $40.00 No Bid $35.00 $70.00 $10.00

 Total Price  $480.00 $420.00 $840.00 $120.00

   

A1.21 Service Center Northeast, Tool Yard 12

Price per Month $25.00 No Bid $25.00 $60.00 $12.00

 Total Price  $300.00 $300.00 $720.00 $144.00

A1.22 Service Center Northwest, Trailers 12

Price per Month $25.00 No Bid $10.00 $20.00 $10.00

 Total Price  $300.00 $120.00 $240.00 $120.00

   

A1.23 Service Center Southeast 12

Price per Month $25.00 No Bid $35.00 $42.00 $10.00

 Total Price  $300.00 $420.00 $504.00 $120.00

A1.24 Service Center Southwest 12

 Price per Month  $30.00 No Bid $35.00 $89.00 $10.00

 Total Price  $360.00 $420.00 $1,068.00 $120.00

   

A1.25 Substation - East Patrol 12  

Price per Month $30.00 No Bid $25.00 $41.00 $10.00

 Total Price  $360.00 $300.00 $492.00 $120.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 2, 2019

Local Local Non-Local Non-local Non-local

For: Annual Contract for Pest Control Services - BESD Pied Piper Pest Control LLC ABC Home & Commercial Services Hill Country Pest Control Orkin, LLC Pestmaster Services of San Antonio

                  LB 12103 Jones Maltsberger 10644 N. Interstate 35 877 Harper Road 2800 NE Loop 410, #107 2441 Nacogdoches Rd., Suite 715

Item Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio, 

TX 78247

(210) 826-2030

San Antonio, TX 

78233

Kerrville, TX 

78028

San Antonio, TX 

78218

San Antonio, TX 

78217

6100010318

A1.26 Substation - South Patrol 12

Price per Month $30.00 No Bid $25.00 $41.00 $10.00

 Total Price  $360.00 $300.00 $492.00 $120.00

   

A1.27 Substation - West Patrol 12

Price per Month $30.00 No Bid $25.00 $41.00 $10.00

 Total Price  $360.00 $300.00 $492.00 $120.00

A1.28 Substation Northeast Patrol 12

Price per Month $30.00 No Bid $25.00 $41.00 $10.00

 Total Price  $360.00 $300.00 $492.00 $120.00

A1.29 Substation Northwest (Prue) Patrol 12

Price per Month $30.00 No Bid $25.00 $41.00 $10.00

 Total Price  $360.00 $300.00 $492.00 $120.00

   

A1.30 Traffic Facility 12

Price per Month $35.00 No Bid $35.00 $46.00 $10.00

 Total Price  $420.00 $420.00 $552.00 $120.00

A1.31 Visitor Center 12

Price per Month $25.00 No Bid $25.00 $20.00 $10.00

 Total Price  $300.00 $300.00 $240.00 $120.00

A1.32 Deleted  

 Total Group A  $16,740.00 No Bid $16,380.00 $30,384.00 $10,344.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 2, 2019

Local Local Non-Local Non-local Non-local

For: Annual Contract for Pest Control Services - BESD Pied Piper Pest Control LLC ABC Home & Commercial Services Hill Country Pest Control Orkin, LLC Pestmaster Services of San Antonio

                  LB 12103 Jones Maltsberger 10644 N. Interstate 35 877 Harper Road 2800 NE Loop 410, #107 2441 Nacogdoches Rd., Suite 715

Item Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio, 

TX 78247

(210) 826-2030

San Antonio, TX 

78233

Kerrville, TX 

78028

San Antonio, TX 

78218

San Antonio, TX 

78217

6100010318

GROUP B  SITE-SPECIFIC TREATMENT

B1 Mosquito Treatment & Control - 8 Treatments per 

year

 

B1.1 City Hall - Interior & Exterior 1

 Price per Location  $375.00 $440.00 $760.00 $4,480.00 $120.00

 Total Price  $3,000.00 $440.00 $760.00 $4,480.00 $120.00

B1.2 Plaza de Armas - Interior & Exterior 1

 Price per Location  $375.00 $440.00 $520.00 $3,800.00 $120.00

 Total Price  $3,000.00 $440.00 $520.00 $3,800.00 $120.00

Treatment Method Spray fogger, mosquito dunks and 

aerosols

Interior - ULD / Exterior- Backpack 

Fogger

ULV/fogging Fogging (adulticide) & larvacide granules No Entry

Subtotal for Items B1.1 and B1.2 $6,000.00 $880.00 $1,280.00 $8,280.00 $240.00

B1.3 Additional Location added during term of contract  

 Per Square Foot 1 0.0200 0.0200 0.0020 0.0100 0.0050

 Total Price  $0.020 $0.02 $0.0020 $0.010 $0.01

Treatment Method Spray fogger, mosquito dunks and 

aerosols

Interior - ULD / Exterior- Backpack 

Fogger

ULV/fogging Fogging (adulticide) & larvacide granules Spray of affected areas using 

environmentally friendly products

Total for Items B1 $6,000.02 $880.02 $1,280.00 $8,280.01 $240.01

 

 B2 Flea & Tick Treatment & Control - 4 Treatments per 

year 

 

B2.1 Animal Care Services (ACS) 1

 Price per Location  $175.00/$700.00 min $500.00 $700.00 $7,340.00 $120.00

 Total Price  $700.00 $500.00 $700.00 $7,340.00 $120.00

B2.2 Emergency Operations Center (EOC) 1  

 Price per Location  $145.00/$580.00 min $500.00 $700.00 $5,600.00 $120.00

 Total Price  $580.00 $500.00 $700.00 $5,600.00 $120.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 2, 2019

Local Local Non-Local Non-local Non-local

For: Annual Contract for Pest Control Services - BESD Pied Piper Pest Control LLC ABC Home & Commercial Services Hill Country Pest Control Orkin, LLC Pestmaster Services of San Antonio

                  LB 12103 Jones Maltsberger 10644 N. Interstate 35 877 Harper Road 2800 NE Loop 410, #107 2441 Nacogdoches Rd., Suite 715

Item Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio, 

TX 78247

(210) 826-2030

San Antonio, TX 

78233

Kerrville, TX 

78028

San Antonio, TX 

78218

San Antonio, TX 

78217

6100010318

B2.3 Public Safety Answering Point (PSAP) 1  

 Price per Location  $145.00/$580.00 min $500.00 $700.00 $4,900.00 $120.00

 Total Price  $580.00 $500.00 $700.00 $4,900.00 $120.00

Treatment Method Compressed Air and Aerosols Granular and/or Power Spray Surface spray/ Crack and Crevice and 

spot

General Surface Spray Treatment Spray of affected areas using 

environmentally friendly products

B2.4 Deleted  

Subtotal for Items B2 $1,860.00 $1,500.00 $2,100.00 $17,840.00 $360.00

 

B3 Exterior Ants Treatment & Control - 3 Treatments 

per year

 

B3.1 Animal Care Services (ACS) 1

 Price per Location  $390.00 $1,140.00 $600.00 $4,800.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $1,170.00 $1,140.00 $600.00 $4,800.00 $60.00

B3.2 Emergency Operations Center (EOC) 1

 Price per Location  $390.00 $798.00 $350.00 $3,384.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $1,170.00 $798.00 $350.00 $3,384.00 $60.00

B3.3 Public Safety Answering Point (PSAP), Emergency 

Dispatch

1

 Price per Location  $390.00 $741.00 $350.00 $3,000.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $1,170.00 $741.00 $350.00 $3,000.00 $60.00

B3.4 SAFD - Fire Training Academy 1

 Price per Location  $390.00 $1,625.00 $900.00 $6,700.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $1,170.00 $1,625.00 $900.00 $6,700.00 $60.00

B3.5 SAPD - Police Training Academy 1

 Price per Location  $425.00 $8,493.00 $4,500.00 $32,787.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $1,275.00 $8,493.00 $4,500.00 $32,787.00 $60.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 2, 2019

Local Local Non-Local Non-local Non-local

For: Annual Contract for Pest Control Services - BESD Pied Piper Pest Control LLC ABC Home & Commercial Services Hill Country Pest Control Orkin, LLC Pestmaster Services of San Antonio

                  LB 12103 Jones Maltsberger 10644 N. Interstate 35 877 Harper Road 2800 NE Loop 410, #107 2441 Nacogdoches Rd., Suite 715

Item Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio, 

TX 78247

(210) 826-2030

San Antonio, TX 

78233

Kerrville, TX 

78028

San Antonio, TX 

78218

San Antonio, TX 

78217

6100010318

B3.6 Service Center, Northeast, Toolyard 1

 Price per Location  $425.00 $2,209.00 $1,200.00 $9,058.00 $50.00

 Total Price  $1,275.00 $2,209.00 $1,200.00 $9,058.00 $50.00

B3.7 Substation, East Patrol 1

 Price per Location  $250.00 $356.00 $180.00 $1,520.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $750.00 $356.00 $180.00 $1,520.00 $60.00

B3.8 Substation, SouthPatrol 1

 Price per Location  $250.00 $164.00 $75.00 $698.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $750.00 $164.00 $75.00 $698.00 $60.00

B3.9 Substation, West Patrol 1

 Price per Location  $250.00 $342.00 $180.00 $2,080.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $750.00 $342.00 $180.00 $2,080.00 $60.00

B3.10 Substation, Northeast Area - North Patrol Police 1

 Price per Location  $250.00 $428.00 $225.00 $1,871.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $750.00 $428.00 $225.00 $1,871.00 $60.00

B3.11 Substation, Northwest Area - Prue Patrol 1

 Price per Location  $250.00 $253.00 $125.00 $1,066.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $750.00 $253.00 $125.00 $1,066.00 $60.00

B3.12 Fleet Administration/Fleet Garage Shop 1

 Price per Location  $120.00 $54.00 $60.00 $230.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $360.00 $54.00 $60.00 $230.00 $60.00

B3.13 Public Safety Headquarters (PSHQ) 1

 Price per Location  $250.00 $266.00 $120.00 $1,120.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $750.00 $266.00 $120.00 $1,120.00 $60.00

B3.14 SAPD Property & Storage (Records) 1

 Price per Location  $250.00 $15,960.00 $375.00 $2,724.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $750.00 $15,960.00 $375.00 $2,724.00 $60.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 2, 2019

Local Local Non-Local Non-local Non-local

For: Annual Contract for Pest Control Services - BESD Pied Piper Pest Control LLC ABC Home & Commercial Services Hill Country Pest Control Orkin, LLC Pestmaster Services of San Antonio

                  LB 12103 Jones Maltsberger 10644 N. Interstate 35 877 Harper Road 2800 NE Loop 410, #107 2441 Nacogdoches Rd., Suite 715

Item Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio, 

TX 78247

(210) 826-2030

San Antonio, TX 

78233

Kerrville, TX 

78028

San Antonio, TX 

78218

San Antonio, TX 

78217

6100010318

B3.15 Service Center, Northwest 1

 Price per Location  $200.00 $2,508.00 $450.00 $10,335.00 $50.00

 Total Price  $600.00 $2,508.00 $450.00 $10,335.00 $50.00

B3.16 Service Center, Southeast 1

 Price per Location  $390.00 $770.00 $375.00 $3,275.00 $50.00

 Total Price  $1,170.00 $770.00 $375.00 $3,275.00 $50.00

B3.17 Service Center, Southwest 1

 Price per Location  $300.00 $889.00 $375.00 $3,656.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $900.00 $889.00 $375.00 $3,656.00 $60.00

Treatment Method Advion, Indoxycarb and/or Top Choice 

/Fipronil

Probait - Hydramethylnon Advion fire ant bait, Indoxacarb, 

methoxycarbonyl

Bayer Maxforce Complete, 

Hydramethylnon

Extinguish Plus, Hydromethylnon (365) S-

Methoprene

B3.18 Deleted  

B3.19 Additional Location by acre if area is greater than or 

equal to 1 acre

 

 Per Acre 1 $145.00 $95.00 $50.00 $400.00 $300.00

 Total Price  $145.00 $95.00 $50.00 $400.00 $300.00

Treatment Method Advion, Indoxycarb and/or Top Choice 

/Fipronil

Probait - Hydramethylnon Advion fire ant bait, Indoxacarb, 

methoxycarbonyl

Bayer Maxforce Complete, 

Hydramethylnon

Extinguish Plus, Hydromethylnon (365) S-

Methoprene

Subtotal for Items B3 $15,655.00 $37,091.00 $10,490.00 $88,704.00 $1,290.00

 

B4 Wasps, Bees & Other Stinging pests - Treatment & 

Control - 3 Treatments per year

 

B4.1 Animal Care Services 1

Price per Location $85.00 $285.00 $180.00 $2,400.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $255.00 $285.00 $180.00 $2,400.00 $60.00

B4.2 SAPD Police Training Academy 1

Price per Location $85.00 $285.00 $360.00 $3,600.00 $60.00

 Total Price  $255.00 $285.00 $360.00 $3,600.00 $0.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 2, 2019

Local Local Non-Local Non-local Non-local

For: Annual Contract for Pest Control Services - BESD Pied Piper Pest Control LLC ABC Home & Commercial Services Hill Country Pest Control Orkin, LLC Pestmaster Services of San Antonio

                  LB 12103 Jones Maltsberger 10644 N. Interstate 35 877 Harper Road 2800 NE Loop 410, #107 2441 Nacogdoches Rd., Suite 715

Item Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio, 

TX 78247

(210) 826-2030

San Antonio, TX 

78233

Kerrville, TX 

78028

San Antonio, TX 

78218

San Antonio, TX 

78217

6100010318

$0.00

B4.3 Deleted 

  

Treatment Method Dust, Liquids, Extension pole 

knockdown

Aerosol, Dust, Physically remove Liquid insecticide Targeted aerosol and/or liquid 

application inc. nest removal

Spray of affected areas using 

environmentally friendly products

Subtotal for Items B4 $510.00 $570.00 $540.00 $6,000.00 $60.00

B5 Mosquito Treatment Bi-Annually  

B5.1 Development Service - One-Stop 2

Price per Each $95.00 $93.00 $75.00 $960.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $190.00 $186.00 $150.00 $1,920.00 $40.00

B5.2 Emergency Operations Center (EOC) 2

Price per Each $95.00 $45.00 $130.00 $500.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $190.00 $90.00 $260.00 $1,000.00 $40.00

B5.3 Municipal Courts (Frank Wing) Building 2

Price per Each $95.00 $202.00 $75.00 $1,500.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $190.00 $404.00 $150.00 $3,000.00 $40.00

B5.4 Public Safety Answering Point (PSAP) 2

Price per Each $95.00 $49.00 $125.00 $500.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $190.00 $98.00 $250.00 $1,000.00 $40.00

B5.5 Public Safety Technology Center (PSTC) 2

Price per Each $95.00 $75.00 $75.00 $790.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $190.00 $150.00 $150.00 $1,580.00 $40.00

B5.6 Record Storage Facility/Vital Statistics 2

Price per Each $95.00 $62.00 $75.00 $700.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $190.00 $124.00 $150.00 $1,400.00 $40.00

B5.7 SAPD Police Training Academy & Firing Range 2

Price per Each $95.00 $90.00 $1,200.00 $920.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $190.00 $180.00 $2,400.00 $1,840.00 $40.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 2, 2019

Local Local Non-Local Non-local Non-local

For: Annual Contract for Pest Control Services - BESD Pied Piper Pest Control LLC ABC Home & Commercial Services Hill Country Pest Control Orkin, LLC Pestmaster Services of San Antonio

                  LB 12103 Jones Maltsberger 10644 N. Interstate 35 877 Harper Road 2800 NE Loop 410, #107 2441 Nacogdoches Rd., Suite 715

Item Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio, 

TX 78247

(210) 826-2030

San Antonio, TX 

78233

Kerrville, TX 

78028

San Antonio, TX 

78218

San Antonio, TX 

78217

6100010318

B5.8 Service Center, New Northwest 2

Price per Each $95.00 $70.00 $75.00 $765.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $190.00 $140.00 $150.00 $1,530.00 $40.00

B5.9 Service Center, New Southeast 2

Price per Each $95.00 $55.00 $75.00 $645.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $190.00 $110.00 $150.00 $1,290.00 $40.00

B5.10 Service Center, Northeast, Toolyard 2

Price per Each $95.00 $25.00 $375.00 $400.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $190.00 $50.00 $750.00 $800.00 $40.00

B5.11 Service Center, Southwest 2

Price per Each $95.00 $90.00 $180.00 $920.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $190.00 $180.00 $360.00 $1,840.00 $40.00

Treatment Method Aerosols, Fogging, Backpack Fogging, 

Dunks

Interior - ULD / Exterior - Backpack 

Fogger

ULV/fogging Fogging interior and exterior 

(adulticide), larvacide granules on 

exterior as needed.

Spray of affected areas using 

environmentally friendly products

B5.12 Deleted  

Subtotal for Items B5 $2,090.00 $1,712.00 $4,920.00 $17,200.00 $440.00

 

Total Group B $26,115.02 $41,753.02 $19,330.00 $138,024.01 $2,390.01

GROUP C  AS-NEEDED PEST CONTROL SERVICES  

C1 Stinging Pests - Removal & Control  

C1.1a Stinging Pests - Visible Habitat, 10 or fewer nests 1

 Per Each Job  $165.00 $95.00 $35.00 $275.00/$875.00 if lift required $20.00

 Total Price  $165.00 $95.00 $35.00 $1,150.00 $20.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 2, 2019

Local Local Non-Local Non-local Non-local

For: Annual Contract for Pest Control Services - BESD Pied Piper Pest Control LLC ABC Home & Commercial Services Hill Country Pest Control Orkin, LLC Pestmaster Services of San Antonio

                  LB 12103 Jones Maltsberger 10644 N. Interstate 35 877 Harper Road 2800 NE Loop 410, #107 2441 Nacogdoches Rd., Suite 715

Item Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio, 

TX 78247

(210) 826-2030

San Antonio, TX 

78233

Kerrville, TX 

78028

San Antonio, TX 

78218

San Antonio, TX 

78217

6100010318

C1.1b Stinging Pests - Visible Habitat, Price for 5 additional 1  

 Per Job  $165.00 $95.00 $25.00 $300.00 $20.00

 Total Price  $165.00 $95.00 $25.00 $300.00 $20.00

C1.2 Stinging Pests - Enclosed Habitat 1  

 Per Job  $165.00 $95.00 $175.00 $275.00/$875.00 if lift required $20.00

 Total Price  $165.00 $95.00 $175.00 $1,150.00 $20.00

C2 Dead Animal, Rodent or Bird Removal  

C2.1 Dead animal removal 1

 Per Job  $85.00 $75.00 $65.00 $150.00/ $750.00 if lift required $20.00

 Total Price  $85.00 $75.00 $65.00 $900.00 $20.00

C3 Deleted  

C4 Flea & Tick Treatment  

C4.1 Flea & Tick Treatment, includes 3-month Warranty 1

Per Square Foot $0.2500 $0.0200 $0.0040 $0.0700 $0.0050

 Total Price  $0.250 $0.020 $0.004 $0.070 $0.005

Treatment Method Compressed Air Sprayer and/or Aerosols Interior - Aerosol, Exterior- Power Spray Service treatment, crack and crevice, 

spot

General Surface Spray Treatment Spray of affected areas using 

environmentally friendly products

C4.2 Flea & Tick Treatment, includes 6-month Warranty 1

Per Square Foot $0.2500 $0.0200 $0.0050 $0.0900 $0.0050

 Total Price  $0.25 $0.02 $0.01 $0.0900 $0.01

Treatment Method Compressed Air Sprayer and/or Aerosols Interior - Aerosol, Exterior- Power Spray Service treatment, crack and crevice, 

spot

General Surface Spray Treatment Spray of affected areas using 

environmentally friendly products

C5 Bed Bugs Inspection & Treatment  

C5.1 Bed bugs Inspection 1

Per Square Foot No charge $0.2500 $0.0060 $0.0000 $0.0050

 Total Price  $0.0000 $0.25 $0.01 $0.0000 $0.01

Page 11



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 2, 2019

Local Local Non-Local Non-local Non-local

For: Annual Contract for Pest Control Services - BESD Pied Piper Pest Control LLC ABC Home & Commercial Services Hill Country Pest Control Orkin, LLC Pestmaster Services of San Antonio

                  LB 12103 Jones Maltsberger 10644 N. Interstate 35 877 Harper Road 2800 NE Loop 410, #107 2441 Nacogdoches Rd., Suite 715

Item Description Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio, 

TX 78247

(210) 826-2030

San Antonio, TX 

78233

Kerrville, TX 

78028

San Antonio, TX 

78218

San Antonio, TX 

78217

6100010318

C5.2 Deleted

C5.3 Deleted

C6 Deleted  

C7 Ant Treatment - Outdoor Property  

C7.1 Deleted

C7.2 Deleted

 Ant Treatment - Outdoor Property  

C7.3 Ant Treatment per acre if property is greater than 1 

acre

2

Per Acre $185.00 $95.00 $50.00 $400.00 $450.00

 Total Price  $370.00 $190.00 $100.00 $800.00 $900.00

C7.4 Ant mounds treatment in conjunction with & in 

addition to C7.3 or by itself per Acre

2

Per Acre No charge $95.00 $50.00 $285.00 $450.00

 Total Price  $0.00 $190.00 $100.00 $570.00 $900.00

Treatment Method Advion, Indoxycarb and/or Top Choice 

/Fipronil

Probait - Hydramethylnon Advion Ant Bait, indoxacarb, 

methoxycarbonyl

Bayer Maxforce Complete, 

Hydramethylnon

Spray of affected areas using 

environmentally friendly products

C8 Bird Control - Outdoor on rooftop  `

C8.1 Deleted

C8.2 Deleted

C9 Deleted  

C10 City-owned Bait Stations, pursuant to IFB 4.16.2.2  

C10.1 Collection, Removal, & Disposal of City-owned Bait 

Stations

1

Per Job $950.00 $1.00 $25.00 $250.00 $5.00

 Total Price  $950.00 $1.00 $25.00 $250.00 $5.00

Total Group C $1,900.50 $741.29 $525.02 $5,120.16 $1,885.02

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 3%, 10 days

Estimated Annual Total $44,755.52 Incomplete $36,235.02 $173,528.17 $14,619.02

Estimated Annual Award $44,755.52

Deleted Items: A1.32, B2.4, B3.18, B4.3, B5.12, C3, C5.2, C5.3, C6, C7.1, C7.2, C8.1, C8.2, and C9 will not be re-bid.
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