
NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL

Opened: July 8, 2019

Annual Contract For Police Motorcycles Parts and 

Services

Overseas Parts Distributing Inc., dba 

Alamo BMW

Kent Powersports, LP Alamo Cycle Plex

6100011562 AAS 25600 IH -10W 15664 IH-35 N 11900 IH-10 West

Estimated Boerne, Selma,     San Antonio

Item Description Annual TX 78006 TX 78154 TX 78230

Quantity 210-289-8692 210-655-2625  

1A HONDA MOTORCYCLE PARTS

A. Percent of discount offered OR Cost Plus Mark Up No Bid 10% 0%

B. Product Identification (Manufacturer)  Honda Honda

C. Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)  Retail Dealer

D. Price Schedule Number  N/A No response

E. Date of Price Schedule  June 1, 2019

F. Price schedule column on which discount is based  Retail

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)

G. Warranty  6 Months 90 Days

2 HONDA GOLD WING MOTORCYCLE SPECIFIED ITEMS: 

2.1 Brake Pad Sets 06435-MCA-016 20

Manufacturer Name EACH No Bid Honda Honda

Part Name &  No.  Pad Set 06435-MCA-026  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus  10% 0%

Price Each  $54.45 $49.98

Price Each with Discount  $49.01 $49.98

Price Total  980.20$ 999.60$ 

 

2.2 Pad Sets 06455-MCA-016 20  

Manufacturer Name EACH No Bid Honda Honda

Part Name &  No.  Pad Set 06455-MCA-016  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus  10% 0%

Price Each  $53.69 $49.98

Price Each with Discount  $48.33 $49.98

Price Total  966.60$ 999.60$ 

2.3 Disk Brakes 43250-MCA-013 5  

Manufacturer Name EACH No Bid Honda Honda

Part Name &  No.  Brake Disc 43250-MCA-013  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus  10% 0%

Price Each  $621.35 $621.36

Price Each with Discount  $559.22 $621.35

Price Total  2,796.10$ 3,106.75$ 

2.4 Valve Stems 292299 (Tucker Rocky) 1  

Manufacturer Name PACKAGE No Bid Tucker Rocky Honda

Part Name &  No. (pack of 6)  Valve Stems 292306  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus  10% 0%

Price Each  $52.80 $9.29

Price Each with Discount $47.52 $9.29

Price Total  47.52$ 55.74$ 

2.5 Headlight Bulbs 34901-MAT-611 10  

Manufacturer Name EACH No Bid Honda Honda

Part Name &  No.  Headlight Bulbs 34901-MAT-611  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus  10% 0%

Price Each  $22.96 $22.96

Price Each with Discount  $20.67 $22.96

Price Total  206.70$ 229.60$ 

2.6 Sensors 39411-MCA-R32 5

Manufacturer Name EACH No Bid Honda Honda

Part Name &  No.  Sensors 39411-MCA-R32  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus  10% 0%

Price Each  $173.89 $173.89

Price Each with Discount  $156.51 $173.89

Price Total 782.55$ 869.45$ 

2.7 Switch Assembly 35200-MCA-S81 5  

Manufacturer Name EACH No Bid Honda Honda

Part Name &  No.  Switch Assembly 35200-MCA-S81  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus  10% 0%

Price Each  $571.73 $571.73

Price Each with Discount  $514.56 $571.73

Price Total 2,572.80$ 2,858.65$ 

City Of San Antonio

 Bid Tabulation



 

Opened: July 8, 2019  

Annual Contract For Police Motorcycles Parts and 

Services

Overseas Parts Distributing Inc., dba 

Alamo BMW

Kent Powersports, LP Alamo Cycle Plex

6100011562 AAS 25600 IH -10W 15664 IH35 N 11900 IH-10 West

Estimated Boerne, Selma,     San Antonio

Item Description Annual TX 78006 TX 78154 TX 78230

Quantity 210-289-8692 210-655-2625

2.8 Grommet Set 417410 (Tucker Rocky) 3  

Manufacturer Name EACH No Bid Showchrome Showchrome

Part Name &  No.  Grommet Set 417410  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus  10% 0%

Price Each  $5.96 $5.95

Price Each with Discount  $5.36 $5.95

Price Total 16.08$ 17.85$ 

2.9 Rubber Maid Step 50661-MCA-305 5  

Manufacturer Name EACH No Bid Honda Honda

Part Name &  No.  Rubber, Maid Step 50661-MCA-305  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus  10% 0%

Price Each  $12.04 $12.04

Price Each with Discount  $10.84 $12.04

Price Total 54.20$ 60.20$ 

2.10 Seals, Windshield 64121-MCA-000 5 No Bid

Manufacturer Name EACH Honda Honda

Part Name &  No. Seals, Windshield 64121-MCA-000

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus  10% 0%

Price Each  $28.53 $28.53

Price Each with Discount  $25.68 $28.53

Price Total 128.40$ 142.65$ 

 

2.11 Seal Set 51490-MCA-A61 5 No Bid

Manufacturer Name EACH Honda Honda

Part Name &  No.  Seal Set 51490-MCA-A61

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus  10% 0%

Price Each  $28.02 $28.02

Price Each with Discount  $25.22 $28.02

Price Total 126.10$ 140.10$ 

 

2.12 Fluid 08208-0010 5 No Bid

Manufacturer Name EACH Honda Honda

Part Name &  No.  Fluid 08208-0010

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus 10% 0%

Price Each $6.40 $7.96

Price Each with Discount $5.76 $7.96

Price Total 28.80$ 39.80$ 

3 PERIODIC MAINTENANCE COST PER SERVICE TYPE- 

For Honda Gold Wing Motorcycles3.1 Category I - Maintenance Schedule 25  

Price Each EACH No Bid $253.06 $272.81

Price Total $6,326.50 $6,820.25

 

3.2 Category II - Maintenance Schedule 20

Price Each EACH No Bid $379.39 $662.62

Price Total $7,587.80 $13,252.40

 

3.3 Category III - Maintenance Schedule 20

Price Each EACH No Bid $546.32 $967.84

Price Total $10,926.40 $19,356.80

3.4 Category IV - Maintenance Schedule 5

Price Each EACH No Bid $669.78 $1380.06

Price Total $3,348.90 $6,900.30

3.5 New Front Tire (Removal-Install-Balance) 20

Price Each EACH No Bid $294.30 $363.65

Price Total $5,886.00 $7,273.00

3.6 New Rear Tire (Removal-Install-Balance) 35

Price Each EACH No Bid $337.88 $457.45

Price Total $11,825.80 $16,010.75

 

3.7 Battery Replacement (Inclusive of all fees) 10

Price Each EACH No Bid $158.74 $231.45

Price Total $1,587.40 $2,314.50



Opened: July 8, 2019  

Annual Contract For Police Motorcycles Parts and 

Services

Overseas Parts Distributing Inc., dba 

Alamo BMW

Kent Powersports, LP Alamo Cycle Plex

6100011562 AAS 25600 IH -10W 15664 IH35 N 11900 IH-10 West

Estimated Boerne, Selma,     San Antonio

Item Description Annual TX 78006 TX 78154 TX 78230

Quantity 210-289-8692 210-655-2625

3.8 Labor Rate For Repair Service 120

Price Each HOURS No Bid $107.55 $129.00

Price Total $12,906.00 $15,480.00

 

3.9 Initial Oil Change at 800 Miles 3 No Bid No Bid

Price Each EACH No Bid $0.00 $0.00

Price Total  $0.00 $0.00

Warranty For Labor  3 Months 90 Days

Warranty For Specified Parts 3 Months 90 Days

Honda Certified Service Provider No Honda Certified Honda Certified 

Delivery 7 Days 7 Days

4 BMW R1250ORTs MOTORCYCLE PARTS

A. Percent of discount offered OR Cost Plus Mark Up 30% No Bid No Bid

B. Product Identification (Manufacturer) BMW / Michelin  

C. Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Manufacturer  

D. Price Schedule Number N/A  

E. Date of Price Schedule 7/5/2019  

F. Price schedule column on which discount is based Dealer Cost  

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)

G. Warranty 2 Years  

5 BMW R1250ORTs MOTORCYCLE SPECIFIED ITEMS

5.1 Brake Pads Front (Sets) 34 18 405 104 2

Manufacturer Name SETS BMW No Bid No Bid

Part Name &  No.   Brake Pads Front (Sets) 3418405104  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus Cost Plus 30%  

Price Each $54.27  

Price Each with Discount $70.55  

Price Total 141.10$  

5.2 Brake Pads Rear (Sets) 34 18 562 163 1  

Manufacturer Name SETS BMW No Bid No Bid

Part Name &  No. Brake Pads Sintered Metal 3418562163  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus Cost Plus 30%  

Price Each $61.39  

Price Each with Discount $79.81  

Price Total 79.81$  

5.3

                                                                                               

Disk Brakes front with rivet, 34 118 526 566 2  

Manufacturer Name EACH BMW No Bid No Bid

Part Name &  No. Brake Rotor w Rivet 34 11 8 526 566  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus Cost Plus 30%  

Price Each $238.10  

Price Each with Discount $309.53  

Price Total 619.06$  

 

5.4

                                                                                                               

Rubber Valve Stems– Incorporated in TPM 1

Manufacturer Name PACKAGE BMW No Bid No Bid

Part Name &  No. (pack of 6) Included in Item 5.6  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus  

Price Each   

Price Each with Discount $0.00  

Price Total -$  

5.5 Headlight Bulbs 63 217 160 780; BMW 1

Manufacturer Name EACH BMW No Bid No Bid

Part Name &  No. Bulb 63 217 160 780  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus Cost Plus 30%  

Price Each $6.46  

Price Each with Discount $8.40  

Price Total 8.40$  

5.6 TPM Sensors with valve stem; 36 318 532 731 BMW 1

Manufacturer Name EACH BMW No Bid No Bid

Part Name &  No. Sensor with valve 36 318 532 731  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus Cost Plus 30%  

Price Each $127.75  

Price Each with Discount $166.08  

Price Total 166.08$  



Opened: July 8, 2019  

Annual Contract For Police Motorcycles Parts and 

Services

Overseas Parts Distributing Inc., dba 

Alamo BMW

Kent Powersports, LP Alamo Cycle Plex

6100011562 AAS 25600 IH -10W 15664 IH35 N 11900 IH-10 West

Estimated Boerne, Selma,     San Antonio

Item Description Annual TX 78006 TX 78154 TX 78230

Quantity 210-289-8692 210-655-2625

5.7

                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Turn Signal Switch Assembly (Left Multifunction Switch); 61 1

Manufacturer Name EACH BMW No Bid No Bid

Part Name &  No.  Combination Switch Left (Lin Bus) 61 

318 388 631

 

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus Cost Plus 30%  

Price Each $263.52  

Price Each with Discount $342.58  

Price Total 342.58$  

5.8 Rubber Foot Peg; 46 718 544 486 1

Manufacturer Name EACH BMW No Bid No Bid

Part Name &  No. Footrest Rubber 46 718 544 486  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus Cost Plus 30%  

Price Each $18.85  

Price Each with Discount $24.51  

Price Total 24.51$  

5.9

                                                                                              

Front Fork Seal Set; one per fork, 31 42 8 532 723 1

Manufacturer Name SET BMW No Bid No Bid

Part Name &  No. Set if Sealing Elements 31 42 8 532 723  

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus Cost Plus 30%  

Price Each $31.09  

Price Each with Discount $40.42  

Price Total 40.42$  

5.10 Fork Oil 10W, 31-42 9062 158 2

Manufacturer Name EACH BMW No Bid No Bid

Part Name &  No. Telescopic Fork Oil Type 1 31-42 9062 

158

 

Discount % Offered or Cost Plus Cost Plus 30%  

Price Each $14.27  

Price Each with Discount $18.55  

Price Total 37.10$  

6 PERIODIC MAINTENANCE COST PER SERVICE TYPE- 

For BMW Motorcycles6.1 Category I - Maintenance Schedule 5

Price Each EACH $340.23 No Bid No Bid

Price Total $1,701.15

6.2 Category II - Maintenance Schedule 5

Price Each EACH $554.37 No Bid No Bid

Price Total $2,771.85

6.3 Category III - Maintenance Schedule 5

Price Each EACH $230.34 No Bid No Bid

Price Total $1,151.70

6.4 Category IV - Maintenance Schedule 5

Price Each EACH $578.00 No Bid No Bid

Price Total $2,890.00

6.5 Category V - Maintenance Schedule 5

Price Each EACH $230.34 No Bid No Bid

Price Total $1,151.70

6.6 Category VI - Maintenance Schedule 5

Price Each EACH $675.12 No Bid No Bid

Price Total $3,375.60

6.7 New Front Tire (Removal-Install-Balance) 10

Price Each EACH $258.70 No Bid No Bid

Price Total $2,587.00

6.8 New Rear Tire (Removal-Install-Balance) 15

Price Each EACH $318.05 No Bid No Bid

Price Total $4,770.75   

6.9 Battery Replacement (Inclusive of all fees) 5

Price Each EACH $188.72 No Bid No Bid

Price Total $943.60   



Opened: July 8, 2019  

Annual Contract For Police Motorcycles Parts and 

Services

Overseas Parts Distributing Inc., dba 

Alamo BMW

Kent Powersports, LP Alamo Cycle Plex

6100011562 AAS 25600 IH -10W 15664 IH35 N 11900 IH-10 West

Estimated Boerne, Selma,     San Antonio

Item Description Annual TX 78006 TX 78154 TX 78230

Quantity 210-289-8692 210-655-2625

7.0 Labor Rate For Repair Service 60

Price Each HOURS $115.00 No Bid No Bid

Price Total $6,900.00   

7.1 Initial Oil Change at 600 Miles 5

Price Each EACH $230.34 No Bid No Bid

Price Total $1,151.70   

Warranty For Labor 2 Years   

Warranty For Specified Parts 2 Years

Certified Service Provider

BMW Certified

No No

Deliveries made within 7 days after receipt of order 7 Days

Payment Terms 2%, Net 15 Net 30 Net 30

Delivery 7 days if parts available

Business hours are from Tuesday -Saturday 8:30 am to 6 pm Tuesday -Saturday 9 am to 7 pm Tuesday -Saturday 8 am to 5 pm 

Weekends Tuesday -Saturday 8:30 am to 6 pm 

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bidder -28.71%

Price Differential $27,827.14

Estimated Annual Total: 30,854.11$ 69,100.85$ 96,927.99$ 

Estimated Annual Award: $30,854.11 $69,100.85


