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ORDINANCE 2019 - 0 9 - 1 9 - 0 7 3 2 
APPROVING CONTRACTS WITH GUNN NISSAN, LTD., GUNN 
CHEVROLET, LTD., ANCIRA MOTOR COMPANY, RED MCCOMBS 
FORD, AND KYRISH TRUCK CENTER TO PROVIDE 24 LIGHT & 
MEDIUM DUTY SERVICE VEHICLES FOR A TOTAL COST OF 
$871,396.27. FUNDING FOR 22 REPLACEMENT VEHICLES IN THE 
AMOUNT OF $794,717.02 IS AVAILABLE FROM THE FY 2019 
EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND BUDGET, 
$33,643.75 FOR ONE VEHICLE ADDITION IS AVAILABLE FROM THE 
FY 2019 GENERAL FUND BUDGET, AND $43,035.50 FOR ONE 
VEHICLE ADDITION IS AVAILABLE FROM THE 2018 URBAN AREA 
SECURITY INITIATIVE GRANT. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to the City of San Antonio to provide light and medium duty 
service vehicles for various City departments; and 

WHEREAS, the vehicles shall be used to support City facilities maintenance, parks and 
greenway trails maintenance, transporting of signage, trailer towing, refuse cart transport, traffic 
barrel transport, and aggregate hauling; and 

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd. (Item 10) and Jim Bass Ford Inc. 
(Items 6-9) failed to meet the City's specifications and/or requirements for light and medium 
duty service vehicles; and 

WHEREAS, the low bids were submitted by Gunn Nissan, Ltd. (Item 1) for a total cost of 
$160,245.52, Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd. (Items 2, 8 and 9) for a total cost of $120,539.75, Ancira 
Motor Company (Items 3, 4, 6 and 7) for a total cost of $161,605.00, Red McCombs Ford (Item 
10) for a total cost of $101,166.00, and Kyrish Truck Center (Items 11 and 12) for a total cost of 
$327,840.00; NOW THEREFORE: 

· BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Gunn Nissan, Ltd. (Item 1), Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd. (Items 2, 
8 and 9), Ancira Motor Company (Items 3, 4, 6 and 7), Red McCombs Ford (Item 10), and 
Kyrish Truck Cente.r (Items 11 and 12) to provide 24 light and medium duty service vehicles for 
a total cost of $871,396.27 is hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all 
required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. Attached hereto 
and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I is the bid tabulation sheet. Copies of the 
bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance 
Department. 

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bids submitted by Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd. 
(Item 10) and Jim Bass Ford Inc. (Items 6-9) failed to meet the City's specifications and/or 
requirements for light and medium duty service vehicles. 
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SECTION 3. Funding for this ordinance in an amount of $871,396.27 is available as part of the 
Fiscal Year 2019 budget as follows: 

Amount General Ledger Cost Center/ Internal Order Fund 
$80,418.00 5709080 3503300001 72001001 

$714,299.02 5709080 3503200001 72001000 
$33,643.75 5709080 2615020001 11001000 
$43,035.50 5709060 120000000162 2206520006 

SECTION 4. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount is authorized to Gunn Nissan, Ltd., 
Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd., Ancira Motor Company, Red McCombs Ford and Kyrish Truck Center to 
provide 24 light and medium duty service vehicles. 

SECTION 5. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Deputy 
Chief Financial Officer, City of San Antonio. The Deputy Chief Financial Officer may, subject 
to concurrence by the City Manager or designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund 
Numbers, SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund 
Centers, SAP Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, 
and SAP GL Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance. 

SECTION 6. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 19th day of September, 2019. 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
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Agenda Item: 7 ( in consent vote: 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13A, 13B, 15A, 15B, 15C, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 
22,23,24,26,28,29,30,32,33,34,35) 

Date: 09/ 19/2019 

Time: 09:38:36AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: Ordinance approving contracts with Ancira Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram, Gunn Chevrolet LTD., 
Gunn Nissan LTD, Kyrish Truck Center, and Red McCombs Ford to provide twenty-four Light & 
Medium Duty Service Vehicles for a total cost of $871 ,396.27. Funding for twenty-two 
replacement vehicles in the amount of $794,717.02 is available from the FY 2019 Equipment 
Renewal and Replacement Fund Budget; one vehicle addition in the amount of $33,643.75 is 
available from the FY 2019 General Fund Budget; and one vehicle addition in the amount of 
$43,035.50 is available from 2018 Urban Area Security Initiative Grant. [Ben Gorzell, Chief 
Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not 

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Ron Nirenberg Mayor X 

Roberto C. Treviilo District 1 X X 

Jada Andrews-Sullivan District 2 X 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 X 

Adriana Rocha Garcia District 4 X 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 X 

Melissa Cabello Havrda District 6 X 

Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X 

Manny Pelaez District 8 X 

John Courage District 9 X X 

Clayton H. Perry District 10 X 
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Exhibit I 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation Exhibit I 

Opened : July 10, 2019 
For: Light & Medium Duty Service Trucks Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local Local Local 

Gunn Nissan LTD. Gunn Chevrolet l TD. Ancira Chrysler Dodge Red Mccombs Ford Kyrish Truck Center Jim Bass Ford Inc Doggett Freightliner of Grande Truck Center 
Jeep Ram South Texas , llC 

6100011605 IM 750 NE loop 410 16550 IH 35 N 10807 IH 10 West 8333 IH-10W 1380 Ackerman Road 4032 W . Houston Harte 8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH-10 East 
Expresswav 

San Antonio , Selma, San Antonio , San Antonio, San Antonio , San Angelo , Converse, San Antonio , 
TX 78209 TX 78154 TX 78230 TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 76901 TX 78109 TX 78219 

Item Oescriotion Qty ?1 n_599_,:;:nnn ?1 n_599_,:;:nnn I-,1n_558_1i:;:nn ?10-'57-1' 1R 71n i::i::1 _1n11 -:l'lC. OAO_ Ai::'l1 

1 Mini Cargo Vans w/Shelving with Ladder Rack 8 
Price Each $20,030.69 No Bid $24 ,800.00 $28,183.00 No Bid $27,681 .00 No Bid $26,347.00 
Price Total $160,245.52 $198 ,400.00 $225 ,464 .00 $221 ,448 .00 $210,776.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered Nissan NV200 S 2020 RAM 2020 Ford Transit 2020 Ford Transit 2020 Ford Transit 

PROMASTER CITY Connect Connect Connect Van 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Nissan 2.0U122131 HP CHRYSLER 2.4L Ford 2.0L GOl I4 (162 hp Ford 2.0l 1-4 162 HP Ford 2.0L GDI 1-4 Gas 

TIGERSHARK 178 HP @6500 rpm) 162 HP 
Warranty 5 yr or 100,000 Bumper 3 YR/ 36 ,000 MILE B TO Ford 3 yr/36000 miles 3yrs ,/36000 miles 36,000 miles or 36 

to Bumper Band and bumper to bumper months 
5 YR / 100,000 MILE 5 yr/60000 powertrain 5 yrs/60000 miles 

POWERTRAIN powertrain 
Warranty Service Provider Name & Address Gunn Nissan l TO, 750 ANCIRA CHRYSLER Red Mccombs Ford Nearest and/or any Ford Grande Truck Center 

NE loop 410 DODGE JEEP RAM 8333 IH-10W, dealer nationwide 4562 IH-10 East, 
San Antonio , Texas 10807 IH-10 WEST SAN San Antonio, TX 78230 San Antonio , TX 78219 

711.?0!=I ANTnNtn TX 711?:m 
Production Cut-Off Date 2019 Production Cut Of1 2/2020 4/20 Unknown at this time 10/31/2019 

Has Passed 2020 
Production Starts 9/19 

Last Day to Place Order 6/15/20 2/2020 2/20 2/28/19 10/31/2019 
Firm Pricing Date No YES Yes No No 
Delivery Days 90-120 150-200 180 145-160 150-180 

For this bid we spec'd a 
Weatherguard ladder 

rack, shelving , and 
bulkhead partion 

packaQe 

2 Crew Cab Compact Pickup Truck (Max Towing) 1 
Price Each No Bid $33,643.75 No Bid $38,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Price Total $33,643.75 $38,050.00 
Year , Make & Model Offered 2020 Chevrolet 12M43 2020 Ford F150 

Colorado 12M43 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) GM 14 LWN Diesel 2.8l Ford 3.0l V6 Power 

181 HP Stroke Diesel (250hp@ 
3250 rom) 

Warranty 3 yr or 36K 8TB Ford 3 yr/36000 mile and 
5 yr or 100,000K 5 yr/60000 mile 

Powertrain powertrain 

Warranty Service Provider Name & Address Gunn Chevrolet l TD Red Mccombs Ford 
16550 IH35N Selma, 8333 IH-10W, San 

Texas 78154 Antonio . TX 78230 
Production Cut-Off Date 4/20? 10/20 
last Day to Place Order 4/20? 7120 
Firm PricinQ Date No Yes 
Delivery Days 120-160 (Diesel is on 180 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 10, 2019 
For: Light & Medium Duty Service Trucks Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local Local Local 

Gunn Nissan LTD. Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Ancira Chrysler Dodge Red Mccombs Ford Kyrish Truck Center Jim Bass Ford Inc Doggett Freightliner of Grande Truck Center 
Jeep Ram South Texas, LLC 

6100011605 IM 750 NE loop 410 16550 IH 35 N 10807 IH 10 West 8333 IH-10W 1380 Ackerman Road 4032 W. Houston Harte 8700 IH 10 East 4562 l H-10 East 
Expressway 

San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio , San Antonio , San Antonio , San Angelo , Converse , San Antonio , 
TX 78209 TX 78154 TX 78230 TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 76901 TX 78109 TX 78219 

Item Description Qty 1.,1 n_~!=J!=J_.c::nnn l'l1 n .c::on_.c::nnn ?10-SSR- '°nn I ?1 n_,s, _,, 1A 1 .............. - .......... l" ... ~_o.1n_• ...... • 

3 ½ Ton Extended Cab 4x4/AWD Pickup Truck 1 
Price Each No Bid $26,368.85 $22,900.00 $29,345.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $27,577.00 
Price Total $26,368.85 $22,900.00 $29,345.00 $27,577.00 
Year , Make & Model Offered 2020 Chevy CK10753 2020 RAM 1500 QUAD 2020 Ford F150 2020 F150 Super Cab 

CAB 4x4 XIE 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) GM LV3 Gas VG 4.3L CHRYSLER Ford 3.3L Ti-VCT VG Ford 3.3L VG PDFI Gas 

285 HP PENTASTAR 3.6l (290 hp@ 6500 rpm) Engine 290 HP 
305 HP 

Warranty 3 yr or 36K BTB 3 YR/ 36,000 MILE B TO Ford 3 yr/36000 mites 36,000 miles or 36 
5 yr or 100,000K PT Band and months 

5 YR / 100,000 MILE 5 yr/60000 mile 
POWFRTRAIN nnwArtr~in 

Warranty Service Provider Name & Address Gunn Chevrolet LTD ANCIRA CHRYSLER Red Mccombs Ford Grande Truck Center 
16550 IH35N Selma, DODGE JEEP RAM 8333 IH-10W, San 4562 1H-10 East, San 

Texas 78154 10807 IH-10 WEST SAN Antonio, TX 78230 Antonio , TX 78219 
ANTONIO TX 78230 

Production Cut-Off Date ? 7/20 Start o 5/2020 10/20 10/31/2019 
Production 11 /19 

Last Day to Place Order 7/20? 5/2020 7/20 10/31/2019 
Firm Pricing Date No YES Yes No 
Delivery Days 120-160 150-200 180 120-150 

4 ½ Ton Four Full Door Full Size 4x4/AWD Pickup Trucks w/ Bed 2 
Cover 
Price Each No Bid $29,936.75 $26,200.00 $32,358.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $31 ,233.00 
Price Total $59,873.50 $52,400.00 $64,716.00 $62,466 .00 
Year, Make & Model Offered 2020 Chevrolet 2020 RAM 1500 CREW 2020 Ford F150 2020 F150 Crew Cab 

CK10743 4x4 Crew Cab CAB CAB 4x4WIE 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) GM LV3 Gas VG 4.3L CHRYSLER Ford 3.3L Ti-VCT VG Ford 3.3L VG PDFI Gas 

285 HP PENTASTAR 3.6L 305 (290 hp @ 6500 rpm) Engine 190 HP 
HP 

Warranty 3 yr or 36K 8TB 3 YR/ 36,000 MILE B TO Ford 3 yr/36000 miles 36,000 miles or 36 
5 yr or 100,000K PT Band and months 

5 YR / 100,000 MILE 5 yr/60000 mile 
P<"lWFRTRAIN nnwArfr.:iin 

Warranty Service Provider Name & Address Gunn Chevrolet LTD ANCIRA CHRYSLER Red Mccombs Ford Grande Truck Center 
16550 IH35N Selma, DODGE JEEP RAM 8333 IH- l0W, San 4562 IH-10 East, San 

Texas 78154 10807 IH-10 WEST SAN Antonio , TX 78230 Antonio , TX 78219 
ANTnNln TX 787:\0 

Production Cut-Off Date 6/20 (WT will start prod 5/2020 10/20 10/31/2019 
10/19 

Last Day to Place Order 6/20 5/2020 7120 10/31/2019 
Firm PricinQ Date No YES Yes No 
Deliverv Davs 120 150-200 180 120-150 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 10, 2019 
For: Light & Medium Duty Servi ce Trucks Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local Local Local 

Gunn Nissan LTD. Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Ancira Chrysler Dodge Red Mccombs Ford Kyrish Truck Center Jim Bass Ford Inc Doggett Freightliner of Grande Truck Center 
Jeep Ram South Texas , LLC 

6100011605 IM 750 NE Loop 410 16550 IH 35 N 10807 IH 10 West 8333 IH-10W 1380 Ackerman Road 4032 W . Houston Harte 8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH-10 East 
Expressway 

San Antonio , Selma, San Antonio , San Antonio , San Antonio , San Angelo , Converse , San Antonio , 
TX 78209 TX 7B154 TX 78230 TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 76901 TX 78109 TX 78219 

Item Description Qty 1-,1 n _!=j!'.J!'.J_C::nnn l?1n c::nn_c::nnn 1?1 O-SSR-1Snn h, O-SS7- 1' 1R 1.,1,., ....... -,., ...... 

5 Deleted 

6 3/4 Ton Regular Cab Truck, Long Bed 2 NAS 
Price Each No Bid $29,341.50 $28 ,235 .0( $28 ,583 .00 No Bid $26,808.00 No Bid $28,614.00 
Price Total $58,683.00 $56,470.00 $57,166.00 $53,616.00 $57,228.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered 2020 Chevrolet 2020 RAM 2500 REG. 2020 Ford F250 2019 Ford F250 2020 Ford F250 RIC 4x2 

CC20903 3/4 Reo Cab CAB 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) GM LBT GasN8 6.6L CHRYSLER 6.4L HEMI Ford 6.2L VB (FFV) (385 Ford 6.2L VS gasoline Ford 6.2L 2 valve SOHC 

401 HP 410HP hp@ 5750 rpm) 385 HP EFI NA VS Flex -Fuel 
Enoine 385 HP 

Warranty 3 yr or 36K BTB 3 YR/ 36,000 MILE B TO Ford 3 yr/36000 mites 3yrs ,/36000 miles 36,000 miles or 36 
5 yr or 100,000K PT Band and bumper to bumper, months 

5 YR / 100,000 MILE 5 yr/60000 mile 5 yrs ./60000 miles 
POWFRTRAIN nnw P.rtri:1in nnwP.rtri:1in 

Warranty Service Provider Name & Address Gunn Chevrolet LTD ANCIRA CHRYSLER Red Mccombs Ford Nearest and/or any Ford c;.;rande Truck Center 
16550 IH35N Selma, DODGE JEEP RAM 8333 IH-10W, San dealer nationwide 4562 IH-10 East, San 

Texas 78154 10807 IH-10 WEST SAN Antonio, TX 78230 Antonio , TX 78219 
ANTONIO , TX 7823( 

Production Cut-Off Date 6/20? WT production 5/202( 8/20 8/02/19 10/31/2019 
start 10/1/19 

Last Day to Place Order 6/20? 5/202( 4/20 8/02/19 10/31/2019 
Firm Pricing Date No YES Yes No No 
Delivery Days 120 150-200 180 90-110 180-240 

7 3/4 Ton Regular Cab Truck , Lift Gate, Long Bed 1 NAS 
Price Each No Bid $30,865.50 $29,835.0( $30,058.00 No Bid $28,708.00 No Bid $29,953.00 
Price Total $30,865.50 $29,835.00 $30,058.00 $28,708.00 $29,953.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered 2020 Chevrolet 2020 RAM 2500 REG. 2020 Ford F250 2019 Ford F250 2020 Ford F-250 RIC 

CC20903 3/4 2wd Reg CAB 4x2 
C:i:1h 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) GM L8T GasN8 6.6L CHRYSLER 6.4L HEMI Ford 6.2L VB (FFV) (385 Ford 6.2L VS gasoline Ford 6.2L 2-Valve SOHC 
401 HP 410 HP hp@ 5750 rpm) 386 HP EFt NA VS Flex-Fuel 

Enoine 385 HP 
Warranty 3 yr or 36K BTB 3 YR/ 36,000 MILE B TO Ford 3 yr/36000 miles 3yrs ,/36000 miles 36,000 miles or 36 

5 yr or 100,000K PT Band and bumper to bumper, months 
5 YR / 100,000 MILE 5 yr/60000 mile 5 yrs ./60000 miles 

POWERTRAIN powertrain powertrain 
Warranty Service Provider Name & Address Gunn Chevrolet LTD ANCIRA CHRYSLER Red Mccombs Ford Nearest and/or any Ford Grande Truck Center 

16550 IH35N Selma, DODGE JEEP RAM 8333 lH-10W, San dealer nationwide 4562 IH-10 East, San 
Texas 78154 10807 IH-10 WEST SAN Antonio , TX 78230 Antonio , TX 78219 

ANTONIO, TX 78230 
Production Cut-Off Date 6/20? WT production 5/2021 8/20 8/02/19 10/31/2019 

starts 1 0/1 /19 
Last Day to Place Order 6/20 5/2020 4/20 8/02/19 10/31/2019 
Firm Pricing Date No YES Yes No No 
Deliverv Da"s 120 150-200 180 90-110 180-240 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 10, 2019 
For: Light & Medium Duty Service Trucks Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local Local Local 

Gunn Nissan LTD. Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Ancira Chrysler Dodge Red Mccombs Ford Kyrish Truck Center Jim Bass Ford Inc Doggett Freightliner of Grande Truck Center 
Jeep Ram South Texas, LLC 

6100011605 IM 750 NE Loop410 16550 IH 35 N 10807 IH 10 West 8333 IH-10W 1380 Ackerman Road 4032 W. Houston Harte 8700 IH 10 East 4562 tH-10 East 
Exoresswav 

San Antonio , Selma, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Angelo, Converse, San Antonio, 
TX 78209 TX 78154 TX 78230 TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 76901 TX 78109 TX 78219 

Item Description Qtv 1,., .. ,,__i:;QQ_.,,,_,,_,,_ 1 ......... ,,,,,,.._,,,,.,,..,., o.n_ss._.cnn lorn_357_1418 l-,A,-.rr _,,_.,-,A 1,,,.,.,-,_.,,_.,.,..,,A 

8 1 Ton Crew Cab Truck, 4x4/AWD, Long Bed 1 NAS 
Price Each No Bid $43,035.50 No Bid $44,385 .00 No Bid $41 ,572.00 No Bid $44,594.00 
Price Total $43,035.50 $44,385.00 $41,572.00 $44,594.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered 2020 Chevrolet 2020 Ford F350 2019 Ford F-350 2020 Ford F350 Crew 

CK30943 1 Ton SRW Cab 4x4 W38 
4x4 Crew 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) GM L5P Turbo Charged Ford 6.7L VB Ford 6.7L diesel 450 HP Ford 6.7L 4V OHV 
Diesel VB 6.6L 445 HP Powerstroke Turbo Power Stroke VB Turbo 

Diesel (450 hp@ 2800 Diesel 820 450 HP 
rnm) 

Warranty 3 yr or 36K BTB Ford 3 yr/36000 miles Jyrs,/36000 miles 36,000 miles or 36 
5 yr or 100,000K PT and bumper to bumper, months 

5 yr/60000 mile 5 yrs ./60000 miles 
powertrain powertrain 

5 yr/100000 miles diesel 

Warranty Service Provider Name & Address 
.,. ... ,,,· .. ,.,.. .. ,., 

Gunn Chevrolet LTD Red Mccombs Ford Nearest and/or any Ford Grande Truck Center 
16550 IH35N Selma, 8333 IH-10W, San dealer nationwide 4562 IH-10 East, San 

Texas 78154 Antonio , TX 78230 Antonio, TX 78219 
Production Cut-Off Date 7 /20? WT start 01 8/20 8/02/19 10/31/2019 

production 12/19 
Last Dav to Place Order 7120? 4/20 8/02119 10/31/2019 
Firm Pricing Date No Yes No No 
Delivery Days 180+ 180 90-110 185-240 

9 1 Ton Crew Cab Truck, 4x4/AWD, Long Bed, 2 Style Tow 1 NAS 
Price Each No Bid $43,860.50 No Bid $44,985.00 No Bid $42,678.00 No Bid $45,844 .00 
Price Total $43,860.50 $44,985.00 $42,678.00 $45,844 .00 

Year, Make & Model Offered 2020 Chevrolet 2020 Ford F350 2019 Ford F350 2020 Ford F350 Crew 
CK30943 SRW 4x4 Cab 4x4 WBB 

Crew Cab 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) GM L5P Turbo Charged Ford 6.7L VB Ford 6.7L diesel 450 HP Ford 6.7L 4V OHV 

Diesel V8 6.6L 445 HP Powerstroke Turbo Power Stroke V8 Turbo 
Diesel (450 hp@ 2800 Diesel 820 450 HP 

Warranty 3 yr or 36K 8TB 
mm) 

Ford 3 yr/36000 miles 3yrs,/36000 miles 36,000 miles or 36 
5 yr or 100,000K PT and bumper to bumper, months 

5 yr/60000 mile 5 yrs./60000 miles 
powertrain powertrain 

5 yr/100000 miles for 

Warranty Service Provider Name & Address Gunn Chevrolet LTD Red Mccombs Ford 
rliP.sP.I P.nninP. nntv 

Nearest and/or any Ford Grande Truck Center 
16550 IH35N Selma , 8333 IH-10W, San dealer nationwide 4562 IH-10 East. San 

Texas 78154 Antonio . TX 78230 Antonio. TX 78219 
Production Cut-Off Date 7120? WT start o 8/20 8/02/19 10/31/2019 

production 12/19 
Last Day to Place Order 7120? 4/20 8/02/19 10/31/2019 
Firm Pricing Date N Yes No No 
Deliveru Da\lS 180+ 180 90-110 185-240 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 10, 2019 
For: Light & Medium Duty Service Trucks Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local Local Local 

Gunn Nissan LTD. Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Ancira Chrysler Dodge Red Mccombs Ford Kyrish Truck Center Jim Bass Ford Inc Doggett Freightliner of Grande Truck Center 
Jeep Ram South Texas , LLC 

6100011605 IM 750NE Loop410 16550 IH 35 N 10807 JH 10 West 8333 IH-10W 1380 Ackerman Road 4032 W. Houston Harte 8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH-10 East 
Expressway 

San Antonio , Selma, San Antonio , San Antonio , San Antonio , San Angelo , Converse, San Antonio, 
TX 78209 TX 78154 TX 78230 TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 76901 TX 78109 TX 78219 

Item DescriDtion Qty 1 ...... ,__CiQQ_Cl'\l'\n 1 ...... " "'""-"'""" lo, n_ss,_ ,snn 1210-357- ,.. --,,on """" .. . .l!."'.l.71 1-,--,,:: "~"- ~"" ...... 

10 1 Ton Regular Cab DRW Truck , 11 ' Slake Bed w/Uft Gate 2 NAS 
Price Each No Bid $40,865.50 $52,700.00 $50,583.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $52,845.00 
Price Total $81 ,731 .00 $105,400.00 $101 ,166.00 $105,690.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered 2020 Chevrolet 84" CA 2020 RAM 3500 REG 2020 Ford F350 2020 Ford F350 RIC 4x2 

Rea Cab Chassis CAB F36 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) GM L8T GasN8 6.6L CUMMINS 6.7L 370 HP Ford 6.7L V8 Ford 6.7L 4V OHV 

Direct Injection 401 HP Powerstroke Turbo Power Stroke VS Turbo 
Diesel (450 hp@ 2800 Diesel B20 330 HP 

Warranty 3 yr or 36K BTB 3 YR/ 36,000 MILE B TO 
mm) 

Ford 3 yr/36000 miles 36 ,000 miles or 36 
5 yr or 100,000K PT Band and months 

5 YR 1100,000 MILE 5 yr/60000 mile 
POWFRTRAIN nnwArtr::\in 

Warranty Service Provider Name & Address Gunn Chevrolet LTD ANCIRA CHRYSLER Red Mccombs Ford Grande Truck Center 
16550 IH35N Selma, DODGE JEEP RAM 8333 IH-10W, San 4562 IH-10 East, San 

Texas 78154 10807 IH-10 WEST SAN Antonio , TX 78230 Antonio , TX 78219 
ANTONIO. TX 78230 Same as above 

Production Cut-Off Date Not specified 512020 812( 1013112019 
last Day to Place Order Not specified 512020 412( 1013112019 
Firm Pricing Date Not specified YES Yes No 
Delivery Days Not specified 150-20( 180 185-240 

11 1 Ton Regular Cab DRW, 15' Stake Bed w/Uft Gate 4 
Price Each No Bid No Bid $58,000.00 $57,085.00 $53,000.00 No Bid No Bid $59,981 .00 
Price Total $232,000.00 $228,340.00 $212,000.00 $239,924.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered 2020 RAM 4500 REG. 2020 Ford F450 2020 International 2020 Ford F450 RIC 

CAB CV515 DRW 4x2 F4G 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) CUMMINS 6.7L 370 HP Ford 6.7l VS International 6.6l Ford 6.7L 4V OHV 

Powerstroke Turbo (Duramax) 350 HP 700 Power Stroke VS Turbo 
Diesel (450 hp@ 2800 lb-ft torque Diesel B20 330 HP 

rom) 
Warranty 3 YR/ 36,000 MILE B TO Ford 3 yr/36000 miles See attached document 36,000 miles or 36 

Band and with vehicle months 
5 YR I 100,000 MILE 5 yr/60000 mile specifications 

POWFRTRAIN nnwArtr::\in 
Warranty Service Provider Name & Address ANCIRA CHRYSLER Same as Above 1380 Ackerman Road, Grande Truck Center 

DODGE JEEP RAM San Antonio , TX 78219 4562 IH-10 East, San 
10807 IH-10 WEST SAN Peak Trailer Antonio , TX 78219 

ANTONIO, TX 78230 1605 Ackerman Road, 
~<>n .0.ntrinin T)( 7.1!.?1 Q 

Production Cut-Off Date 512020 8120 43830 1013112019 
last Day to Place Order 512020 4120 43814 1013112019 
Firm Pricing Date YES Yes No No 
Deliveru Davs 150-200 18 300 185-240 

516 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 10, 2019 
For: Light & Medium Duty Service Trucks Local Local Local Local Local Non•Local Local Local 

Gunn Nissan LTD. Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Ancira Chrysler Dodge Red Mccombs Ford Kyrish Truck Center Jim Bass Ford Inc Doggett Freightliner of Grande Truck Center 
Jeep Ram South Texas , LLC 

6100011605 IM 750NELoop410 16550 IH 35 N 10807 IH 10 West 8333 IH-10W 1380 Ackerman Road 4032 W. Houston Harte 8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH-10 East 
Expressway 

San Antonio , Selma, San Antonio , San Antonio, San Antonio , San Angelo , Converse, San Antonio, 
TX 78209 TX 78154 TX 78230 TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 76901 TX 78109 TX 78219 

Item Description Qty 1210. 599. snnn l?1n....r:;:aa_.r:;:nnn 210-558-1500 210-357-1418 21n....c;_~1 . A'1;71 't?<;_QAO.A~?1 

12 52K GVW 12 Cubic Yard Dump Truck 1 
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $115,840.00 No Bid $116,432.00 $132,871.00 
Price Total $115,840.00 $116,432.00 $132,871 .00 
Year, Make & Model Offered 2021 HV613 2020 Freightliner M2112 2020 Western Star 4700 

Meeting all specifications 
including automatic 

hn'lkP. svstP.m 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) International A26 475 HP Detroit Diesel - DD13 Detroit 0013 12.8L 470 

470 HP· 1650 LB/FT HP 
Warranty See attached warranty Chassis= 1 Year/100K 12 months or 100,000 

document with vehicle Miles miles 
specifications Engine"' 2 yrs/250K 

milAS 
Warranty Service Provider Name & Address Kyrish Truck Centers Chassis"' Doggett Grande Truck Center 

1380 Ackerman Road , Freightliner of South 4562 IH-10 East, San 
San Antonio , TX 78219 Texas, LLC Antonio , TX 78219 

Peak Traile1 87001H 10 East, 
1605 Ackerman Road , Converse Texas 78109 

San Antonio, TX 78219 Body "' Fox Truck World 
965 Farm to Market 

1516, San Antonio, TX 

Production Cut-Off Date $43,830.00 12/15/2019 10/31/2019 
Last Day to Place Order $43,814.00 10/15/2019 10/31/2019 
Firm Pricing Date No not specified No 
Delivery Days 150 120-210 210-260 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

Total: $160,245.52 $378,061 .60 $697,405 .00 $863,675.00 $327,840.00 $388,022.001 $116,432 .00 $956,923.00 

Total Award $160,245.52 $120,539.75 $161,605.00 $101,166.00 $327,840.00 
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