City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 13, 2019 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Radiator, Fuel Tanks, Heater Cores, Lone Star Radiator Co. Inc. Carlisle Auto Air Alamo City Truck Service Inc. |Rush Truck Centers of Texas
Coolers, & Evaporator Parts & Service LP
6100012269 JE_ |1227 Basse Road 6411 San Pedro 3410 E. Houston St PO Box 34630
Estimated |San Antonio,
ltem Description Annual |TX 78212 San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |210-732-7558 TX 78216 TX 78220 TX 78265
1 New Radiator Assemblies for Passenger Cars & Light Duty
Trucks
1A Parts Discount and Delivery
a Percent of Discount Offered 0% 0.00% No Bid No Bid
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Automotive Parts Distribution Pacific Best
Inc. (APDI)
c Type of Price Schedule Distributor N/A
d Price Schedule Number 6172019 N/A
e Date of Price Schedule June 17, 2019 N/A
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based CSA 6100012269 Net Price N/A
g Warranty 12 months from invoice date 1 Year
2 New Radiator Assemblies for Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks
Passenger Cars and Light Duty Trucks
2A Parts Discount and Delivery
a Percent of Discount Offered 0.00% 0.00% No Bid No Bid
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Active Radiator MFG Thermal Solutions
Manufacturing
c Type of Price Schedule Jobber N/A
d Price Schedule Number 10012019J0OB N/A
e Date of Price Schedule October 1, 2019 N/A
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based CSA 6100012269 Net Price N/A
g Warranty 12 Months from invoice date 1 Year
3 New Charge Air Coolers
3A Parts Discount and Delivery
a Percent of Discount Offered 0.00% 0.00% No Bid No Bid
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Active Radiator MFG Thermal Solutions
Manufacturing
c Type of Price Schedule Jobber N/A
d Price Schedule Number 10012019J0OB N/A
e Date of Price Schedule October 1, 2019 N/A
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based CSA 6100012269 Net Price N/A
g Warranty 12 months from invoice date 1 Year
4 Radiator, Heater Cores, Evaporators & A/C Condensers
4A1 Passenger Vehicles and Light Duty Trucks (1/2to 1 Ton,
Gasoline Engines Only)
1 Radiator 45
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $112.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $5,062.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Heater Core 10
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $89.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $890.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 13, 2019 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Radiator, Fuel Tanks, Heater Cores, Lone Star Radiator Co. Inc. Carlisle Auto Air Alamo City Truck Service Inc. [Rush Truck Centers of Texas
Coolers, & Evaporator Parts & Service LP
6100012269 JF |1227 Basse Road 6411 San Pedro 3410 E. Houston St. PO Box 34630
Estimated [San Antonio,
ltem Description Annual |TX 78212 San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |210-732-7558 TX 78216 TX 78220 TX 78265
3 Evaporator 5
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $89.00 $30.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $445.00 $150.00 No Bid No Bid
4 A/C Condenser 15
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $112.50 $30.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $1,687.50 $450.00 No Bid No Bid
4A/2 Light Duty Trucks (3/4 to 1 Ton, Diesel Only)
1 Radiator 15
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $2,925.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Heater Core 5
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $89.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $445.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Evaporator 5
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $89.00 $30.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $445.00 $150.00 No Bid No Bid
4 A/C Condenser 5
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $123.50 $30.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $617.50 $150.00 No Bid No Bid
4A/3 Medium Duty Trucks (24,001 to 33,000 GVWR): All Metal
Copper/Brass
1 Radiator 10
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $345.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $3,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Heater Core 2
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $290.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Evaporator 2
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $165.00 $40.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $330.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid
4 A/C Condenser 2
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $145.00 $40.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $290.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 13, 2019 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Radiator, Fuel Tanks, Heater Cores, Lone Star Radiator Co. Inc. Carlisle Auto Air Alamo City Truck Service Inc. |Rush Truck Centers of Texas
Coolers, & Evaporator Parts & Service LP
6100012269 JF |1227 Basse Road 6411 San Pedro 3410 E. Houston St. PO Box 34630
Estimated [San Antonio,
ltem Description Annual |TX 78212 San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |210-732-7558 TX 78216 TX 78220 TX 78265
4A/4 Medium Duty Trucks (24,001 to 33,000 GVWR): Plastic
Aluminum
1 Radiator 20
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $5,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Heater Core 2
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $290.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Evaporator 2
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $165.00 $40.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $330.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid
4 A/C Condenser 2
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $145.00 $40.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $290.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid
4A/5 Heavy Duty Trucks (33,000 and Above GVWR)
1 Radiator 25
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $565.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $14,125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Heater Core 5
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $165.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $825.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Evaporator 5
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $185.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $925.00 $250.00 No Bid No Bid
4 A/C Condenser 5
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $165.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $825.00 $250.00 No Bid No Bid
4A/6 Off Road Machinery (Up to 3' X 2' Radiator)
1 Radiator 3
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $675.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Heater Core 1
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $112.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $112.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Evaporator 1
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 13, 2019 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Radiator, Fuel Tanks, Heater Cores, Lone Star Radiator Co. Inc. Carlisle Auto Air Alamo City Truck Service Inc. [Rush Truck Centers of Texas
Coolers, & Evaporator Parts & Service LP
6100012269 JF |1227 Basse Road 6411 San Pedro 3410 E. Houston St. PO Box 34630
Estimated [San Antonio,
Item Description Annual [TX 78212 San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |210-732-7558 TX 78216 TX 78220 TX 78265
4 A/C Condenser 1
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $165.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $165.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4A/7 Off Road Machinery (Up to 4' X 4' Radiator)
1 Radiator 3
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $565.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $1,695.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Heater Core 1
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $165.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $165.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Evaporator 1
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $165.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $165.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 A/C Condenser 1
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $165.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $165.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4A/8 Off Road Machinery (Up to 6' X 5" Radiator)
1 Radiator 3
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $1,795.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $5,385.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Heater Core 1
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Evaporator 1
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 A/C Condenser 1
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $245.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $245.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5A Fuel Tanks (Clean & Repair)
1 Passenger Cars & Light Duty Trucks (Up to 1 Ton) 15
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $2.,025.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks (Up to 30 Gallon Capacity) 3
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $265.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
$795.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 13, 2019 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Radiator, Fuel Tanks, Heater Cores, Lone Star Radiator Co. Inc. Carlisle Auto Air Alamo City Truck Service Inc. |Rush Truck Centers of Texas
Coolers, & Evaporator Parts & Service LP
6100012269 JF |1227 Basse Road 6411 San Pedro 3410 E. Houston St. PO Box 34630
Estimated [San Antonio,
ltem Description Annual |TX 78212 San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |210-732-7558 TX 78216 TX 78220 TX 78265
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service
3 Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks (30-50 Gallon Capacity) 3
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $325.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $975.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks (Greater Than 50 Gallon 1
Capacity)
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $425.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $425.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6A Transmission External Coolers (Clean & Repair)
1 Passenger Cars & Light Duty Trucks (Up to 1 Ton, Gasoline 2
Engine Only)
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $168.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $337.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Light Duty Trucks (Up to 1 Ton, Diesel Engine Only) 2
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks Types (Up to 24" x 20" 2
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $265.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $530.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7A Hydraulic External Cooler (Clean & Repair)
1 Cooler Size 1' X 2' 2
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $168.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $337.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Cooler Size 2' X 2" 2
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Cooler Size 3' X 4' 2
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Cooler Size 4' X 4' 2
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $425.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8A Charge Air Coolers (clean and repair)
1 Passenger Cars & Light Duty Trucks (Up to 1 Ton, Gasoline 1
Engine Only)
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $185.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $185.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 13, 2019 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Radiator, Fuel Tanks, Heater Cores, Lone Star Radiator Co. Inc. Carlisle Auto Air Alamo City Truck Service Inc. |Rush Truck Centers of Texas
Coolers, & Evaporator Parts & Service LP
6100012269 JF |1227 Basse Road 6411 San Pedro 3410 E. Houston St. PO Box 34630
Estimated [San Antonio,
ltem Description Annual |TX 78212 San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |210-732-7558 TX 78216 TX 78220 TX 78265
2 Light Duty Trucks (3/4 to 1 Ton, Diesel Only) 10
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $2,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Medium Duty Trucks (24,001 to 33,000 GVWR) 10
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $245.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $2,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Heavy Duty Trucks (33,001 & Above GVWR) 6
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $325.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $1,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 Off Road Machinery 1
Price Each for Standard Labor & Service $465.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price for Standed Labor & Service $465.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
9A Warranty on Parts
1 New Radiator Assemblies for Passenger Cars & Light Duty
Trucks
Number of Months 12 months 12 months No Bid No Bid
2 New Radiator Cores for Passenger Cars & Light Duty Trucks
Number of Months 12 months 12 months No Bid No Bid
3 New Heater Assemblies for Passenger Cars & Light Duty
Trucks
Number of Months 12 months 12 months No Bid No Bid
4 New Radiator Assemblies for Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks
Number of Months 12 months 12 months No Bid No Bid
5 New Charge Air Coolers
Number of Months 12 months 12 months No Bid No Bid
10A Warranty on Service 12 months 12 months No Bid No Bid
1 Radiator, Heater Cores, Evaporators, & A/C Condenser
(Clean, Repair & Rod-Out)
Number of Months 3 months 12 months No Bid No Bid
2 Fuel Tanks (Clean & Repair)
Number of Months 3 months N/A No Bid No Bid
3 Transmission External Cooler (Clean & Repair)
Number of Months 3 months N/A No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 13, 2019 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Radiator, Fuel Tanks, Heater Cores, Lone Star Radiator Co. Inc. Carlisle Auto Air Alamo City Truck Service Inc. |Rush Truck Centers of Texas
Coolers, & Evaporator Parts & Service LP
6100012269 JF |1227 Basse Road 6411 San Pedro 3410 E. Houston St. PO Box 34630
Estimated [San Antonio,
ltem Description Annual |TX 78212 San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |210-732-7558 TX 78216 TX 78220 TX 78265
4 Hydraulic External Coolers (Clean & Repair)
Number of Months 3 months N/A No Bid No Bid
5 Charge Air Coolers (Clean & Repair)
Number of Months 3 months N/A No Bid No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount Net 30 Net 30 No Bid No Bid
Estimated Annual Total $101,995.40 $46,730.68 $0.00 $0.00
Estimated Annual Award $101,995.40
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