City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 31, 2020 Local Local Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Off Road Equipment Equipment Depot HoltCat Anderson Machinery|Associated Supply |Bobcat of San Cooper Equipment [H&E Equipment
Company, Inc. Co., Inc. dba, ASCO |Antonio Co. Services
Equipment
6100012410 LD |5250 N. Loop 1604 |[5665 SE Loop 410 (9415 NE Loop 410 (2102 E. Slayton Rd. {11146 IH 35 North  |17474 Judson Road |5327 Tex-Con Rd.
E.
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
TX 78247 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 79404-6800 TX 78233 TX 78247 TX 78220
210-225-1221 210-213-3143
1 DELETED:
2 Articulated Wheeled Loader / 1.0 Cubic 1
Yard Bucket:
Price Each: $75,926.00 $84,239.00 No Bid $79,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $75,926.00 $84,239.00 $79,250.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2020 New Holland 2020 Caterpillar 2020 Case 321 F
W8O0C - Identical to| 906M

Specific Make & Model of Engine
Offered (Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility
Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility
Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missina cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-
off date:

Case 321F
FPT F5HFL463A
F004, 70 hp

12 month/Unlimited
Hours

Equipment Depot
5250 N. Loop 1604
E., San Antonio,
TX 78247

120 Days

N/A

N/A

Yes|

Cat C3.3B DIT, 74
hp

24 mos/2000 hours,
total machine

HoltCat,

5665 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX
78222

150 Days

unknown

unknown

no

FPT F5H FL463A
F001, 70

12m/Unlimited Hr
Factory =}
24m/2000 Hr
ASCO Equipment

1920 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio

200 Days
6-14-2020

6-13-2020

No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 31, 2020 Local Local Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Off Road Equipment Equipment Depot HoltCat Anderson Machinery|Associated Supply |Bobcat of San Cooper Equipment [H&E Equipment
Company, Inc. Co., Inc. dba, ASCO |Antonio Co. Services
Equipment
6100012410 LD |5250 N. Loop 1604 |5665 SE Loop 410 [9415 NE Loop 410 |2102 E. Slayton Rd. {11146 IH 35 North |17474 Judson Road |5327 Tex-Con Rd.
E.
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
TX 78247 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 79404-6800 TX 78233 TX 78247 TX 78220
210-225-1221 210-213-3143
3 DELETED:
4 DELETED:
5 DELETED:
6 Wheeled Asphalt Paver: 1
Price Each: No Bid $171,545.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $214,953.00 No Bid
Total: $171,545.00 $214,953.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2020 Caterpillar| 2020 Dynapac
AP300F| F1800W
Specific Make & Model of Engine Cat C3.3B, 73.8 hp Deutz 2.9L Tier IV,
Offered (Include SAE net HP): 73 h.p.
Warranty: 12 mo/unlimited 12 months / 2000
hours, total machine Hours
Warranty Service Provider Facility HoltCat, Cooper Equipment
Name: Co.
Warranty Service Provider Facility 5665 SE Loop 410, 17474 Judson Rd.,
Address: San Antonio, TX| San Antonio, TX
78222 78247
Delivery: 150 Days 120 Days
Production Cut-off Date: unknown July 1, 2020
Last day order can be placed without unknown June 15, 2020
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut- no Yes (Until October
off date: 1, 2020)
7 DELETED:
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total Award: $75,926.00, $171,545.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Deleted items 1, 3, 4, 5 and 7 will be bid at a later date.

Prepared by Purchasing 5/1/2020
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 31, 2020 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local
For: Off Road Equipment H&V Equipment Harris County Nueces Power RDO Equipment Co.|[Romco Equipment |[Waukesha-Pearce
Services, Inc. Rentals dba Texas |Equipment Company Industries, LLC
State Rentals
6100012410 LD 3307 S.E. Loop 410 (803 SE Loop 410 {4697 FM 1516 North|19275 N. IH 35 1042 SE Loop 410 |3740 SE Loop 410
Item Description QTY [San Antonio, San Antonio, Converse, New Braunfels, San Antonio, San Antonio,
TX 78222 TX 78220 TX 78109 TX 78132 TX 78222 TX 78222
1 DELETED:
2 Articulated Wheeled Loader / 1.0 Cubic 1
Yard Bucket:
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $78,600.00 No Bid No Bid
Total: $78,600.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2020 John Deere
244L
Specific Make & Model of Engine Yanmar 4TNV98CT
Offered (Include SAE net HP): (71 HP)
Warranty: 2 year or 2000
hours

Warranty Service Provider Facility
Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility
Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missina cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-
off date:

RDO Equipment Co.

19275 N. IH 35,
New Braunfels,
TX 78132

120 Days
9-30-2020
4-30-2020

No

Prepared by Purchasing 5/1/2020
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Opened:
For:

6100012410

January 31, 2020

Off Road Equipment

LD

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Local

Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Local

Local

Item

Description

QTY

H&V Equipment
Services, Inc.

3307 S.E. Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78222

Harris County
Rentals dba Texas
State Rentals

803 SE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78220

Nueces Power
Equipment

4697 FM 1516 North

Converse,
TX 78109

RDO Equipment Co.

19275 N. I1H 35

New Braunfels,
TX 78132

Romco Equipment
Company

1042 SE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78222

Waukesha-Pearce
Industries, LLC

3740 SE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78222

DELETED:
DELETED:
DELETED:

Wheeled Asphalt Paver:
Price Each:

Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine
Offered (Include SAE net HP):
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility
Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility
Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-
off date:

DELETED:

Payment Terms:

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

Net 30

Total Award:

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Deleted items 1, 3, 4, 5 and 7 will be bid at a later date.

Prepared by Purchasing 5/1/2020
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