City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 23, 2020 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Local
Annual Contract for Aerial Photography for San Antonio |US Executive LLC Aerial Data Service, Inc. Air Data Solutions LLC Injoy Media Transglobal Services LLC |United Geo Technologies LLC
For: Airport Systems
6100013324 MAB 401 E. Jackson St. Ste 2340-D |2448 E. 81st Street, Ste. 5000 |351 Pasiano Drive 9714 Mid Walk Drive 1100 Macon Stree 7715 Mainland, Suite 110
Estimated |[Tampa, Tulsa, George West, San Antonio, Fort Worth, San Antonio,
Annual FL 33602 OK 74137 TX 78022 TX 78230 TX 76102 TX 78250
ltem Description Quantity |(877) 290-3153
1 Aerial Photography for San Antonio
International Airport 53"x42"
la: Flight Master Print 1
Unit Price: $2,695.00 $4,945.00 $290.00 No Bid $6,990.00 $6,695.00
Extended Price $2,695.00 $4,945.00 $290.00 $6,990.00 $6,695.00
1b: Addt'l Color Prints 15
Unit Price: $225.00 $200.00 $275.00 No Bid $100.00 $175.00
Extended Price $3,375.00 $3,000.00 $4,125.00 $1,500.00 $2,625.00
1c: Digital Copy 1
Unit Price: $0.00 $5.00 $2,359.13 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
Extended Price $0.00 $5.00 $2,359.13 $0.00 $0.00
2 Aerial Photography for Stinson Municipal
Airport 38"x38"
2a: Flight Master Print 1
Unit Price: $2,595.00 $2,950.00 $280.00 No Bid $4,870.00 $4,855.00
Extended Price $2,595.00 $2,950.00 $280.00 $4,870.00 $4,855.00
2b: Addt'l Color Prints 10
Unit Price: $150.00 $160.00 $270.00 No Bid $100.00 $150.00
Extended Price $1,500.00 $1,600.00 $2,700.00 $1,000.00 $1,500.00
2c: Digital Copy 1
Unit Price: $0.00 $5.00 $1,852.87 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
Extended Price $0.00 $5.00 $1,852.87 $0.00 $0.00
Sub-Total $10,165.00 $12,505.00 $11,607.00 No Bid $14,360.00 $15,675.00
Prompt Payment Discount $0.00 $250.10 $1,160.70 $0.00 $627.00
Sub-Total with Prompt Payment Discount
$10,165.00 $12,254.90 $10,446.30 $14,360.00 $15,048.00
Percentage between lowest responsive
bid and local bid: 48.04%
Price differential $4,883.00
Payment Terms Net 30 2% 15 Days 10% 15 Days Net 30 4%, 15 days
Estimated Annual Total $10,165.00 $12,254.90 $10,446.30 No Bid $14,360.00 $15,048.00

Estimated Annual Award

$10,165.00




