
LC 
01/14/21 
Item No. 7 

ORDINANCE 20 21- 0 1 - 1 4 - 0 0 0; 
APPROVING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING UNIT 
PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL 
COST OF $461,400.00, INCLUDED IN THE RESPECTIVE 
DEPARTMENT'S FY 2021 ADOPTED BUDGET: (A) RIVER BIRCH WAY, 
LLC, DBA BATTERIES PLUS BULBS, AND GENUlNE PARTS 
COMPANY, DBA NAPA AUTO PARTS, FOR AUTOMOTIVE, 
INDUSTRIAL, AND UTILITY BATTERIES; AND (B) ASK REPLY, INC., 
DBA B2GNOW, FOR DIVERSITY MANAGEMENT SOFTWARE FOR 
THE ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and 
services on an annual contract basis; and 

WHEREAS, the Texas Local Government Code indicates that competitive bidding is not required 
under section 252.022(a)(7)(A), which provides for any items that are available only from a sole 
source of supply; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves: (A) low bid contracts with River Birch Way, LLC, dba 
Batteries Plus Bulbs, and Genuine Parts Company, dba NAPA Auto Parts, for automotive, 
industrial, and utility batteries; and (B) a sole source contract with Ask Reply, Inc ., dba B2GNow, 
for diversity management software for the Economic Development Department; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The following bids to furnish the City with goods and services on an annual basis 
as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon 
the deposit of ap required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements: 
(A) River Birch Way, LLC, dba Batteries Plus Bulbs, and Genuine Parts Company, dba NAPA 
Auto Parts, for automotive, industrial, and utility batteries; and (B) Ask Reply, Inc., dba B2GNow, 
for diversity management software for the Economic Development Department. The bid tabulation 
sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids 
are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department. 

SECTION 2. Funds will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders, and payment is 
authorized to the vendors identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the Fiscal 
Year 2021 budget, and such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through their 
terms as evidenced by subsequent ordinances. 

SECTION 3. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 
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PASSED and APPROVED this 14th day of January, 2021. 

R 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

~ ~----
~ drew Segovia, City Attorney 

/ 
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Fi/eNumber: 20- 7160 

Item: 7 

File Number: 20-7160 

City of San Antonio 

City Council 

January 14, 2021 

Enactment Number: 202 1-0 /-14-0003 

Enactment Number: 
2021-01-14-0003 

Ordinance approvmg the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services 

for an estimated annual cost of $461 ,400.00, included in the respective department's FY 

2021 Adopted Budget: 

(A) River Birch Way, LLC, dba Batteries Plus Bulbs, and Genuine Parts Company, dba 

NAPA Auto Parts, for automotive, industrial , and utility batteries; and 

(B) Ask Reply, Inc. , dba B2GNOW, for diversity management software for the Economic 

Development Department. 

[Ben Gorzell , Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance] 

Councilmember John Courage made a motion to approve. Councilmember Melissa Cabello 

Havrda seconded the motion. The motion passed by the following vote: 

Aye: 11 Nirenberg, Trevino, Andrews-Sullivan, Yiagran, Rocha Garcia, 

Gonzales, Cabello Havrda, Sandoval, Pelaez, Courage and Perry 

Office of the City Clerk Printed 011 1/14/1 1 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation Exhibit I 

Opened: August 10, 2020 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local 

For: Annual Contract for Automot;..,e, Industrial, River Birch Way, LLC dba Genuine Parts Company Arnold Oil Company Austin, Gonzalez Auto Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio Rush Truck Centers of South Texas Auto Parts Iwor1d Tire Unlimited 

and UUity Batteries Batteries Plus Bulbs (NAPA) LP Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Companydba M&M Auto & 
Center• San Antonio Truck Parts (NAPA) 

6100012951 JF 6891 Bandera Rd. 6374 Rittman Rd . 8423 Eastern 4220 San Bernando Ave. 902 Chulie Drive 8922 IH 10 East 20475 Hwy46 W, Ste. 340 1' 3080 VS HWY 281 North 

Est. San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Laredo, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring BrMch, San Antonio, 
Annual TX 78238 TX 78217 TX 78216 TX 78041 TX 78216 TX 78109 TX 78070 TX 78216 

Item I Oescrl,ptlon "--- l ,,.. , n,,.,,_n,n1 

AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES 
Manufacturer Name of Batteries Offered : I I I Johnson Controls! I East Penni East Penn ManufactulT!g 

Brand Name of Batteries Offered: Continental TRP NAPA Batteries 

Group:U1-L 40 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ O"F Min .): 235 
Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80° Min.): 25 
Quoted Reservedd Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) ~j 25 30 25 250 No Bid 25 N/A 

SupPtief Code# SLIU1 8223 U1-230 U1-L SP-30 8223 8221 

Unit Price $25.9 $29.59 $51 .39 $38 .00 $31 .09 $33.24 $30.91 

Extended Price $1 ,038 .00 $1,183.60 $2,055.60 $1,520.00 $1,243.60 $1 ,329.60 $1,236.40 

Core Charge Price $6.00 $9.00 $5.88 $6,00 $8.00 $9.00 $10,00 

Total Extended Core Charge Price $240.00 $360.00 $235.20 $240.00 $320.00 $360.00 $400.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $1,278 .00 $1,543.60 $2,290.80 $1,760.00 $1,563.60 $1,689.60 $1,636.40 

Group: U1-R 10 
Volts. 12 
CCA (@ O"F Min .): 235 
Reserve Capacity {Mil. @ so• Min.): 25 
Quoted Reservedd Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) 

] 
25 27 25 250 No Bid 25 NJA 

Supplief' Code# SLIU1 8224 U1R-230 U1-R SP-30R 8224 8221R 

Unit Price $25.9 $29.59 $51 .39 $39.00 $31.09 $33.24 $30.43 
Extended Price $259.50 $295.90 $513,90 $390.00 $310.90 $332.40 $304.30 

Core Charge Price $6 .00 $9.00 $5.88 $6.00 $8.00 $9.00 $10.00 

Total Extended Core Charge Price $60.00 $90.00 $58 .80 $60.00 $80.00 $90.00 $100,00 

Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $319.50 $385.90 $572.70 $450.00 $390.90 $422.40 $404,30 

Group : 4D 15 
Volts: 12 
CCA {@O"F Min .): 1000 
Reserve Caoacitv (Min, @ so• Min.\: 320 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) ~1 320 335 290 1000 320 320 290 
Supplier Code # Sll40 7266 4DS 4D 40-XHD BT4DP101 7266 7266 

Unit Price $113.75 $135.46 146.77 139 $113.14 $186.44 $144 .28 $176.60 
Extended Price $1 ,706.2 $2,031 .90 $2,201 .55 $2,085.00 $1 ,697,10 $2,796.60 $2,164.20 $2,649.00 

Core Charge Price $36,00 $54.00 $35 .30 $45.00 $60.00 $59 .00 $54 .00 $60 .00 

Total Extended Core Charge Price $540.00 $810.00 $529.50 $675.00 $900.00 $885.00 $810.00 $900.00 

Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $2.246.25 $2,641 .90 $2,731 .05 $2,760.00 $2,597.10 $3,681 .60 $2,974 .20 $3,549.00 

Group: 4DL T Volts: 12 20 
CCA {@ O"F Min .): 810 
Reserve Capacity (Mi'! .@ so• Min.): 250 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min . @ 25 AMPS) RC 240 250 235 185 860 250 250 240 
Supplier Code# SLl4DLT 7251 4DLTHD 4DLT 4DLT-VHD BT4DLTP81 7251 7251 

Unit Price $102.00 $112.46 $131.23 $130.00 $95.54 $151 .25 $123.94 $149.92 

Extended Price $2,040.00 $2,249.20 $2,624 .60 $2,600.00 $1 ,910.80 $3,025.00 $2,478.80 $2,998.40 

Core Charge Price $36 .00 $36.00 $35.30 $45.00 $60.00 $39 .00 $36 .00 $40.00 
Total Elctended Core Charge Price $720.00 $720.00 $706.00 $900.00 $1,200.00 $780.00 $720.00 $800.00 

Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $2,760.00 $2,969.20 $3,330.60 $3,500.00 $3,110.80 $3,805.00 $3,198.80 $3.798.40 

Group: SD Volts: 12 40 
CCA (@ O"F Min .): 1300 
Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80" Min.): 435 

Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) ~1 435 420 380 1400 435 435 325 
Supplier Code# SLISD 7669 BOS 8D7 SD-MHD BT8DP111 7271FT 7269 
Unit Price $124 .75 $158.86 $186.59 $184.00 $139.82 $180.65 $168.16 $197.90 
Extended Price $4,990.00 $6,354.40 $7 ,463.60 $7,360.00 $5,592.80 $7,226.00 $6,726.40 $7,916.00 
Core Charge Price $48.00 $72.00 $35.30 $45.00 $60.00 $79.00 $72.00 $80.00 
Total Extended Core Charge Price $1,920.00 $2,880.00 $1,412.00 $1,800.00 $2,400.00 $3,160.00 $2.880.00 $3,200.00 

Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $6,910.00 $9,234.40 $8,875.60 $9,160.00 $7,992.80 $10,386.00 $9,606.40 $11,116.00 

Group: 24 Volts: 12 50 
CCA (@ 0°F MWl .): 525 
Reserve Caoacitv (Min. IZi! so• MWJ.): 90 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (MWJ.@ 25 AMPS) RC 115 115 113 95 530 90 120 115 
Supplier Code # Sll24 7524 24S 24P M-24 BT24P51 7524 7524 
Unit Price $53 .50 $69.42 $70 .58 $59 .00 $47 .44 $74 .95 $72.75 $90.93 
Extended Price $2,675.00 $3.471 .00 $3,529.00 $2,950.00 $2,372.00 $3,747.50 $3,637,50 $4,546.50 
Core Charge Price $12 .00 $18.00 $12.94 $15.00 $20.00 $29.00 $18.00 $20.00 
Total Extended CMe Charge Price $600.00 $900.00 $647.00 $750.00 $1,000.00 $1,450.00 $900.00 $1,000.00 

Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $3,275.00 $4,371 .00 $4,176.00 $3,700.00 $3,372.00 $5.197.50 $4.537.50 $5,546.50 

Group: 24 Deep Cycle Volts: 12 
CCA (@ O"F Min,): 500 
Reserve Capacity (Min.@ 80° Min.): 120 

Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) RC 130 120 125 120 550 No Bid 120 120 
Supplier Code# SLl24MDC 8240 M24DC TM24 M-24DC 8240 8240 
Unit Price $65.16 $69.75 $80 .31 $74 .00 $60.31 $74.43 $89 .28 
Extended Price $325.80 $348.75 $401 .55 $370.00 $301.55 $372.15 $446.40 
Core Charge Price $12.00 $18.00 $12.94 $15.00 $20.00 $18.00 $20 .00 
Total Extended Core Charge Price $60.00 $90.00 $64.70 $75.00 $100.00 $90.00 $100.00 
Total (Extended Pl'i!:i! + E_xt.e~_aj Core Charge) $385.80 ____ $438.75 $466.25 __ ____1445.00 $401 .55 $462.15 ____1546.40 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

:Opened, A,g,st 10, 2020 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Loca l 
For: Annual Contract fOf Automotrle, Industrial, Rivel' Birch Wa~. LLC dba Genuine Parts Company Arnold Oil Company Austin, Gonzalez Auto Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio Rush Truck Centers of South Texas Auto Parts !World Tio-e Unlimited 

and Utility Batteries Batteries Plus Bulbs (NAPA) LP Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Company dba M&M Auto & 
Center • San Antonio Truck Parts (NAPA} 

6100012951 ~ 6891 Bandera Rd. 6374 Rittiman Rd. 8423 Eastern 4220 San Bernando Ave. 902 Chulie Drive 8922 IH 10 East 20475 Hwy 46 W, Ste. 340 113080 VS HWY281 North 
Est. San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Laredo, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch , San Antonio, 

, ~~~~ TX 78238 TX 78217 TX 78216 TX 78041 TX 78216 TX 78109 TX 78070 TX 78216 
Item I Description - - ,., ,,.,, n. ~,.,,.,_nani: 

IGroup: 24F Volts: 12 
I 

CCA (@ O"F Min.): 525 
Reserve Capacity (Mr! . @ 80" Mr!.): 80 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min .@ 25 AMPS) 

~~ 
80 113 90 530 No Bid 115 115 

Supplief Code# SLl24FM 7524F 24FS 24FP M-24F 7524F 7524F 
Unit Price $67 .50 $75.24 $70 .58 $59.00 $48.48 $79 .39 $92.98 
Extended Price $337 .50 $376.20 $352.90 $295.00 $242.40 $396.95 $464.90 
Core Charge Price $12.00 $18.00 $12.94 $15.00 $20.00 $18.00 $20 .00 
Total Extended COfe Charge Price $60.0 $90.00 $64 .70 $75.00 $100.00 $90.00 $100.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $397.50 $466.20 $417 .60 $370.00 $342.40 $486.95 $564.90 

Group: 26 20 No Bid 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ O"F Min .): 525 
Reserve Capacity (Min.@ 80" Min.): 80 

Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min .@ 25 AMPS) RC 80 80 85 525 No Bid 80 80 
Supplier Code # SU26 7526 26S MT-26 7526 7526 
Unit Price $45.50 $74 .14 $66 .14 $60.89 $81.59 $99.48 
Extended Price $910.00 $1,482 .80 $1.322.80 $1,217 .80 $1.631 .80 $1.989.60 
Core Charge Price $12 .00 $18 .00 $12 .94 $20.00 $18.00 $20.00 
Total Extended COfe Charge POCC $240.00 $360.00 $258.80 $0.00 $400.00 $360.00 $400.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $1 ,150.00 $1 ,842.80 $1 .581 .60 S0.00 $1 .617.80 $1,991 .80 $2,389.60 

10 I Group: 26R Volts: 12 15 
CCA (@ O"F Min.): 525 
Reserve Capacity (Min . @ so• Min.): 80 

Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) RC 80 80 85 75 550 No Bid 80 80 
Supplier Code# SLl26R 7526R 26RS 26R MT-26R 7526R 7526R 
Unit Price $45.50 $71.23 $66.14 $60.00 $60.94 $76.67 $93.33 
Extended Price $682.50 $1 ,068.45 $992.10 $900.00 $914 .10 $1,150.05 $1,399.95 
Core Charge Price $12.00 $18.00 $12.94 $15.00 $20.00 $18.00 $20.00 
Total Extended Co,e Charge Price $180.00 $270.00 $194.10 $225.00 $300.00 $270.00 $300.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $862.50 $1.338.45 $1 ,186.20 $1.125.00 $1,214.10 $1,420.05 $1 ,699.95 

11 IGroup: 27 Volts: 12 50 
CCA (@ O"F Min .): 600 
Reserve Capacily (Min . @ 80" Min.): 120 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) RC 140 120 170 140 700 120 120 120 
Supplier Code # SLl27 7527 27SOC 27CS M-27 BT27P71 7527 7527 
Unit Price $61.95 $66.10 $86.36 $73.00 $65.00 $103 .96 $76.64 $95.80 
Extended Price $3.097 .50 $3,305.00 $4 ,318.00 $3,650.00 $3,250.00 $5,198.00 $3,832.00 $4,790.00 
Core Charge Price $12.00 $18 .00 $12.94 $15.00 $20.00 $29.00 $18.00 $20.00 
Total Extended COfe Charge Price $600.00 $900.00 $647.00 $750.00 $1 ,000.00 $1,450.00 $900.00 $1 ,000.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $3,697 .50 $4,205.00 $4,965.00 $4,400.00 $4 ,250.00 $6,648.00 $4 ,732.00 $5.790.00 

12 IGroup: 27 Deep Cycle Volts: 12 30 
CCA (@ O"F Min.): 575 
Reserve Capacily(Min. @ so• Min.): 160 

Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) RC175 160 160 155 675 No Bid 160 150 
Supplief Code # SLl27MOC 8270 M270C TM27 M-27HDC 8270 8270 
Unit Price $74.00 $71 .24 $92.67 $82.00 $62.20 $76.32 $95.40 
Extended Price $2,220.00 $2,137.20 $2,780.10 $2,460.00 $1,866.00 $2,289.60 $2,862.00 
Core Charge Price $12 .00 $18 .00 $12 .94 $15.00 $20.00 $18 .00 $20.00 
Total Extended COfe Charge Price $360.00 $540.00 $388.20 $450.00 $600.00 $540.00 $600.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $2,580.00 $2,677.20 $3,168.30 $2,910.00 $2,466.00 $2,829.60 $3,462.00 

13 IGroup: 31S Volts: 12 30 
CCA (@ O"F Min.): 750 
Reserve Capacity (Min . @ 80" Min.): 180 

Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) RC 175 180 180 165 1000 180 180 175 
Supplier Code # SLl31SA 7236 31C950T 31S M-31SHC BT31572 31-7236 7236 
Unit Price $62.50 $87.99 $105.58 $85.00 $63.32 $72 .99 $69.99 $121.81 
Extended Price $1,875.00 $2,639.70 $3,167.40 $2,550.00 $1.899.60 $2.189.70 $2,099.70 $3,654.30 
Core Charge Price $20.00 $27 .00 $21.18 $26.00 $30.00 $29.00 $27.00 $30 .00 
Total Extended COfe Charge Price $600.00 $810.00 $635.40 $780.00 $900.00 $870.00 $810.00 $900.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $2,475.00 $3,449.70 $3 ,802.80 $3.330.00 $2,799.60 $3,059.70 $2,909.70 $4,554.30 

14 I Group: 34 20 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ o•F Min.): 660 
Reserve Capacity (M r!. @80" Min .): 115 

Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) RC 110 115 100 120 685 No Bid 115 110 
Supplier Code # SLl34 7534 34S 34CS M-34HC 7534 7534 
Unit Price $60 .35 $72 .53 $79.06 $65.00 $61.26 $75.78 $94.68 
Extended Price $1.207.00 $1,450.60 $1 ,58 1.20 $1 ,300.00 $1,225.20 $1,515.60 $1,893.60 
Core Charge Price $12 .00 $18.00 $12 .94 $15.00 $20.00 $18.00 $20.00 
Total Extended COfe Charge Price $240.00 $360.00 $258.80 $300.00 $400.00 $0.00 $360.00 $400.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $1,447.00 $1 ,810.60 $1 ,840.00 $1 ,600.00 $1,625.20 $0.00 $1 ,875.60 $2,293.60 

Page2 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulatlon 

Opened: August 10, 2020 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Locat Non-Local Local 
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Indu strial, River Birch Way, LLC dba Genuine Parts Company Arnold m Company Austin, Gonzalez Auto Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio Rush Truck Centers of South Texas Auto PNts IWork:l Tire Unli'nited 

and Utility Batteries Batteries Plus Bulbs (NAPA) LP Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Company dba M&M Auto & 
Center · San Antor,io Truck Parts {NAPA\ 

6100012951 JF 6891 Bandera Rd . 6374 Rittiman Rd. 8423 Eastern 4220 San Bernando A11e. 902 Chutie Drive 8922 IH 10 East 20475 Hwy46 W, Sie. 340 113080 VS HWY281 North 

~ San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Laredo, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch, San Antonio, 
Annual TX 78238 TX 78217 TX 78216 TX 78041 TX 78216 TX 78109 TX 78070 TX 78216 

ttem I Group: 36R 

Description I Usage 12101647-n•M 
15 30 

Volts: 12 
CCA (@ O"F Min .): 650 
Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80" Min.): 115 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) RC 120 130 130 130 650 No Bid 120 120 
Supplier Code # SU36R 7536R 36RPS 36R MT-36R 7536R 7536R 
Unit Price $67 .70 $67 .95 $101 .96 $79 .00 $73.79 $75.68 $94 .60 
EKtended Price $2,031 .00 $2,038.50 $3,058.80 $2,370.00 $2 ,213.70 $2.270.40 $2,838.00 
Core Charge Pnc:e $12 .00 $18 .00 $12 .94 $15 .00 $20.00 $18 .00 $20 .00 
Total Extended Core Charge Price $360.00 $540.00 $388.20 $450.00 $600.00 $0.00 $540.00 $600.00 
Total (Extended pnc:e + Extended Core Charge) $2,391 .00 $2.578.50 $3.447 .00 $2,820.00 $2,813.70 $0.00 $2.810.40 $3,438.00 

16 !Group: 40R 30 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0GF Min.): 590 
Reserve Capacity (Mrl . @ so· Min .): 105 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) 

""l 
105 120 120 590 No Bid 105 105 

Supplier Code# SLl40RT6M 7540R 40RPS 40RCS MT-40R 7540R 7540R 
Unit Price $63 .68 $65.97 $100.49 $73.00 $73.22 $74 .96 $93.76 
Extended Pri:e $1,910.40 $1 ,979.10 $3,014.70 $2,190.00 $2,196.60 $2,248.80 $2.812.80 
Core Charge Price $12 .00 $18 .00 $12.94 $15.00 $20.00 $18 .00 $20.00 
Total Extended Core Charge Price $360.00 $540.00 $388.20 $450.00 $600.00 $0.00 $540.00 $600.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $2,270.40 $2,519.10 $3.402.90 $2,640.00 $2,796.60 $0.00 $2 ,788.80 $3,412.80 

17 !Group: 48 70 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ Q4 F Min.): 700 
Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80" Min.): 135 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) 

""! 
135 140 130 730 No Bid 135 120 

Supplier Code# Sll48H6M 75'8 48S L3/H4/48CP MTP-48/H6-1 75'8 75'8 
Unit Price $74 .7 $79.99 $103.34 $76 .00 $93.24 $85.79 $109.73 
Extended Price $5,232.5 $5,599.30 $7 ,233.80 $5,320.00 $6,526.80 $6,005.30 $7,681 .10 
Core Charge Price $12 .00 $18 .00 $12 .94 $15.00 $20.00 $18.00 $20 .00 
Total Extended Core Charge Price $840.00 $1,260.00 $905.80 $1 .050.00 $1,400.00 $0.00 $1 .260.00 $1,400.00 
Tolal (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $6,072.50 $6,859.30 $8.139.60 $6,370.00 $7,926.80 $0.00 $7.265.30 $9,081.10 

18 IGroup : 49 70 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0GF Min.): 800 
Reserve Capacity (Min. @ so• Min .): 135 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) 

""l 
185 130 140 850 No Bid 185 185 

Supplier Code # Sll49H8M 75'9 49S l5/H8/49CP M-49/H8 75'9 75'9 
Unit Price $84.25 $94.25 $105.51 $85 .00 $86.31 $94.29 $109.46 
Extended Price $5,897.50 $6.597.50 $7,385.70 $5,950.00 $6.041.70 $6,600.30 $7,662.20 
Core Charge Pnc:e $12 .00 $18 .00 $12 .94 $15.00 $20.00 $18.00 $20.00 
Total Extended Core Charge Price $840.00 $1.260.00 $905.80 $1 ,050.00 $1,400.00 so.oo $1 ,260.00 $1.400.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $6,737.50 $7 ,857.50 $8.291 .50 $7,000.00 $7 ,441 .70 $0.00 $7 ,860.30 $9,062.20 

19 I Group: 51R 20 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min.): 400 
Reserve Capacity (Min. @ so• Min.): 70 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) RC70 70 75 70 425 No Bid 75 751 
Supplier Code# SU51R 7551R 51RS 51RCS M-51R 7551R 7551R 
'Unit Price $43 .76 $78.62 $68.08 $57 .00 $54.93 $78.86 $98 .57 
Extended Price $875.20 $1 ,572.40 $1,361 .60 $1 ,140.00 $1 ,098.60 $1 ,577.20 $1 ,971.40 
Core Charge Price $12 .00 $18.00 $12.94 $15.00 $20.00 $18 .00 $20.00 
Total Extended Core Charge Price $240.00 $360.00 $258.80 $300.00 $400.00 $0.00 $360.00 $400.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $1,115.20 $1,932.40 $1,620.40 $1,440.00 $1,498.60 $0.00 $1,937.20 $2.371.40 

20 !Group: 58 15 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min.): 540 
Reserve Capacty (Min . @ 80 4 Mil.): 75 

Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min . @ 25 AMPS) RC85 75 80 80 540 No Bid 75 75 
Supplier Code# Sll58 7558 58S sacs MT-58 7558 7558 
Unit Price $47.45 $69.95 $70.78 $62 .00 $62.87 $79 .65 $98.57 
Extended Price $711.75 $1,049.25 $1,061 .70 $930.00 $943.05 $1.194.75 $1,478.55 
Core Charge Price $12 .00 $18.00 $12.94 $15 .00 $20.00 $18 .00 $20.00 
Total Extended Core Charge Pri:::e $180.00 $270.00 $194 .10 $225.00 $300.00 $0.00 $270.00 $300.00 
Total (Extended pnc:e + Extended Core Charge) $891 .75 $1 ,319.25 $1 ,255.80 $1 ,155.00 $1.243.05 $0.00 $1 ,464.75 $1,778.55 

21 IGroup: 58R 60 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0°F Min.): 540 
Reserve Capacity (Mn . @ 80" Min.): 75 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) RC85 85 80 100 575 No Bid 85 851 
Supplier Code# SLl58R 7558R 58RS 58RCS MT-58R 7558R 7558R 
UnitPnc:e $47 .45 $78.62 $70.78 $65.00 $64 .72 $80.65 $99.56 
Extended Price $2,847.00 $4,717.20 $4,246.80 $3,900.00 $3,883.20 $4.839.00 $5,973.60 
Core Charge Price $12.00 $18.00 $12.94 $15.00 $20.00 $18.00 $20.00 
Total Extended Core Charge Price $720.00 $1,080.00 $776.40 $900.00 $1,200.00 $0.00 $1,080.00 $1,200.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $3,567.00 $5,797 .20 $5,023.20 $4,800.00 $5,063.20 $0.00 $5.919.00 $7,173.60 

Page l 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulatlon 

Opened; August 1 0, 2020 local Local Non-local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local l ocal 
For: An nual Cootract for Automotive, Industrial, River Birch Way, LLC dba Genuine Parts Company Arnold Oil Company Austin, Gonzalez Auto Pans IBS of Paseo Del Rio Rush Truck Centers of South Texas Auto Parts 1wortd Tire Unlimited 

and Utility Batteries Batteries Plus Bulbs (NAPA) LP Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Company dba M&M Auto & 
Center • San Antonio Truck Parts /NAPA) 

6100012951 JF 6891 Bandera Rd. 6374 Rittman Rd . 8423 Eastern 4220 San Bemando Ave. 902 Chulie Olive 8922 IH 10 East 20475Hwy46W , Ste. 340 1' 3080VSHWY281 North 
~ San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Laredo, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch, San Antonio, 
I Annual TX78238 TX 78217 TX 78216 TX 78041 TX 78216 TX 78109 TX 78070 TX 78216 

ttem Desc ription •- ,~, ·•~ ••n"- 1,,.,1m4??-nQnf. 
22 Group: 65 1 1100 

Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min .); 750 
Reserve Capacity (Min. @ 80" Min .): 150 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) RC 150 150 160 130 850 150 150 150 
Supplier Code # SLl65M 7565 65GHR160 65P M-65HC BT65P81 7565 7565 
Unit Price $63.44 $78.57 $111 .22 $69.00 $71 .64 $97 .63 $82.15 $108.93 
Extended Price $69.784.00 $86.427 .00 $122,342.00 $75,900.00 $78,804.00 $107,393.00 $90,365.00 $119,823.00 
Core Charge Price $12.00 $18.00 $12.94 $15.00 $20.00 $20 .00 $18.00 $20.00 
Total Extended Core Charge Price $13.200.00 $19,800.00 $14 ,234 .00 $16,500.00 $22,000 .00 $22,000.00 $19.800.00 $22,000.00 
Total (Extended price+ Ex:r.ended Core Charge) $82.984 .00 $106.227 .00 $136,576.00 $92 ,400.00 $100.804.00 $129,393.00 $110,165.00 $141,823.00 

23 I Group: 75 200 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min .): 525 
Reserve Capacity (Min.@ eo• Min .): 90 

Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) RC 90 No Bid 90 95 550 No Bid 90 90 
Supplier Code# SLl75 75S 75CS M-75 7575 7575 
Unit Price $47 .60 $79.41 $70 .00 $58.31 $69.75 $90.93 
Extended Price $9,520.00 $15,882.00 $14,000 .00 $11 ,662 .00 $13 ,950.00 $18,186.00 
Core Charge Price $12 .00 $12.94 $15 .00 $20.00 $18 .00 $20.00 
Total Extended Core Charge Price $2.400.00 $0.00 $2 .588.00 $3,000.00 $4 ,000.00 $0.00 $3,600.00 $4 ,000.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $11 ,920.00 $0.00 $18 ,470 .00 $17 ,000 .00 $15.662 .00 $0.00 $17 ,550.00 $22,186.00 

24 IGroup: 78 100 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min.): 600 
Reserve Capacity (Min . @ 80• Min.): 105 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) RC 115 No Bid 110 120 680 105 110 110 
Supplier Code # SLl78 78S 78P M-78 BT78P61 7578 7578 
Unit Price $49.68 $81 .94 $68.00 $58 .71 $86.33 $74 .55 $96 .93 
Extended Price $4 ,968.00 $8 ,194.00 $6.800.00 $5,871 .00 $8,633.00 $7,455.00 $9,693.00 
Core Charge Price $12 .00 $12.94 $15.00 $20.00 $20.00 S18 .00 $20.00 
Total Extended Core Charge Pnc:e $1 ,200.00 $0.00 $1 ,294 .00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1 ,800.00 $2.000.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $6,168.00 $0.00 $9,488.00 $8,300.00 $7 ,871 .00 $10,633 .00 $9,255.00 $11 ,693 .00 

25 [Group : 78 Dual Terminal 100 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min .): 770 
Reserve Capacity (Mr\. @ so• Min.): 120 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) RC 115 No Bid 115 115 780 No Bid 120 115 
Supplier Code # SLl34/78DT 78DTPS 34f78CS M-78DT 843478 8534(78 
Unit Price $57 .44 $100.54 $78 .00 $62 .96 $89.54 $110.67 
Extended POC:e $5,744.00 $1 0,054 .00 $7,800.00 $6,296.00 $8,954 .00 $11 ,067 .00 
Core Charge Price $12 .00 $12 .94 $15.00 $20.00 $18.00 $20.00 
Total Extended Core Charge Pri:;e $1 ,200.00 $0.00 $1,294 .00 $1 ,500.00 $2,000.00 $0.00 $1 ,800.00 $2,000.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $6.944.00 $0.00 $11 ,348 .00 $9.300.00 $8,296.00 $0.00 $10,754 .00 $13 ,067 .00 

26 I Group: 90 100 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min.): 600 
Reserve Capacity (Min.@ eo• Min.): 100 
Quoted Reserved Ct1pacily (Min . @ 25 AMPS) RC 90 No Bid 100 96 600 No Bid 100 90 
Supplier Code # SLl90T5 90S 90fTSICS MTP-90fT5 7590 7590 
Unit Price $63.75 $90 .20 $72 .00 $71 .07 $82.38 $102.97 
Extended Price $6,375.00 $9,020.00 $7 ,200.00 $7.107.00 $8 ,238.00 $10.297.00 
Core Charge Price $12.00 $12 .94 $15.00 S20.00 $18 .00 $20.00 
Total Extended Core Charge Price s, .200.00 S0.00 $1,294 .00 $1 ,500.00 52.000.00 $0.00 S1.800.00 $2,000.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $7.575.00 $0.00 $10,314 .00 $8 ,700.00 $9,107.00 S0.00 $10,038.00 $12.297 .00 

27 IGroup:94R 60 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ o•F Min .): 700 
Reserve Capacity (Min.@ 80" Min.): 135 

Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) RC 140 No Bid 145 130 750 No Bid 140 140 
Supplier Code # SLl94RH7M 94RS 94RCS M-94R 7594R 7594R 
Unit Price $104 .52 $125.32 $77 .00 $74 .84 $94 .51 $121 .28 
Extended Price S6.271 .20 $7 ,519.20 $4 ,620.00 $4,490.40 $5,670.60 $7,276.80 
Core Charge Price $12.00 $12 .94 $15.00 $20 .00 $18.00 $20.00 
Total Extended Core Charge Pri:;e $720.00 $0.00 $776.40 $900.00 $1,200.00 $0.00 $1,080.00 $1,200.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) $6,991 .20 $0.00 $8.295.60 $5,520.00 $5,690.40 $0.00 $6,750.60 $8,476.80 

28 IGroup: 96R 30 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min .): 500 
Reserve Capacly (Mr\. @ 80" Min .): 90 ---,-.,.~] I RC 90 No Bid 85 95 500 No Bid 90 90 
Supplier Code # SU96R 96RS 96RCS M-96R 8496R 8496R 
Unit Price $67 .11 $81 .94 $71 .00 $66 .55 $81.83 $102.28 
Extended Price $2,013 .30 $2,458.20 $2,130.00 $1,996.50 $2.454.90 $3.068.40 
Core Charge Price $12 .00 $12 .94 S15.00 $20.00 $18 .00 $20.00 
Total Extended Core Charge Pnc:e $360.00 $0.00 $388.20 $450.00 $600.00 $0.00 S540.00 $600.00 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Char e $2,373.30 $0.00 $2,846.4 0 $2,580.00 $2,596 .50 $0.00 $2,994.90 $3,668.40 

e.,., 



Opened: August 10, 2020 
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, 

and Utlity Batteries 

Local Local 
River Birch Way, LLC dba !Genuine Parts Company 
Batteries Plus Bulbs (NAPA) 

16100012951 JF 16891 Bandera Rd . 16374 R,trnan Rd . I I Est. San Antonio, 
Annual TX 78238 

1?10\fi47.n•n-:i Deacr_!e_tlon 

San Antonio, 

l~ .. ~i~:;;_non~ ttem 

29 

30 

31 

Group: 534B20R 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min.): 275 
Reserve Capacity (Mr'I. @ 80" Min.): NIA 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) 
Supplier Code # 

Unit Price 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Extended Core Charge Price 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) 

Group: 546824R 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min .): 325 
Reserve Capacity (Mi"I.@ 80" Min.): NIA 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) 
Supplier Code # 

Unit Price 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Extended Core Charge Price 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) 

Group: XHD31C 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min .): 950 
Reserve Capacity (Mil.@ 80" Min .): 185 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) 
Supplier Code# 
UnilPrice 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Extended Core Charge Price 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) 

Overall Total Hem Parts 1 
Overall To!al Core Charges Item 1 

Prompt Payment Discount 
Total After Prompt Payment Discount 

Total Item 1 

FIRE DEPARTMENT TRUCK BATTERIES 
Manufacturer Name of Batteries Offered : 
Brand Name of Batteries Offered: 

Group: 31p 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min.): 950 
Reserve Capacity (Mil . @ ao• Min.): 190 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) 
Supplier Code# 
Unit Price 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Extended Core Charge Price 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) 

Group: 31s 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min.): 950 
Reserve Capacity (M r\ .@ 80" Min.): 190 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) 
Supplier Code# 
Unit Price 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Pnce 
Total Extended Core Charge Price 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) 

Overall Total l!em Parts 2 
overall Total Core Charges Item 2 

Prompt Payment Discount 
Total Attar Prompt Payment Discount 

Totalltcm2 

100 

RC 60 No Bid 
SU51PAGM 

$118.75 
$11,875.00 

$12 .00 
$1 ,200.00 $0,00 

$13 ,075.00 SO.DO 

100 

RC 60 No Bid 
SU51PAGM 

$118.75 
$11,875.00 

$12.00 
$1 ,200.00 SO.DO 

$13,075.00 $0.00 

12 

RC 175 No Bid 
SU31S 

$62 .50 
$750.00 

$20.00 
$240.00 so.oo 
$990.00 S0.00 

$172,044 .90 $138,374 .95 
$32 ,880.00 $34,290.00 

Net 30 Nct30 
$204,924 .90 $172,664 .95 
$204,924 .90 $172,664.95 

Incomplete 

100 

I 
RC175 190 

SU31PA 7237 
$62.50 $87.99 

$6,250.00 $8,799.00 
$20.00 $27 .00 

$2,000.00 $2,700.00 
$8 ,250.00 $11,499.00 

1500 I 
RC 175 190 

SU31S 7236 
$62.50 $87 .99 

$93,750.00 $131 ,985.00 
$20 .00 $27 .00 

$30,000 .00 $40 ,500.00 
$123,750.00 $172,485.00 

$100,000.00 $140,784.00 
$32,000 .00 $43,200.00 

Net30 Net30 
$132,000.00 $183,984.00 
5132000.00 $183,984.00 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulatlon 

Non•local Non•Local 
Arnold OW Company Austin, I Gonzalez Auto Parts 
LP 

8423 Eastern 

San Antonio, 
TX 78216 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

70 
1324R 

$175.38 
$17 ,538 .00 

$12.94 
$1 ,294.00 

$18 ,832.00 

195 
31-900CT 

$123.58 
$1,482.96 

$21.17 
$254.04 

$1 ,737.00 

$255,157.76 
$33,334 .14 

Net30 
$288,491 .90 
$288.491 ,90 

Incomplete 

195 
31 ·901CT 

$123.58 
$12 ,358.00 

$21 .17 
$2,117.00 

$14.475.00 

195 
31 ·900CT 

$123.58 
$185,370.00 

$21 .17 
$31 ,755.00 

$217 ,125.00 

$197,728.00 
$33,872.00 

Net 30 
$231 ,600.00 
$231,600.00 

. ... 5 

4220 San Bernando Ave. 

Laredo, 
TX 78041 

No Bid 

$0.00 
so.oo 

No Bid 

S0.00 
S0.00 

190 
XHD31C 

$80.00 
$960.00 

$26.00 
$312.00 

$1 ,272.00 

$169,640.00 
$37 ,167.00 

Net 30 
$206,807 .00 
$206,807 .00 

Incomplete 

Johnson Controls 
Continental 

190 
XHP31A 

$79.95 
$7 ,995.00 

$26.00 
$2,600.00 

$10,595.00 

190 
XHD31C 

$79 .85 
$119,775.00 

$26 .00 
$39,000 .00 

$158,775.00 

$127,770.00 
$41,600 .00 

Net30 
$169,370.00 
$169 370.00 

Local 
IBS of Paseo Del Rio 

902Chulie DriYe 

San Antonio, 
TX 78216 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

410 
MTX-546B2YR 

$109.96 
$10,996.00 

$20.00 
$2,000.00 

$12,996 .00 

1000 
M·31SHC 

$63 .32 
$759.84 

$30.00 
$360.00 

$1,119.84 

$174,930.24 
$51 ,760.00 

Net 30 
$226,690.24 
$226,690.24 

Incomplete 

950/1000 
31P-MHD I M31PHC 

$87 .19 1$63.32 
$8.749 I $6,332 

$30.00 
$3,000.00 

$11,749 .00 

1000 
M·31SHC 

$63 .32 
$94 ,980 .00 

$30 .00 
$45,000 .00 

$139,980.00 

$103,729.00 
$48,000.00 

Nct 30 
$151 ,729.00 
$151 729.00 

Non•Locat Non•Local Local 
Rush Truck Centers of South Texas Auto Parts World Tire Unlimited 
Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Company dba M&M Auto & 
Center - San Antonio Truck Parts /NAPA) 
8922 IH 10 East 20475 Hwy46 W, Ste. 340 113080 VS HWY281 North 

San Antonio, 
TX 78109 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

$140,208 .80 
$32,595 .00 

Net 30 
$172.803 .80 
$172,803 .80 

Incomplete 

190 
BT31P91 

$97.20 
$9,720.00 

$29.00 
$2,900.00 

$12 ,620.00 

190 
BT31S91 

$79 .99 
S 119,985.00 

$29 .00 
$43,500.00 

$163,485.00 

$129,705.00 
$46,400.00 

Net30 
$176,105.0C 
$176,105.00 

Spring Branch, 
TX 78070 

$60.00 
9851P 

$134 .82 
$13 ,482 .00 

$18 .00 
$1 ,800.00 

$15,282.00 

$60 .00 
9851P 

$134.82 
$13,482.00 

$18.00 
$1 ,800.00 

$15,282.00 

185 
7236 

$97 .45 
$1 ,169.40 

$27 .00 
$324 .00 

$1 ,493.40 

$219,913.40 
$48,834 .00 

2% 10 Days 
$5,374 .95 

$263,372.45 

East Penn Manufacturi'lg 
NAPA Baterries 

190 
7237 

$97.45 
$9,745.00 

$27 .00 
$2,700.00 

$12,445.00 

190 
7236 

$97 .45 
$146,175.00 

$27 .00 
$40 ,500.00 

$186,675.00 

$155,920.00 
$43,200.00 

2% 10 Days 
$195,137.60 
$199,120.00 

San Antonio, 
TX 78216 

60 
9851R 

$168,52 
$16,852.00 

$20.00 
$2,000.00 

$18,852.00 

60 
9851R 

$168.52 
$16,852.00 

$20.00 
S2,000.00 

$18,852 .00 

175 
7536 

$121 .81 
$1,461.72 

$20.00 
$240.00 

$1 ,701 .72 

$282,145.92 
$54,140.00 

2%21 Days 
$6,725.72 

$329,560.20 

175 
7237 

$121 ,81 
$12 ,181 .00 

$30.00 
$3,000.00 

$15,181.00 

175 
7236 

$121.81 
$182,715.00 

$30.00 
$45,000.00 

$227,715.00 

$194,896.00 
$48,000.00 
2%21 Days 

$238,038.08 
$242,896.00 



Opened: 
For: 

6100012951 

Item 

Ill 

August 1 0, 2020 
Annual Contract for AutomolNe, Industrial, 
and Uliity Batteries 

Descr.!e_Uon 

UTILITY BATTERIES 
Manufacturer Name of Batteries Offered : 
Brand Name of Batteries Offered: 

Group: T105 
Volts: 6 
CCA (@ 0"F Min.): N/A 
Reserve Capacity (Min. @ ao• Min.): 447@ 25 
AMP per hr. 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) 
Supplier Code # 
Unit Price 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Extended Core Charge Price 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) 

Group: T1 25 
Volts: 6 
CCA (@ 0"F Min.): NIA 
Reserve Capacity (Min.@ 80" Min.): 488@ 25 
AMP per hr. 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Mil. @ 25 AMPS) 
Supplier Code # 

Unit Price 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Extended Core Charge Price 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) 

Group: T145 
Volts: 6 
CCA (@ 0"F Min.): NIA 
Reserve Capacity (Mi-1 . @ 80" Min.): 530@ 25 
AMP per hr. 

Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) 
Supplier Code# 
Unit Price 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Extended Core Charge Prk:e 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) 

Group: T875 
Volts: 8 
CCA (@ 0°F Mr! .): NIA 
Reserve Capacity (Mn. @ so· Mn.): 290@ 25 
AMP per hr. 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) 
Supplier Code # 
Unit Price 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Extended Core Charge Price 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) 

Group: UB12120 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min.): N/A 
Reserve Capacity (Mi-I . @ 80" Min.): 
No mnltes, 12 AMP per hr. 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) 
Supplier Code # 
Unit Price 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Extended Core Charge Price 
Total {Extended price+ Ext.ended Core Charge) 

local 
River-8~ch Way, LLC dba 
Batteries Plus Bulbs 

;16891 Baodera Rd . 
E San Antonio. 

An TX 78238 
1?1n1 ~A7.n 1n1 

150 

RC448 
SLIGC115 

$80.00 
$12,000.00 

$30 .00 
$4 ,500.00 

$16.500 .00 

30 

RC488 
SUGC125 

$95.00 
$2.850.00 

$30.00 
$900.00 

$3,750.00 

60 

No Bidl 

$0.00 
$0.00 

20 

RC 318 
SLIGC8V 

$103.00 
$2 ,060.00 

$30 .00 
$600.00 

$2,660.00 

20 

NIA 
SLA12-12F2 

$34.90 
$698.00 

$2.50 
$50.00 

$748.00 

City of San Antonio Bid TabulaUon 

local Non-local Non-l ocal 
Genuine Parts Company Arnold Oil Company Austin, Gonzalez Auto Parts 
(NAPA) LP 

6374 Rlttiman Rd . 8423 Eastern 4220 San Bemando Ave. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, Laredo, 
TX 78217 TX 78216 TX 78041 
'"""' tl??.nnnr 

Johnson Controls 
Conlinental 

448 448 225 
8144 GC-110 T105 

$90.63 S127.66 S125.00 
$13,594.50 $19,149.00 $18,750.00 

$27.00 $31 .77 $26.00 
$4,050.00 $4 ,765.50 $3,900.00 

$17 ,644.50 $23 ,914 .50 $22 ,650.00 

530 488 240 
8146 EV-125 T125 

$90.63 $151 .79 $154 .00 
$2,718.90 $4,553 .70 $4 ,620.00 

$27 .00 $31.77 $26.00 
$810.00 $953 .10 $780.00 

$3,528.90 $5.506 .80 $5,400.00 

530 530 260 
8146 EV-145 T145 

$90 .63 $196.28 $177.00 
$5,437.80 $11 ,776.80 $10 ,620.00 

$27.00 $31 .77 $26.00 
$1,620.00 $1 ,906.20 $1 ,560.00 
$7,057.80 $13,683 .00 $12,180.00 

318 318 170 
8148 GLB-120 T875 

$94 .21 $145.21 $136.00 
$1 ,884 .20 $2,904 .20 $2.720.00 

$27.00 $31.77 S26.00 
$540.00 $635.40 $520.00 

$2,424.20 $3.539.60 $3,240.00 

12AH No Bid 12AMP 
ES12-12 CB12120-F I 

$33.66 $22.00 
$673.20 $440.00 

$0.00 $6.00 
$0.00 $0.00 $120.00 

$673.20 $0.00 $560.00 

Page6 

local Non-local Non-local local 
IBS of Paseo Del Rio Rush Truck Centers of South Texas Auto Parts IWorkl Ti"e Unli"nited 

Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Company dba M&M Auto & 
Center • San Antonio Truck Parts (NAPA) 

902 Chulie Drive 8922 IH 10 East 20475Hwy46W.Ste. 340 1' 3080VSHWY281 North 
San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch, San Antonio, 
TX 78216 TX 78109 TX 78070 TX 78216 

East Penn Manufacturing 
NAPA Baterries 

447 Min No Bid 447 488 
GC2-ECL-UTL 8144 8146 

$89.77 $91 .90 $139.01 
$13,465.50 $13,785.00 $20,851.50 

$30.00 $27.00 $30 .00 
$4,500.00 $0.00 $4,050.00 $4 ,500.00 

$17.965.50 $0.00 $17 .835 .00 $25 ,351.50 

No Bid No Bid 530 488 
8146 8146 

$111 .21 $139.01 
$3 ,336.30 $4,170.30 

$27.00 $30.00 
$0.00 $0.00 $810.00 $900.00 
$0.00 $0.00 $4,146.30 $5,070.30 

No Bid No Bid 530 488 
8146 8146 

$111 .21 $139.01 
$6,672.60 $8,340.60 

$27.00 $30.00 
$0.00 $0.00 $1,620.00 $1,800.00 
$0.00 $0.00 $8,292.60 $10.140.60 

295Min No Bid J No Bid 
GC8-HCL-UTL 8148 

$87.64 $102.68 
$1 ,752.80 $2.053.60 

$30.00 $27.00 
$600.00 $0.00 $540.001 $0.00 

$2,352.80 $0.00 $2,593.60 $0.00 

12-AH No Bid 12 AMP/HR 85 
SLA-1105 ES1212 ES1212 

$39.72 $37 .74 $44 .67 
$794.40 $754 .80 $893.40 

$5.00 $0.00 $0.00 
$100.00 SO.DO $0.00 $0.00 
$894.40 $0.00 $754 .80 .!893.40 



Opened : August 10, 2020 Local Local 
For: Annual Contract for Aulomotive, Industrial, 

and Utiity Batteries 
River Birch Way, LLC dba !Genuine Pans Company 
Batteries Plus Bulbs (NAPA) 

I JF 16891 Bandera Rd . 16374 R'1man Rd . I I Est. San Antonio, 
Annual TX 78238 

12101647.nrnct 

610001?9~1 

hem Descr.!e_tlon 

San Antonio, 
TX 78217 

10 

11 

Group: UB12180 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Mirl .): NIA 
Reserve Capacity (Mirl.@ so• Min.): 
No minutes, 12 AMP per hr. 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min.@ 25 AMPS) 
Supplier Code# 
Unit Price 
Eitended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Extended Core Charge Price 
Total (Extended price+ Eitended Core Charge) 

Group: UB 1280 
Volts: 20 
CCA (@ 0"F Min.): NIA 
ReseNe Capacfy (Min. @ 80" Min.): 
No minutes, 8 AMP per hr. 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) 
Su pplier Code # 
Unit Price 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Eitended Core Charge Price 
Total (Eitended price+ Eitended Core Cha,ge) 

Group: UB1 2550 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ 0"F Min.): NIA 
Reserve Capacty (Min. @ 80" Min .): 
No minutes, 55 AMP per hr. 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Mirl . @ 25 AMPS) 
Supplier Code # 

Unit Price 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Extended Core Charge Price 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Cha,ge) 

Group: UB12350 
Volts: 12 
CCA (@ o•F Min.): NIA 
Reserve Capacity (Mil. @ 80" Min.): 
No mirlutes, 35 AMP per hr. 
Quoted Reserved Capacity (Mirl. @ 25 AMPS) 
Supplier Code # 

UnilPrice 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Extended Core Charge Price 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) 

Group: UB1250 
Volts: 8 
CCA (@ 0"F Mirl.): N/A 
Reserve Capacty (Min. @ 80" Min.): 
No minutes, 5 AM P per hr. 

Quoted Reserved Capacity (Mirl.@ 25 AM PS) 
Supplier Code# 
Unit Price 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total EX1ended Core Charge Pri:e 
Total (Extended price+ Extended Core Charge) 

Deleled 

20 

NIA 
SLAA12-18NB 

$53 .90 
$1 ,078.00 

$6.00 
$120.00 

$1,198.00 

20 

NIA 
SLA12-8F 

$19.90 
$398.00 

$0.00 
$0.00 

$398.00 

12 

NIA 
SLAA 12-55C/FR 

$126.90 

$1 ,522.801 
$12 .00 

$144 .00 
$1 ,666.80 

22 

NIA 
SLADC12-35J 

$68.90 
$1,515.80 

$6 ,00 
$132.00 

$1 ,647 .80 

NIA 
SLA12-5F 

$16.90 
$135.20 

$0.00 
$0.00 

$135.20 

12AH 
ES17+12 

$49.96 
$999.20 

$0.00 
$0.00 

$999.20 

BAH 
ES7-12 
$49.96 

S999.20 
$0.00 
$0.00 

$999.20 

55AH 
8222 NF 

$76.76 
S921.12 

$9.00 
S108.00 

$1 .029.12 

"~! ES40-12 
$76 .9 

Sl,692.90 
$0.00 
$0.00 

$1,692 .90 

S AH 
ESS-12 
$21 .16 

$169.28 
$0.00 
SO.DO 

S169.28 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Non-local Non-local 
Arnold Oil Company Austin, I Gonzalez Auto Pans 
LP 

8423 Eastern 

San Antonio, 
TX 78216 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

P.,. 7 

4220 San Bemando Ave , 

Laredo. 
TX 78041 

18AMP 
CB12180 

$48 .00 
$960.00 

$6.00 
$120.00 

$1,080.00 

8AMP 
CB1280-F I 

$12 .00 
$240.00 

$3.00 
$60 .00 

$300.00 

55AMP 
CB12550 

$72 .00 
$864 .00 

$15 .00 
$180.00 

Sl ,044 .00 

35AMP 
CB12350 

$52 .00 
$1 ,144.00 

$6.00 
$132.00 

$1 ,276.00 

5AMP 
CB1250-F1 

$8.00 
S64 .00 

$3.00 
S24.00 
S88.00 

Lo cal 
IBS of Paseo Del Rio 

902 Chulie Drive 

San Antonio, 
TX 78216 

18-AH 
SLA-1116 

$41 .51 
$830.20 

$5.00 
$100.00 
$930.20 

8-AH 
SLA-1075 

$30.06 
$601 .20 

$5.00 
$100.00 
$701.20 

55-AH 
SLA-1165 

$176.50 
$2, 11 8.00 

$20.00 
$240.00 

S2.358 .00 

35-AH 
DCM0035 

$82 .12 
$1.806.64 

$8.00 
$176.00 

$1 .982.64 

5-AH 
SLA-1055 

$30.10 
S240.80 

S5.00 
$40.00 

$280.80 

Non-Local Non-Local Loca l 
Rush Truck Centers of I South Texas Auto PariS ! World Tire Unlimited 
Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Companydba M&M Auto & 
Center • San Antonio Truck Parts /NAPA) 
8922 IH 10 East 20475 Hwy46 W , Ste. 340 113080 VS HWY281 Nonh 

San Antonio, 
TX 78109 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

No Bid 

S0.oo 
SO.DO 

No Bid 

S0.00 
$0.00 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

Spring Branch, 
TX 78070 

12 AMP/HR 
ES17-12 

$47 .45 
$949.00 

$0.00 
$0.00 

$949.00 

8AMPIHR 
ES7-12 
S19.78 

$395.60 
S0.00 
S0.00 

S395.60 

55 AMP/HR 
ES22NF 
S133.79 

Sl,605.48 
$9.00 

$108.00 
$1 ,713.48 

35AMP/HR 
ESU135 

$72.69 
Sl.599.18 

$9.00 
$198.00 

Sl ,797 .18 

5 AMP/HR 
ES512 
$24 .08 

$192.64 
so.oo 
S0.00 

$192.64 

San Antonio, 
TX 78216 

85 
ES1712 
$58.06 

$1 ,161 .20 
$0.00 
$0.00 

$1,161.20 

85 
ES22NF 

$22 .22 
$444 ,40 

$0.00 
$0.00 

$444.40 

85 
ES22FF 
$165.98 

$1.991 .76 
$9.00 

$108.00 
$2,099.76 

$45.00 
ESU135 

$89.61 
$1 .971.42 

$9.00 
$198.00 

$2,169.42 

$45.00 
ES512 
$27 .60 

$220.80 
S0.00 
$0.00 

S220.80 



Opened: August 10, 2020 
For: Annual Cootract for Automotive, Industrial, 

and Utlity Batteries 

Local 
River Birch Way, LLC dba 
Batteries Plus Bulbs 

ltom Oescr£tlon 

16100012951 JF 16891 Barnlera Rd . 

1 I Est. San Antonio, 
Annual TX 78238 

"··- "'"' "''·"= 12 

IV 

Group: ES17-12 
Nominal Voltage : 12V 
Nominal Capacity: 
20 hour rate (0 .9A to 1 0.S0V) 18Ah 
10 hour rate (1.7 1A to 10.S0V) 17 .1 Ah 
5 Hour rate (3 .06 to 10.20V) 15.3 Ah 
1C (t8A to 9.60V) 9.6 Ah 
JC (54A lo 9.60V) 6.3 Ah Internal Resistance (at 
1 KHz) Approx: 120 
Maxinum Discharge Current for 5 seconds: 270A 
Charge retention (shelf ife) at 2o·c (6B.F) 

1 month-92% 
3 months-90% 
6 months- 80% 
T.,..,..;,.,,.1, ~'l 

Quoted Reserved Capacity (Min. @ 25 AMPS) 

Supplier Code # 
Unit Price 
Extended Price 
Core Charge Price 
Total Extended Core Charge Price 
Total (Extended price• E)([ended Core Charge) 

Overall Total Item Parts 3 
Overall Total Core Charges Item 3 

Prompt Payment Discount 
Total After Prompt Payment Discount 

Totalltem3 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

$22.257 ,80 
$6,446.00 

Net30 
$28,703.80 
$28 ,703 .80 
lncom " 

Local 
Genuine Parts Company 
(NAPA) 

6374 Rittiman Rd . 

San Antonio, 
TX 78217 
l1?1n1,t??.non1: 

SAHi 

ES17 .12 
$49 .96 

$399.68 
$0.00 
$0.00 

$399.68 

$29,489 .98 
$7,128.0 

Net 3 
$36 ,617 .98 
$36 ,617 .98 

City of San Antonio Bid Tab ulation 

Non-Local Non-Local 
Arnold Oil Company Austin, ! Gonzalez Auto Parts 
LP 

8423 Eastern 

San Antonio, 
TX 78216 

No Bid 

$0.00 
$0.00 

$38,383.70 
$8 ,260.20 

Net 30 
$46,643.90 
$46 ,643.90 
Incomplete 

4220 San Bemando Ave. 

Laredo, 
TX 78041 

18AMP 

CB12180 
$48 .00 

$384 .00 
$6.00 

$48 .00 
$432.00 

$40,806.00 
$7,444 .00 

Net 30 
$48,250.00 
$48 ,250.00 

Loca l 
TBS of Paseo Del Rio 

902 Chulle Drive 

San Antonio. 
TX 78216 

18-AH 

SLA-1116 
$62.10 

$496.80 
$5.00 

$40.00 
$536.80 

$22,106.34 
$5,896.00 

Net 30 
$28,002.34 
$28 ,002.34 
Incomplete 

A. 

I DELIVERY & DISPOSAL SERVICE 

Business hours from and to : 

I I 9:00 AM - 7:00 PMI 7:30 AM· 6 :00 PMI 8:00AM - 5:00PMI 8:00AM - 7:00PMI 7:00 AM - 6:00 PM 

Days per week : 6 

Dlsposal Fee Per Battery $3 .0 $3.0l $0 .001 $3.001 $3.00 

Prompt payment discount· Net30 Net 3 Net30 Net30 Net30 

Estimated Annual Award $336~2~0 $36.,_617.98 

Pages 

Non-Local Non-Local Local 
Rush Truck Centers of I South Texas Auto Parts IWond Tire Unlimited 
Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Companydba M&M Auto & 
Center • San Antonio Truck Parts {NAPA) 
8922IH10East 20475Hwy46W, Ste. 340 l 13080VSHWY281 North 

San Antonio, 
TX 78109 

No Bid 

SO.OD 
$0.00 

$0.00 
$0.00 

Net30 
$0.00 
$0.00 

Incomplete 

7:00AM - 9:00PM 

$3 ,00 

Net 30 

Spring Branch, 
TX 78070 

12V 
20hr - 18 Ah 

10hr - 17.1 Ah 
5HR • 15.3 Ah 

1C - 9.6Ah 
3C-6.3Ah 

?7t'lA 
ES17 .12 

$47.45 
$379.60 

$0.00 
$0.00 

$379.60 

$31,723.80 
57,326.00 

2% 10 Days 
$38,268.80 
$39,049.80 

7:30 AM · 6:00 PM 
9:00 AM 5:00 PM Sunday! 

6 

$3.00 

2% 10 Days 

San Antonio, 
TX 78216 

SBS .00 

ES1712 
$58 ,06 

$464.48 
$0.00 
$0.00 

$464.48 

$40,509.86 
$7 ,506.00 

2% 21 Days 
$47 ,055.54 
$48,015.86 
Incomplete 

8:00AM - 5:00PM 

$10 ,00 

2%21 Days 



Opened: 
For: 

6100013342 

Item 

1 

2 

November 2, 2020 

City of San Antonio 

Bid Tabulation 

Annual Contract for B2GNOW Software for EDD 

Description 

Annual Service Fee - B2GNOW- Contract & 
Concessions Management System 
(Vendor Management, Contract Compliance, 
Concession, Outreach , Insurance Management, and 
Proposal Tracking Modules) 
Initial 3 Year Term: 1/1/2021 -12/31/2021 

Unit Price 
Total Price 

Annual Service Fee - B2GNOW- Contract & 
Concessions Management System 
(Vendor Management, Contract Compliance, 
Concession, Outreach, Insurance Management, and 
Proposal Tracking Modules) 
Initial 3 Year Term: 1/1/2022-12/31/2022 

Unit Price 
Total Price 

Annual Service Fee - B2GNOW- Contract & 
Concessions Management System 
(Vendor Management, Contract Compliance, 
Concession, Outreach , Insurance Management, and 
Proposal Tracking Modules) 
Initial 3 Year Term: 1/1/2023-12/31/2023 

Unit Price 
Total Price 

Annual Service Fee - B2GNOW- Contract & 
Concessions Management System 
(Vendor Management, Contract Compliance, 
Concession, Outreach, Insurance Management, and 
Proposal Tracking Modules) 
Option Renewal Term: 1/1/2024 -12/31/2024 

Unit Price 
Total Price 

Annual Service Fee - B2GNOW- Contract & 
Concessions Management System 
(Vendor Management, Contract Compliance, 
Concession, Outreach, Insurance Management, and 
Proposal Tracking Modules) 
Option Renewal Term: 1/1/2025 - 12/31/2025 

Unit Price 
Total Price 

Annual Service Fee - LC PT racker - Prevailing Wage 
Module with Capacity up to $1 Billion 
Initial 3 Year Term: 1/1/2021 -12/31/2021 
Unit Price 
Total Price 

Annual Service Fee - LC PT racker - Prevailing Wage 
Module with Capacity up to $1 Billion 
Initial 3 Year Term: 1/1/2022-12/31/2022 
Unit Price 
Total Price 

Sole Source 
Ask Reply, Inc. 

MC dba B2GNOW 
725 West McDowell Road 

Estimated Phoenix, 
Annual AZ 85007 

Quantity 602-325-9277 

1 

$35,700.00 
$35,700.00 

1 

$35,700.00 
$35,700.00 

1 

$35,700.00 
$35,700.00 

1 

$37,485.00 

$37,485.00 

1 

$37,485.00 
$37,485.00 

1 

$50,700.00 
$50,700.00 

1 

$50,700.0C 
$50,700.00 



Opened: November 2, 2020 
For: Annual Contract for B2GNOW Software for EDD Sole Source 

Ask Reply, Inc. 
6100013342 MC dba B2GNOW 

725 West McDowell Road 
Estimated Phoenix, 

Item Description Annual AZ. 85007 
Quantity 602-325-9277 

Annual Service Fee - LCPTracker - Prevailing Wage 1 
Module with Capacity up to $1 Bill ion 
Initial 3 Year Tenm: 1/1/2023 - 12/31 /2023 
Unit Price $50,700.00 
Total Price $50,700.00 

Annual Service Fee - LCPTracker - Prevailing Wage 1 
Module with Capacity up to $1 Billion 
Option Renewal Term: 1/1/2024 - 12/31/2024 
Unit Price $50,700.00 
Total Price $50,700.00 

Annual Service Fee - LC PT racker - Prevailing Wage 1 
Module with Capacity up to $1 Billion 
Option Renewal Term: 1/1/2025 -12/31/2025 
Unit Price $50,700.00 
Total Price $50,700.00 

Payment Terms Net30 

Estimated Annual Total $86,400.00 
Estimated Total Award $435,570.0C 


