
City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 21, 2020 LOCAL NON-LOCAL

For:
Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles EAN Holdings, LLC dba 

Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Capps Van & Truck Rental

6100013074 HH 1505 Harry Wurzbach 8555 John Carpenter Fwy

Category Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantitiy

San Antonio,      

TX 78209      

210-889-3604

Dallas,

TX 75247

I 1/2 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 2 Wheel Drive:

Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 1500, Ford 

F150, or proven equal

A Regular Cab

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $36.75 No Bid

Extended Price $36.75

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $202.13

Extended Price $202.13

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 47 $735.00

Extended Price $34,545.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

B Extended Cab No Bid

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $36.75

Extended Price $36.75

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $202.13

Extended Price $202.13

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $735.00

Extended Price $3,675.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

C Crew or Super Crew Cab No Bid

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $36.75

Extended Price $36.75

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $202.13

Extended Price $202.13

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate Each 5 $735.00

Extended Price $3,675.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

TOTAL CATEGORY I $42,611.64

II 1/2 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 4 Wheel Drive

Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 1500, Ford 

F150, or proven equal

No Bid

A Regular Cab

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $36.75

Extended Price $36.75

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $202.13

Extended Price $202.13

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 6 $735.00

Extended Price $4,410.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

B Extended Cab No Bid

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $36.75

Extended Price $36.75

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $202.13

Extended Price $202.13

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 60 $735.00

Extended Price $44,100.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

C Crew or Super Crew Cab

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $36.75 N/A

Extended Price $36.75

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $202.13 N/A

Extended Price $202.13

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 79 $735.00 $825.00

Extended Price $58,065.00 $65,175.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed Not listed

TOTAL CATEGORY II $107,291.64

III 3/4 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 2 Wheel Drive

Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 2500, Ford 

F250, or proven equal

A Regular Cab No Bid

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $51.25

Extended Price $51.25

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $281.88

Extended Price $281.88

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $1,025.00

Extended Price $5,125.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 21, 2020 LOCAL NON-LOCAL

For:
Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles EAN Holdings, LLC dba 

Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Capps Van & Truck Rental

6100013074 HH 1505 Harry Wurzbach 8555 John Carpenter Fwy

Category Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantitiy

San Antonio,      

TX 78209      

210-889-3604

Dallas,

TX 75247

B Extended Cab No Bid

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $51.25

Extended Price $51.25

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $281.88

Extended Price $281.88

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $1,025.00

Extended Price $5,125.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

C Crew or Super Crew Cab No Bid

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $51.25

Extended Price $51.25

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $281.88

Extended Price $281.88

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $1,025.00

Extended Price $5,125.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

TOTAL CATEFORY III $16,374.39

IV 3/4 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 4 Wheel Drive

Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet 2500, Ford 

F250, or proven equal

A Regular Cab

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $51.25 N/A

Extended Price $51.25

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $281.88 N/A

Extended Price $281.88

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $1,025.00 $849.95

Extended Price $5,125.00 $4,249.75

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

B Extended Cab No Bid

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $51.25

Extended Price $51.25

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $281.88

Extended Price $281.88

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $1,025.00

Extended Price $5,125.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

C Crew or Super Crew Cab

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $51.25 N/A

Extended Price $51.25

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $281.88 N/A

Extended Price $281.88

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $1,025.00 $849.95

Extended Price $5,125.00 $4,249.75

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed Not Listed

TOTAL CATEGORY IV $16,374.39

V Full Size Sport Utility Vehicles

Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet Tahoe, Ford 

Expedition, or proven equal

A Regular 2 Wheel Drive

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 6 $55.00 No Bid

Extended Price $330.00

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $302.50

Extended Price $302.50

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 1 $1,100.00

Extended Price $1,100.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

B 4 Wheel Drive

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $60.00 No Bid

Extended Price $60.00

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $330.00

Extended Price $330.00

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $1,200.00

Extended Price $6,000.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

TOTAL CATEGORY V $8,122.50

VI Small Size Sport Utility Vehicles

Acceptable Makes & Models: Ford Escape, Jeep 

Liberty, or proven equal

A 2 Wheel Drive, Gasoline Powered

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $37.50 No Bid

Extended Price $37.50

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $206.25

Extended Price $206.25

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $750.00

Extended Price $3,750.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 21, 2020 LOCAL NON-LOCAL

For:
Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles EAN Holdings, LLC dba 

Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Capps Van & Truck Rental

6100013074 HH 1505 Harry Wurzbach 8555 John Carpenter Fwy

Category Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantitiy

San Antonio,      

TX 78209      

210-889-3604

Dallas,

TX 75247

B 4 Wheel Drive, Gasoline Powered

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $42.50 No Bid

Extended Price $42.50

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $233.75

Extended Price $233.75

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $850.00

$4,250.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

C Hybrid Powered

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $47.50 No Bid

Extended Price $47.50

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $261.25

Extended Price $261.25

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $950.00

Extended Price $4,750.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

TOTAL CATEGORY VI $13,578.75

VII Mid Size Sedan

Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet Malibu, Ford 

Fusion, or proven equal

A Gasoline Powered

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $34.25 No Bid

Extended Price $34.25

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $188.38

Extended Price $188.38

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 6 $685.00

Extended Price $4,110.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

B Hybrid Powered

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $44.25 No Bid

Extended Price $44.25

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $243.38

Extended Price $243.38

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $885.00

Extended Price $4,425.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

TOTAL CATEGORY VII $9,045.26

VIII Compact Size Sedan

Acceptable Makes & Models: Chevrolet Cruze, Ford 

Focus, or proven equal

A Gasoline Powered

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $34.25 No Bid

Extended Price $34.25

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $188.38

Extended Price $188.38

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $685.00

Extended Price $3,425.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

B Hybrid Powered

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $44.25 No Bid

Extended Price $44.25

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $243.38

Extended Price $243.38

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $885.00

Extended Price $4,425.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

TOTAL CATEGORY VIII $8,360.26

IX Eight (8) Passenger Mini-Van ,Window Type No Bid

Acceptable Makes & Models: Kia Sedona, Chrysler 

Town & Country, Dodge Grand Caravan, or proven 

equal

A Gasoline Powered

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $40.00

Extended Price $40.00

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $220.00

Extended Price $220.00

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 8 $800.00

Extended Price $6,400.00

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

TOTAL CATEGORY IX $6,660.00
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 21, 2020 LOCAL NON-LOCAL

For:
Annual Contract for Rental of Various Vehicles EAN Holdings, LLC dba 

Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Capps Van & Truck Rental

6100013074 HH 1505 Harry Wurzbach 8555 John Carpenter Fwy

Category Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantitiy

San Antonio,      

TX 78209      

210-889-3604

Dallas,

TX 75247

X Twelve (12) Passenger Van:   

 Acceptable Makes & Models: 

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 4 $46.25 $109.95

Extended Price $185.00 $439.80

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $254.38 $549.75

Extended Price $254.38 $549.75

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 1 $925.00 $1,199.95

Extended Price $925.00 $1,199.95

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed Not Listed

TOTAL CATEGORY X $1,364.38 $2,189.50

XI Fifteen Passenger Van

Acceptable Models: 

A Gasoline Powered

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 52 $46.25 $119.95

Extended Price $2,405.00 $6,237.40

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $254.38 $599.75

Extended Price $254.38 $599.75

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 1 $925.00 $1,299.95

Extended Price $925.00 $1,299.95

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed

TOTAL CATEGORY XI $3,584.38 $8,137.10

XII Cargo Van

 Acceptable Makes & Models:Ford Econoline, GMC 

Express, or proven equal 

1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate 1 $40.00 $79.95

Extended Price $40.00 $79.95

2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 1 $220.00 $399.75

Extended Price $220.00 $399.75

3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 5 $800.00 $949.95

Extended Price $4,000.00 $4,749.75

Makes & Models Offered Not Listed Not Listed

TOTAL CATEGORY XII $4,260.00 $5,229.45

XIII City of San Antonio Airport Usage Fees

City of San Antonio Customer Facility Charges (CFC) $5.50 or current applicable rate $5.50 or current applicable rate

Facility Maintenance Fee (FMF) $1.33 or current applicable rate $1.33 or current applicable rate

Prompt Payment Discount Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total $238,000.00

Estimated Annual Award $238,000.00
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