LE
03/18/21
Item No. 6

orDINANCE  2021-03-18-0165

APPROVING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING UNIT
PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL
COST OF $182,000.000 INCLUDED IN THE RESPECTIVE
DEPARTMENT’S FY 2021 ADOPTED BUDGET: (A) BANKSON GROUP,
LTD., DBA ALAMO TEES & ADVERTISING, AND A1 SPORTS CENTER,
INC., FOR A VARIETY OF PROMOTIONAL TEE SHIRTS FOR CITY
DEPARTMENTS; AND (B) RONVAC CORP., DBA FASTSIGNS
DOWNTOWN, FOR VEHICLE DECALS, LETTERS AND NUMBERS FOR
MARKING CITY-OWNED VEHICLES.

& & & & &

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and
services on an annual contract basis; and

WHEREAS,; the bids submitted by A1 Sports Center, Inc. (Items 1-4 ), Advertising Matters, LLC
(Items 1-8), All-Star Custom Apparel and Design, Inc. (Items 1-8), American Solutions for
Business (Items 1-8), Express Press (Items 1-8), Heart N Soul Graphic Designs and Photography
(Items 1-8), Promotional Designs (Items 1-8), Rivercity Screen Printing & Embroidery (Items 1-
8), and ROSCO Imprints and Embroidery (Items 1-8) failed to meet the City’s specifications
and/or requirements for promotional tee shirts; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves low bid contracts with: (A) Bankson Group, Ltd., dba Alamo
Tees & Advertising, and Al Sports Center, Inc., for a variety of promotional tee shirts for City
departments; and (B) RONVAC Corp., dba FASTSIGNS Downtown, for vehicle decals, letters
and numbers for marking City-owned fleet vehicles; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The following bids to furnish the City with goods and services on an annual basis
as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon
the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements:
(A) Bankson Group, Ltd., dba Alamo Tees & Advertising, and A1 Sports Center, Inc., for a variety
of promotional tee shirts for City departments; and (B) RONVAC Corp., dba FASTSIGNS
Downtown, for vehicle decals, letters and numbers for marking City-owned fleet vehicles. The bid
tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies
of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance
Department.

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bids submitted by A1 Sports Center, Inc.
(Items 1-4 ), Advertising Matters, LLC (Items 1-8), All-Star Custom Apparel and Design, Inc.
(Items 1-8), American Solutions for Business (Items 1-8), Express Press (Items 1-8), Heart N Soul
Graphic Designs and Photography (Items 1-8), Promotional Designs (Items 1-8), Rivercity Screen
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'Prihting & Embroidery' (Items 1-8), and ROSCO Imprints and Embroidery (Items 1-8) failed to
meet the City’s specifications and/or requirements for promotional tee shirts.

SECTION 3. Funds will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders, and payment is
authorized to the vendors identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the Fiscal
Year 2021 budget, and such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through their
terms as evidenced by subsequent ordinances.

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 18t day of March, 2021.

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:
vt ] Fore. oGP
Tina J. Flores, City’Clerk _AndrewSegovia, City Attorney



File Number: 21-1659 Enactment Number: 2021-03-18-0165

. City of San Antonio

CITY OF

SAN ANTONIO

— ks — City Council

e

March 18, 2021

Item: 6 Enactment Number:
File Number: 21-1659 2021-03-18-0165

Ordinance approving the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services
for an estimated annual cost of $182,000.00, included in the respective department's FY
2021 Adopted Budget:

(A) Bankson Group, Ltd., dba Alamo Tees & Advertising, and Al Sports Center, Inc., for a
variety of promotional tee shirts for City departments; and

(B) RONVAC Corp., dba FASTSIGNS Downtown, for vehicle decals, letters and numbers
for marking City-owned fleet vehicles.

[Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]

Councilmember John Courage made a motion to approve. Councilmember Clayton H.
Perry seconded the motion. The motion passed by the following vote:

Aye: 11 Nirenberg, Trevifio, Andrews-Sullivan, Viagran, Rocha Garcia,
Gonzales, Cabello Havrda, Sandoval, Pelaez, Courage and Perry

Office of the City Clerk Printed on 3/25/21
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Exhibit 1



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Exhibit I

Gpened: Tane 26, 2020 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Ees el Godmct for T [A7 Sports Center TBankson Group LTDdba _ |Advertising Matters, LLC [Al-Star Custom Appareland | Amencan Soltions for TExpress Press [Fear N Soul Graphic Designs [Heaven Sent Promotions and _|Promotional Designs. [Riverchly Screen Printing & |ROSCO Imprints and
0% D Caetmct for Prameliooet T:S0ie [Alamo Tees & Advertsing n. Inc Business [and Photography [Apparel, LLC y y
siciursiios coL  [1027 Bandera Road 12814 Cogbum 3412 S Grove Street 395 Summi Point Drve, Sute (9901 1 10 West 1860 £ St Louss St 13529 Chandelle Dive 5611 San Pedro Ave 8150 Brookiver Dr Sute S- (1709 South IH-35 120 S Avenue &
1 155
[san Antonio [san Antonio Fotworth Hennetta san Antonio Springfield Newalia san Antonio Dalas San Marcos Freeport
Estimated |TX 78245 TX 78249 TX76110 Ny 14467 TX 78230 MO 65802 oK 74857 X 78212 TX 75247 X 78666 TX 77541
Description Annual (210 664-0566 (210) 699-3800
Quantity
T T-Shirt White NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS
100% Cotton Shirt 8000
Brand Name No Bid) Gidan Hanes} Gidan|  Frut of the Loom (Port & Co|  Gidan Heavy Catton T-Shir Port & Company) Gidan| Port& Company|  Gidan, Port & Company| Gidan| Port & Company]
PCS4LS for 4x 8 5x long|  (Short Sleeve Adutt & Youth)
sleeve)| *Long Sleeve is Port &
Company Long Skeeve Core|
Cotton Tee (PC54LS)
Style 8 No Bid| GS00. G200, G5008, G2008 | 5000 3930R| 5000 - Adult. 50008 Youth| PCS4| G5000 PCE1. PCB1Y, PCEILS. $S 5000, 50008 LS 54008, 500 G240-Longsieeve| PCB1/PCEILS)
5250, 54500, G540,65408, G2408 (Gadan) PCEILS|
G240, G240B, 5586. 54501
60/50 Cotton Poly Blend Shirt 8000
Brand Name Jerzees, Gidan) Gidan, Hanes, Jerzees} Gidan|  Jerzees (Port & Co PC55LS) Port & Company No Bi Porta Company|  Gildan, Port & Company/ Gidan) Port & Comparny|
for 4x & 5x long sieeve)|
Styte # 20809M  G240/62408] G800, GaooB 5170, 29M, 8000} 29MR| pess| No Bi| PC55, PCS5LS, PCSSY, 298L|  SS 8000, 80008 LS Por 800 G840-Longsieeve PCSSIPCSSLS|
29B. 5370, G840, GB40B. (Jerzees)| PCSSLS, Jerzee 293L.C]|
291 2981
11 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt:
Youth Xsmall - Xiarge 2250
Price (per each) 51 80} $200) $250) $337 5249 $1 59) $219 5245 $235 5263
Extended Price (per each) $4,050 00) $4,500 00) 36,625 00) $7,68250 4,050 00) $5,602 50) $3577 50 5492750 $5,61250) $5.287 50 $5,017 50
| Adut Smal - Xiarge 2,250
Price (per each) $175) 5208} $250 $355| 3249 $1 44 5262 5250 $2.35) 5200
Extended Price (per each) $3.937 & 54,680 00) 36,625 00) $7,98750 $4,410.00) $5,602 50) $3.240 00 $5.895 00| $6,625 00| $5.267 50 $6525.00)
Adult 2X 1.200
Price (per each) 53 50) 3398 $450) 538 54 49| 5346 5424 55 00} s415 $4.90
Extended Price (per each) $4,200 00) $4,776 00§ $5.400 00| 36,456 00| $4,860 00| $5 388 00| $4.152 00] $5.088 00| $6.000 00| $4,980 00| $5.880 00|
Adutt 3X 150
Pre (per each) 35 30} $475} $5.00) $623 55 49| 34 49| 3469 56 50) 3525 35 90)
Extended Price (per each) 5795 00} s71250] $750,00) $934 50| $738.00) $823 50] $673 50} $703 50 $975 00| 5787 50) 5885 00
Acur ax 75
Prce (per each) 55 30} 5475 $500) $623) $6 49 $5.24) 5484 $650) 35 a5} 3640
Extended Price (per each) 5397 50} $356 25) 5375 00) 5467 25| $369 00| $486 75| 5393 00| $363 00| $487 50| 3408 75 48000
| Adut 5X 75
Prce (per each) $530) 475} $500 $623) 57 49| 524 $535 $650 3595 5650
Extended Price (per each) 5397 50} 5356 25) $375 00} $467 25| $369.00) $561 75| $393 00} $401 25| $48750 $446 25| 487,50
12 [Long Sleeve White T-Shirt:
| Youth Xsmal - Xiarge 750
Price (per each) s445 5350} $6 50 55 60) 3466 No B $4.48) $410 3591
Extended Price (per each) $3,337 50f 52,625 00f 54,875 .00) $4,200 00| $2,48250 $3,495 00| $3.360 00 $3,075.00) $3.71250 $4.432 50)
Acut Smail - Xiarge 750
Price (per each) 53 30) $353) $6 50 55 20) s 5466 32 99| 3561 5470 5495 $5 91
Extended Price (per each) $2.475 00) 52,647 5 $4,875 00} $3,90000 $2,97750) $3,495 00 52242 50) 4,207 50) $3,525 00) $3.71250 34,432 50|
| Adutt 2X 400
Price (per each) $5.3) $523 57 50) 3625 5666 3505 $773 $6.50) 3595 5791
Extended Price (per each) 52,128 00) 52,092 00) $3,000 00) $2,500 00} $2,120,00) $2,664 00| $2,020 00| $3,092 00) $2,60000 $2.380 00 $3,164 00|
Adut 3% 50
Price (per each) 56 94§ $6.96) $850 $801 57 66| 3678 $807 5700) $695 891
[Extended Price (per each) 5347 00} $348.00) $425 00} 340050 $27350) $383 00 $339.00) $403 50| $350.00) $34750 $445 50|
 Adur 4x 2
Price (per each) 56 944 $6.96) 3850 5601 $563 3866 3667} 58 18] 700 No Bid| $9.41
[Extended Price (per each) $173 50} $17400f $21250) $20025| $140 75| $216 50| $171 78] 520450 $175.00) $235.25
Adun 5X 2
[Prce (per each) 56 94 55 96} 850 801 5966 s704) $9.02 - G2400 Gidan) 5750) No 8id 5951
Extended Price (per each) 5173 50) s17400] 521250 $200 25| $241 50 $176 00) $225 50) $187 50) 5237 75)




Gpened:
For:

6100012605

June 26, 2020

Annual Contract for Promational T-Shirts,

Local

-Local

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Local

-Local

Non-Local

cal

Description

Annual
Quantity

Local
(A1 Sports Center
1027 Bandera Road
San Antonio

(210) 664-0566 (.

[Bankson Group LTD dba
Alamo Tees & Advertising
12814 Cogburn

San Antonio
TX 78245 TX 78249

210) 699-3800

Non.
[Advertising Matters, LLC
3412 S Grove Street

Fort Worth
TX 76110

[Al-Star Custom Apparel and
Design, Inc.

395 Summit Point Drive, Sute
1

Henrietta
INY 14467

[American Solutions for
Business
19901 1H 10 West

San Antonio
TX 78230

Springfieid
MO 65802

[Express Press.

1860 E St Louss St

Newalla
Ok 74857

Heart N Soul Graphic Designs
|and Photography
13529 Chandelie Drive

[Heaven Sent Promotions and
Apparel LLC
5611 San Pedro Ave

San Antonio
TX 78212

Non.
[Fromoational Designs

8150 Brooknver Dr Sute S-
155

Daias
ITX 75247

[RWercity Screen Printing &

Non-Lo:
[ROSCG Imprints and

Y
1709 South H-35

San Marcos
ITX 78666

Y
120 S Avenue B

Freeport
TX 77541

Color Imprint
1 Color Imprint

2 Color imprint

3 Color Imprint

4 Color Imprint

2nd Location Color Imprint

Art Change per Hour
Set Up Fee

Subtotal
Prompt Payment Discount

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount
item 1 Total:

T-Shirt, Colored (Light and Dark)
irt

100% Cotton Sh
Brand Name

Style #

18,000

s070f

090}

$1.10)

$130f

50.70f

$5.00)
35 00f

$22.426 70f
0%}

$22,426 7
$22,426 70|

No Bi

No Bid]

5079

5091

$1.08|

$1.29)

50.72]

$10.0(
$10.0

$23,466.19)
0%]

523,466 19)
$23,466.1

Gidan, Hane

G500, G200, G5008, G2008 |
5250, 54500, G540,65408,

50 50]

$1.00]

$1.20)

$1.40)

$1.00 1 or 2 color|

No chargel
No chargel

$31785 10|
0%

$31,755 10|
$31,755 10|

Gidan

6240, G2408, 5586, 5450]

50.24)

$0.30|

50 4|

$052|

$0.24 standard|
30 83 Seeve|

$46.00
$20.00 per screen

$35,364 35|
0%|

$35,364.35|
$35,364 35|

NAS
Frut of the Loom (Port & Co|

PC54LS for 4x & 5x long|
sleeve)

3930R]

0.38|

50 49|

5056,

5065

5038

$0.00)

$16 20 Per Color, Per
Location

322,793 54|

0%|

$22,793 54|
$22.793 54|

NAS

Gidan Heavy Cotton T-Shirt
(Short Skeeve Adut & Youth)|
*Long Sleeve is Port &
Company Long Skeeve Corel
Cotton Tee (PC54LS)

5000 - Adult 50008 Youth|

NAS

Port & Company]

$075)

5050

$0.50)

$0.50f

$0.75]

No charge
No charge|

$28,963 00|
0%

$28,963 00|
$28,963.00f

PCs4

$1.00)

$1.10|

$1.15)

$1.25|

5050

5000
50,00

$17.383 25|

$17,383.25|
$17.383 25|

Gidan

5000

30,46,

5060

$069)

$0.80)

$10.00}
$10.00 per color]
528,894 80|

1%
$28,605 85|
$28,605 85|

Port & Company|

PC81, PCE1Y, PCBILS
G2408 (Gildan)|

$065|

30.80)

$1.10)

$065)

$15.00)
$15.00)

$29,034 15|

0%}
$29,034.15|
529.03415|

NAS

Gildan, Port & Company|

$55000, 50008 LS 54008,
PCBILS|

111 Callfor Pricing
12:35 Call for Pricing|
2.65)

72443 $220
144-287 $190)
288503 $180|
504+ $165

008+ $155

2500+ Callfor Pricng

1-11 Callfor Pricng
1235 Callfor Pricing|
3671 $305
72143 $250)
144287 $230|
288503 $310)
504+ $190)

1008+ $175)
2500+ Callfor Pricing

1-11 Call for Pricing)|
1235 Callfor Priong|
36-71 $3.45|

72143 $300|
144287 $260
288-503 $245)

504+ $210|

1008+ $195|

2500+ Callfor Pricing

1-11 Callfor Pricing
1235 Callfor Pricing|
3671 $370|
72143 $340
144287 $300)
288503 $285|
504+ $240)

$220

2500+ Callfor Pricng

111 Callfor Pricng
1235 Callfor Pricing|
3671 $100 each)
72-143 $ 80 each|
144-287 'S B0 each
288503 $ 80 each|
504+ § 70 each)
1008+ $ 70 each
2500+ Callfor Pricing

Waned|
$15.00 per color|
$27,35000)

$27,350 00|
$27.350 00

NAS

Same as tem 1

$1.00]

50 29|

50 29|

50 29|

$1 00|

525 00)
$10.00)

$33,160 37|

$33,160 37|
$33.160 37|

NAS

Port & Company)

PCB1/PCHILS]




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation
Gpened June 26, 2020 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
) AT Sporis Center [Bankeon Group LTO dba | Adveriing Matters, LG [AI-Star Cusiom Apperel and | American Sotions for Express Press Fieart N Soul Graphic Designs [Fieaven Sent Promotons and Desgns 9% [ROSCO imprints and
For; A Sttt o g AR 1S Alamo Tees & Advertising Design, inc Business and Photography Apparel, LLC [Embrowdery Embroidery
— oL [1027 Bandera Road 12814 Cogbumn 312 S Grove Street 395 Summt Point Dive, Sute {9901 1H 10 West 1860 € St Lous St 13529 Chandelle Dive 5611 San Pedro Ave 8150 Brookver Dr Sute S [1709 South IH-35 120 S Avenue B
1 156
San Antonio San Antonio Fort Worth Hernetta San Antonio Springfekd Newala San Antonio Dales San Marcos Freepon
Estimated |TX 76245 ITX 78249 T 76110 NY 14467 Tx 78230 MO 65802 (K 74857 T 78212 TX 75247 T 78666 TX 77541
Description Annual  [(210) 6640566 (210) 699-3800
5050 Cotton Poly Blend Shirt 18,000
Brand Name Jerzees Gidan} Gidan, Hanes, Jerzees] Gidan| Jerzees (Port & Co PCS5LS No Bid| Port & Company, No B Port & Company| Gildan, Jerzee, Port & Port & Company
for 4x & 5x ong seeve)
Sty # 208/29M G240, G2408|  GB0D, GB0OB, 5170, 29M 8000 20MR] No B Poss| No 8| PCSs, PCsSY, PCssLS 29BL| S 8000, 80008 LS Por PCSS/PCISLS|
298, 5370, G840, G8408, (Jerzees) PCSSLS, Jerzee 2984|
290 298]
21 |Short Sieeve Light and Dark Colors
Youth Xsmal - Xiarge 6,000
Prce (per each) 5215 225 5275 5375 s214 5370 5187 5331 5280 5350
Extended Prie (per each) 512,200 00) $1350000} 51650000} 5225500 00) $1284000 $2220000) $11,22000) $19.860.00 $16,80000 52100000
| Adut Smal - Xiarge 6000
Price (per each) 5207} 5233 s275) $412 s251 370 5177 5390 s285) 5435
Extended Pre (per each) $12.42000) 513880 00) 51650000 52472000 $15,06000 $22,20000) 510620 00) 523,400 00 $17,100 00| 526,100 00)
At 2 750
Prce (per each) 53 99) 5408 $475) 5612 saa $5.70) 5378 s585 5535 36 35
Extended Price (per each) 52,985 00} $3,06000) 53,562 50) 5459000 $3,315 00) $4,275.00) 5282000 54387 50 $401250) $4.762 50)
Adun 3%
Prce (por each) 75 55,99 55 40) 5525 $772 5557 5670 s457 3641 5685 5735
Extended Price (per each) 52246 25 52,025 00} 51,968 75 5289500 52,088 75| 5251250 $171375 240375 5256875 $2756 25
| Adult 4X
Prce (per each) 200 55 55 40) $525 772 $557 5770 s457 3656 s685 5785
Extended Prie (per each) 1198 $1.080 00} $1.05000 5154400 $1,11400 $154000) 5914 00) $131200 $137000 $157000)
Adut SX
Prece (per each) 200 s5 99} $540 5525 s772 5557 s870) 5457, 7.3 s585 5795
Extended Price (per each) $1,198 00 $1,080 00| $1.050.00| $1.544 00| $1.114 00| $1.740 00 $914 00| $1.472.00 $1,370 00) $1.590 00}
22 [Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colors:
Youth Xsmal - Xiarge 2,000
Price (per each) $529) s5.85) 5675 5639 5430 5603 s418 5583 $475 57 65
Extended Price (per each) 510,580 00} $11,700 00} $13,500.00) $12.78000 $8,600.00 $12,060,00| $8,360 00 $11,660 00 5950000 $15,30000
Adut Smal - Xiarge 2000
Price (per each) 5437 $450 675 5698 5526 3603 5295 5708 5550 5765
Extended Price (per each) 8740 00) 59,000 00} $13500.00 $13.96000 $10,52000 $12.060 00| 55,900 00) $14160 00 $11.00000 $1530000
Aduft 2X 250
Price (per each) 56 68} s5.95 5775 5775 $567, 803 553 5902 5725 $963|
Extended Prie (per each) $167000) 51,487 50} $1937 50 $193750 51667 50) $2,00750 51340 00) 52255 00| $181250 241250
Adur 3x 125
Prce (per each) $833) 5756} s875 s925 681 $9.03 s582 5941 5775, s1065,
Extended Prie (per each) 51,041 25) $345 00) $100375 5115625 585125 $112875 §72750 $117625 5968 75 133125
Adut 4x 50
Price (per each) 383 575¢] 875 5925 s7.11 $1003) 5853 5953 5775 $1115
Extended Price (per each) 5416 50) 5378 00) $437 50 546250 5355 50) 550150 5426 50 5476 50 5387 50) 5557 50)
Acur 5% 50
Prce (per each) 353 5756 5875 5925 No B $11.03) sa53 51037 825 1125
Extended Price (per each) 3416 50) 5378 00) 5437 50) $46250) $55150 542650 551850 41250 5562 50)
23 Color Imprint
1 Color mprnt 070} s077) 5050 024 038 s075 s100 5046} s06s, 5129
2 Color imprint 5090} sos1 $1.00 5030 s04g| 5050) 110 50 60) 5080 503
3 Color mprint s1.10f 5108 5120 046 5056 5050 $115 $069) 095 5032
4 Color Imprint 5130 s1.26] $1.40 5052 5065, 5050 125 5080 5110 5032
2nd Location Color imprnt 5070 s072) $100 1 0r 2 color 5024 standard 5038 5075 $050) $100 5065 $1.29)
5083 Sleeve|
Art Change per Hour $5.00 $1000) No charge] 546,00 5000 No charge s000 $10.00) $15.00 Wanved $25.00)
Set UpFee $5.00) $10.00f No charge| 52000 per screen $16.20 Per Color, Per N charge 5000 $10.00 per color| $15.00 $15.00 per caor| $10.00)
Location|
Subtotal $55,826 20} $58,638 19 $71,542 60} $88,620 10 $57 548 91 $82.779 75 $45,387 25| $83.105 05 $67.336 65| $0.00| $93 281 04
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 0% 0%} 1% 0%} 0%, 0%}
Total Cost wih Prompt Payment Discourt 571542 60) 58862010 $57548.91 8277975} 545,387 25| $82274.00 557 336 65| $0.00 593,281 04|
Rem 2 Total: ¥ $71,542 60| 588,620 10 $5754891 8277979 545,387 25| $82274.00 567,336 65| 50,00 593,281 04|
3 T-Shirt (Tall), White NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAs NAS NAS
100% Cotton Shirt 500
Brand Name PCB1T Port & Company Portand Company|  Port & Company Tai Core| Port& Compary|  Gikdan 2000T Anvi 5628| Port & Company/ Port& Company| Port& Company Longsieeve Port & Company|
Coton Tee,
styte # nosa| G207, Pes1T, Pe6ILS: PesTT] PCsAT] pesT] 20007 5628 PC61T, PCSILST| PCSAT. PCSALST, PCSILST PCE1T, PCEILST] PCH1TPCE1LST Ony

PCS4T (PCBALST for long|
sleeve)

available in Adult Large 4 XL T|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2020 Local = Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
i (AT Sports Center [Bankson Group LTD dba | Advertsing Matters, LLC | Al-Star Custom Appareland _[Amencan Solutons for Express Press Feart N Soul Graphic Desgns [Heaven Sent Promotions and Designs Rivercty Pinting& [ROSCO Imprints and
: T
it AooyalCaek tor PYamationsl T:Shins [ Alamo Tees & Advertising [Design. Inc 5 land Photography Apparel, LLC [Embroidery Embrodery
16100012605 GoL 1027 Bandera Road 12814 Cogbumn 3412 S Grove Street 395 Summit Point Drive, Sufte 19901 IH 10 West 1860 E St Louis St 13629 Chandelle Drive 5611 San Pedro Ave. 8150 Brookriver Dr Sutte S- 1709 South IH-35 120 S Averiue B
1
san Antono san Antonio Fort Worth Hennetta [san Antonio Springfield Newalia San Antonio Dalas. san Marcos Freeport
Estimated |TX 78245 TX 78249 [TX 76110 INY 14467 | TX 78230 MO 65802 |OK 74857 TX 78212 | TX 75247 TX 78666 |TX 77541
Description Annual  [(210) 664.0566 (210) 699-3800
Quantity
50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Shirt 600
Brand Na Port & Company, Gildan| Gildan, Port & Company} Port & Company| Port and Company| No Bid| Port & Company| No Bid| Port & Company| Port & Company| Port & Company Longsieeve| Port & Company|
Style # PCB1T, PC55T, GT200, G200T, PC61T, PCSSLST| PCS5T] PCS5T]| No Bud| PCSST) No Bud| PCSST]| PCS5T PCS5LST) PCS5T. PCS5LST]| PC55T/PCS5LST Only|
PCS55LST| avaiable in Adut Large 4 XLT
31 Short Sleeve T-Shirt (Tall), White:
| Youth Xsmall - X- 75
[ No 8iof 5350) No B No B No B 33 84| No B} No B NoBd No Bl No Bi|
e P (pef each) 262 50} $288.00)
| Adut Small - 7%
Price (per eac s294L 8] ss 57 00| $4.49for L & XL Ony| $281LTAXLT 5384 s414) $406] 5375 $495 Large & X-Laige| 3428
et Prs (pev each) 522050} sa12 $525 00) 5336 75| 521075 288,00 $31050] $30450 5281 25| $37125) 321 00)
Adut 2X 75
Proe (per eac 5499 55 50) 59 50] 56 62] $470 3584 s479) 56 78] $6.00 $6.95) 3678
it Pron (pe: each) $373 50} 5412 50} $71250) $496 50| $35250) $438 00| $359 25| $508 50| $450 00| $52125) $508 50|
Adutt 3X 7%
Price (per each) 55249 $5 50} 975 3668 $491 5684 $5.41 57.07] $6 50 5725 5728
Extended Price (per each) $393 00} $41250) $73128) $516 00} 536825, 613 00| 405 75| $530 25| 5487 50| 354375 $546.00]
Adut 4x 75
Price (per each) 55 40} $5 50} $10 00} 716 $5.22) 5784 3600 $733) $675) $7.95) $778
Extended Price (per each) 41175 5412 50) 5750 00] $537.00] $39150) $586 00| $450 00) 5549 75| $506 25| $596 25| $583 0]
Adut 5 75
Price (per each) No &) 35 50} No B No Bi| No Bi| 58 84 3600} No Bi No Bid| NoBd No Bid|
Extended Price (per each) 8412 50) 5663 00| $450 00}
32 |Long Sleeve T-Shirt (Tail), White:
Youth Xsmal - Xiarge 2
Prce (per each) No 8| 3450} NoBd) No 8| No B 3602 3418 No B No B No Bid| No B
Extended Price (per each) $11250) $150 50| $104 50|
| Adutt Smal - Xiarge 25
Price (per each) $407L & XL $5.508 $9 00] $7 18 for L & XL Only| No Bud| $6 02| $5 56 $6 25 $5 00 $6 95) $6 28|
[Extended Price (per each) $101 75} 5137 50) 5225 00) 17950 $150 50| $139 00} $156 25| $125 00| $17375) $157 00
Adut 2X 2
Prce (per eac 3534 3550 $1100) 5953 No B 5802 35 56] 5912) $7.25 $8.95| 58 78]
et e (per each) $133 50} $137 50 $275.00 5238 25| $20050] $139 00| $228.00) 518125 $223.75| 5219 50)
Adut 3X 2
Prce (per eac 35 49) 55 50} $12.00) 59 95| No B $902) NoBd 5964 5750 59 95| 59 28|
i Proe (per each) $137 25} $137.50) $300 00} $248 75| 5225 50) 524100] 518750 524875 523200
Adult 4X 25
Price (per each) $5 79 $5.5 $13 00) $11 1 No Big| $10 02| No Bid| $1106 $8 50| $1095 $9 78|
Extended Price (per each) $14475) $137 $326 00} 277 75| $250 50| 5276 50 $21250 $273.75) 524450
daae %
Prce (per o B $550) No 8 No Bid| No Bid $1102) No Bid| No Bid No Bid| NoBid No Bl
Exte m\ded P!n! (pev each) $137 50) $275 50|
33 |Color imprint
1 Color Imprint. $0 70§ $072) $0 50] $0.24) $0 38| $0 75 $1 00 $0 46| $0 65 1-11 Call for Pricng| $1 00|
12:35 Call for Pricing|
3671 5265
72143 $220
144-287 $190]
288503 $150)
504+ $1.65)
1008+ $155

2500+ Call for Pricing|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

[Opened: Tune 26, 2020 Local = Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
) AT Sports Center [Bankeon Group LTDdba | Adverising Matlers, LLC _[AJ-Star Custom Apparel and [American Soutions for Express Press [Fieart W Soul Graphe: Designs [Feaven Sent Promotons and Designs g8 [ROSCO mpints and
Fat: AnoaCanniGt o G RoNon 751t Alamo Tees & Advertising Design, inc usiness. and Photography Apparel, LLC v Embroxtery Embrowdery
T coL 1027 Bandera Rosa 12814 Cogbum 34125 Grove Street 225 Summi Por D, Suke: 5601 14 10 W 1850 € St Lous St 13529 Chandelle Dive 5611 San Pedro Ave 8150 Brookiver Dr Sute S [1709 South 1H-35 120 S Avenue 8
155
San Antonio San Antonio Fort Warth | Henretta San Antonio Springfield [Newalla San Antonio Dallas San Marcos Freeport
Estimated [T 78245 TX 78249 TX 76110 INY 14467 [TX 78230 MO 65802 OK 74857 [TX 78212 TX 75247 [ TX 78666 |TX 77541
Description Annual  [(210) 6640566 (210) 699.3800
Quantity
2 Color Imprint 50 5 | 3100 030] 3049 50.50] 5110 $060| $080[ 711 Call for Pricng %029
1235 Cal for Pricing|
36-71 $3.05|
72-143 $250|
144287 $230
288-503 $3 10|
504+ $190)
1008+ $175)
2500+ Callfor Pricng|
3 Color imprnt. $11 $1.08 $1 20| $0 46| $0 56| $0 50| $115) 30 69] $0.95) 1-11 Call for Prcing| 50 29|
1235 Call for Pricng|
36-71 $3.45)
72-143 $3.00|
144287 $260)|
288.503 52.45|
504+ $210)
1008+ $195)
2500+ Callfor Pricing|
4 Color Imprint $1 30] $1 26} $1 40} $052] $0.65| $0 50| §125) $0 80) $110) 1-11 Call for Pricing| S0 29
12:35 Callfor Prcing|
36-71 $3 70|
72.143 $3.40|
144-287 $3.00]
288503 $285
504+ $2 40|
1008+ $220
2500+ Callfor Pricing
2nd Location Color Imprint $0 70) 072 $1.00 1 or 2 color] $0 24 standard| $0 38| $0 75) $0 50] $100] $0 65 1-11 Call for Pricing $1.00|
S0 83 Sleeve] 12:35 Callfor Pricing|
36-71 $1.00 each|
72-143 § 8O each|
144287 580 each|
288-503 $ 80 each|
504+ $.70 each|
1008+ $ 70 each
2500+ Callfor Prcing|
Art Change per Hour 5500 1000 No charge| 46.00 000 No charge| 5000} $1000 $1500 Waned| 52500
Set Up Fee $5 00f $1000] No charge $20 00 per screen) $16 20 Per Color Per| No charge| S0 00] $10 00 per color| $15 00| Per color| $10 00|
Locaton)
sublotal $193070 53149 69) 3384885 289885 134629 $4034 00 5236300 52818 30) $2.46540 5205250 52849 87]
Prompt Payment Dscount 0%] 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%) 1% 0% 0% 0%
Total Cost wih Prompt Payment Discount 51,930 70 53,140 69) 53848 85 52,898 85 $1.34629 54,034 00| $2:363.00 5279012 $2.465.40 5205250 52849.87)
em 3 Total: $1,63070 53,149, 53848 85 s2808.85 $1,34629 5403400 52,363 00) incomplete Bl 8246540 5295250 52,849 87|
4 T-Shirt (Tall), Colored (Light and Dark) NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS Nas NAS NAS
100% Cotton Shirt 1.000
Brand Name No Bid} Gidan, Port & Compar Port and Company| Portand Company| ~ Port & Company Tall Core| Port & Company| Gidan, Anvif Port & Company| Port & Company| Same as tem 3 Port & Company]
Caton Teel
Style # NoBa|  G200T PCBIT, PCILST] PC61T|  PCSAT (PCBILST for long| PCSAT PoB1T] 20007, 5628 pee1T PCSAT, PCSALST] PCBITRCEILST Only)
sieeve avaiiable i Adult Large 4 XLT
50150 Cotton Poly Blend Shirt 1,000
Brand Name Port & Company Gidan|  Gidan, Port & Company] Port & Compary/ Port and Company| No Bid Port & Company| No B Port & Compary| Port & Company| Port & Compary/
Style # PC6IT. PCSST, GT200|  G200T PCB1T PCSSLST] PessT] PCSST No Bid PCsST No Bid PCSST PCS5T, PCS5LST] PCS5TRCSSLST Only|
PCS5LST| avallable In Adult Large 4 XLT
a1 Short Sieeva T-Shirt (Tall), Colored (Light and Dark)
Youth Xsmal - Xiarge 7%
Prce (per each) o Bid sa70} No B o Bid| No B 5548 No Bid No 8id No 8| No B
Extended Price (per each) $35250) 5411 00)
Adut Smal - Xlarge 125
Price (per each) 3800 8] ss79) 5725 $5.43L & XL Only S387LTAXLT $548 5569 $575 $475 Large & X-Large| 3525
Extended Pre (per each) sa86 25| s84375) 906 25| 3678 75| $685 00) sr1125| s718.75| 3593 75| $656 25




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation
Opened: June 26, 2020 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local n-Local Non-Local Non-Local
i ~ (A7 Sports Center Bankson Group LTD dba | Advertising Mafters, LLC [All-Star Custorn Apparel and | American Soliions for [Express Press [Feart N Soul Graphic Designs |Heaven Sent Promotions and_|Promotional Designs Riverciy Screen Printing & [ROSCO Imprints and
s AL COMACLIOE PTa mOlAITES s, Alamo Tees & Advertising Design, Inc Business [and Photography Apparel, LLC Embroidery Embrowdery
iooaianss GpL 1027 Bandera Road 12814 Cogbum 3412'S Grove Street 395 Summit Point Drve, Sute (9901 IH 10 West 1860 E St Louis St 13529 Chandelie Drive 5611 San Pedro Ave 8150 Brookriver Dr Suite S- 1709 South 1435 120 S Avenue 8
1 155
san Antonio |San Antonio Fort Worth Henrietta San Antonio Springfield Newalla San Antonio Dalas San Marcos Freeport
Estimated [TX 78245 TX 78249 TX 76110 Iy 14467 [TX 78230 MO 65802 0K 74857 TX 78212 [TX 75247 Tx 78666 TX 77541
Description Annual  ((210) 6640566 (210)699-3800
Quantity
Adui 2X 150
Price (per each) $6.08 3679 59.75) $7.76 5585 $7.48) $6.15] $873) $725 5775
Extended Price (per each) $912 00) $1,012.50) $1,462 50| $1,164.00) $87750 $1,12200 92250 $1,309 50| $1,087 50| 116250
Adut 3X 150
Price (per each) $6.36 3675 $10.00) $8.08 $6.07 $8.48| $6.85 $9.06) 750 $8.25
Extended Price (per each) $954.0 $1,012 50) 51,500 00| §1,21200| $91050) $1,272.00 1,027 50) $1.359 00| $1,125.00) $1.237 501
Adut 4X 150
Prce (per each) $6 69 $6.79) $1025) $8.40) $6.91 $9.48| No Bid| $9.42) $850 $8.75
Extended Price (per each) $1,003 50| $1,012 50f $1,537 50f $1,260 00| $1,036 501 $1,422.00 $1,413 00| $1275 00| $1,312 50|
Adut 5X 125
Proe (per each) o 8id} $6.75) No Bid No Bd No Bid $10 48| No Bidf No Bid| No Bid| No 8id|
Extended Price (per each) $843 75 $1,310.00
42 Long Sleeve T-Shirt (Tall), Colored (Light and Dark)
Youth Xsmall - Xiarge 2
Prce (per each) No Bid $5 80) No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.50) No Bidf No Bid No Bid No Bid|
Extended Price (per each) $14500) $187 50|
| Adut Smail - Xiarge 25
Price (per each) s525L8x $7.00) 59 25| $853 L& XL Ony No Bid 57.50) $5.56 $771 $7.00 Large & X-Large| 725
Extended Price (per each) $131.25) $175.00 $231.25 $21325 $187 50| $139.00) $19275 $175.00 $181.25)
Adut 2X 50
Price (per each) 36 59| 57.00) $11.25] $1091 No Bid 59 50) 556 $1055| $830 $9.75
Extended Price (per each) $329 50} $350 00} $56250) $545 50| $475.00) $278.00 $527.50 $415.00 5487 50)
Adut 3X 50
Price (per each) 5674 57.00] $1225] $11.70) No Bid $10.50) No Bid $11.48) $850 510 25|
Extended Price (per each) $337 $350 00f 361250 $585.00 $525.00] $574.00 425 00| $51250)
Adut 4X 50
Price (per each) 7 0g) 57.00| $13.25) $1280) No Bid $11.50) No Bid $1280) $850 $10.75]
Extended Price (per each) $354 00} $350 00) $66250) $640 00| $575 00| $64000 $425.00 $537 50)
Adut 5X 2
Price (per each) No Bid} 57.00) No 8id No Bid No Bid $1250 No Bid No Bd No Bid No Bid|
Extended Price (per each) 517500} $312.50]
43 Color Imprint
1 Color imprint 50 70] s0.72] 5050 5024 5038 5075 $1.00 5046 5065 $129
2 Color Imprint 509 5091 $100) $0.30) 5049 5050 $110) 5060 080 5032
3 Color mprint $110) $108 $1.20) $0.46| 5056 5050 $1.15 3069 5095 5032
4 Color Imprint $130 $1.29) $140 5065 5050 5125 5080 $110) 5032
2nd Location Color Imprint $070 5072 $1,00 1 0r2 colof $0.24 standard| 038 $0.75 No Bf $1.00) 065 $129
50,83 Sleeve|
At Change per Hour $5.00) $10.00) No charge| $46 00| 50.00| No charge 50,00 $10.00} $15.00) Wanved $25.00)
Set Up Fee 5.0 $1000) No charge| 520 00 per screen| $16.20 Per Color, Per| No charge 5000 $10.00 per colo $15.00) $15 00 Percolor $1000
Location
Subtotal $4,522 20} $6,647 19| §7,480.10) $6.366 85| $3331 16| $8.487 50) $3082 75| $6.758 05| $5,555 40| $0.00) $6.126 04|
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%) 0% 1%) 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount 54,522 20} $6,647 19| §7,480.10) $6,366 85| $3,331 16| 58,487 50) $3,082 75| $6,690 47| $5,555 40| 50.00) $6,126.04|
Ktem 4 Total: $4,522 20| $6.847.19) $7,480 10| $6,366 85| $3.331 18| $8,487 50) $3,082 75| $6,690 47| $5,555 40| $0.00) $6,126.04|
5 T-Shirt, Wicking, White NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS
100% Polyester Wicking Knit 4,000
Brand Name Augase] Augusta, Team 365| Gidan Portand Company| Sport Tek Men's PosiCharge| Augusta A4 Sport Tek| Badger Team 365| Sport Tek|
Compettor Tee
Style # 790, 791 790,791, TT11, TT11Y| G420) PC380) ST350 790| N3142 ST350 + YST350, 790 ©2:51000, C2-520000} TT11|  ST350 (4XL Largest Sze)
(Augusta - 5|
51 Short Sieeve T-Shirt, Wicking, White
Youth Xsmall - Xiarge 1500
Price (per each) $3.20) $3 50| $525| 5439 $376 $462) 5370 5436 $4.25| $3.50) 5454
Extended Price (per each) 54,800 00} $5,250 00| $7,675 00| $6,565.00| $5,640.00| $6,93000) $5,550.00) $6,540 00| $6,375.00) $5,250.00f $6,810 00|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Gpened: June 26, 2020 Local Local Non-Local Non-Loc: Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
(A7 Sports Center [Bankson Group LTD dba | Advertising Matters, LLC AV-Star Custom Appareland _|Amencan Soktions for Express Press [Feard N Soul Graphic Designs [Heaven Sent Promotions and_|Promotional Designs Rivercty Screen Printing & |ROSCO Imprints and
For: Annual Contract for Promotional T-Shirts [atamo Tees, &immmg - esign, inc Busness and Photography Apparel, LLC y . ,D
sdeEReE GoL  [1027 BanderaRoad 12814 Cogbum 3412'S Grove Street 395 Summit Point Drive, Sute 9901 IH 10 West 1860 E St Louss St 13529 Chandelle Drve 5611 San Pedro Ave 8150 Brookiiver Or Sute S~ [1709 South H-35 120 S Avenue B
1
San Antonio san Antonio Fort Worth Hennetta San Antonio Springfield Newalia San Antonio Dailas San Marcos Freeport
Estimated |TX 78245 ITx 78249 TX76110 vy 14467 X 78230 MO 65802 Ok 74857 Tx 78212 TX 75247 TX 78666 TX 77541
Description Annual  [(210) 664.0566 (210) 699-3800
uantity
[AGuR Small - Xiarge 1500
Prce (per each) 53.20) $350 55 50) 3466 $430 $462 $3.70) 5498 5425 $350 3519
Extended Price (per each) $4,600 00} $5,250 00| $8.250.00) $6.990 00| $6,450 00| $6,930 00| 35,550 00) 7,470 00) $6,375 00| $5,250 00 $7,785 00f
Adut 2X 800
Prce (per each) $3.20 $495 36 50| $573 $537 $6.62 54.70) 5623 $675 3450 3659
Extended Price (per each) $2.560.00) $3,960 00| $5,200.00) $4,584 00| $4,296.00) $5.296.00) $3,760.00) $4984.00) $5,400 00| $3,600.00) $527200
Adut 3% 100
Prce (per each) §5 49 $5.95 57 50) $6.48 5752 5762 $5 20| $8 73 $675 $5 50 3859
Extended Price (per each) $546 00) $595.00 $750.00) $64800) $75200) $762.00 $52000) $87300 $675.00) $550 00 $859.00
Adut ax 50
Prce (per each) 56 64 $6.95 No Bid| $7.01 $8.60) $8.62) $570) $9.98 $675 $6.50) 10,00}
Extended Price (per each) $33200) $34750 $35050 $430.00 $431.00 285 00| $499 00 $337 50) $325.00 $500.00
Adut 5X 50
Price (per each) 5786 5895 No Bid| No Bid No Bid $9.62) No Bid| $1225 $12.00| No Bid No Bid|
Extended Price (per each) $393.01 $447 50 48100 $61250 $60000
52 Color Imprint
1 Color Imprint s0.79) 5072 $0.75| 5024 5038 5075 $100 5046 5065 1-11 Callfor Pricing $1.00
12:35 Call for Pricing
3671 $265|
72:143 $220
144.287 $190)
288503 $180)
504+ $165
1008+ $155
2500+ Callfor Pricing|
2 Color imprint $0.90| 5091 $125 030 049 $050) $110) 5060 5080 111 Callfor Pricing| 50.29)
1235 Call for Pricing|
3671 $305)
72143 $250)
144.287 $230)
288-503 $3.10
504+ $190
1008+ $175
2500+ Callfor Pricing|
3 Color imprint $119) $108 5145 5046 5056 5050 $115) 5069 $095 111 Call for Pricing| $029
1235 Callfor Pricing|
3671 §345|
72143 $300|
144287 $260)
288-503 $245
504+ $210
1008+ $195
2500+ Callfor Pricing|
4 Color imprint $130) $126 5165 5052 50865 50,50 $1.25] 5080 $1.10) 111 Callfor Pricing 50,29
12:35 Callfor Pricing|
3671 $370|
72143 $3.40)
144287 $3 00|
288503 $285)
504+ $2.40)
1008+ 5220
2500+ Callfor Pricing|
2nd Location Color imprint 5071 5072 125 $0.24 standard| $0.38| 5075 5050 $1.00 $065 111 Callfor Pricing| 5100
5083 Sleeve| 1235 Call for Pricing|
3671 $1.00 each|
72143 ' 80 each|
144.287 $.80 each)
288:503 $.80 each)
504+ §70 each|
1008+ $.70 each|
2500+ Callfor Pricing}
Art Change per Hour $5.00) $10.00] No charge| 546 00| 5000 No charge 50.00) $10.00) $15.00] Waned 525 00f
Set Up Fee 55 00| $10.00) No charge| $20 00 per screen| $16 20 Per Color, Per| No charge $000) $10.00 per color $15.00| $15.00 per color $10.00
Locaton|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation
Opened: June 26, 2020 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
" (A1 Sports Center [Bankson Group LTD dba | Advertising Matters, LLC Al Star Custom Appareland _|American Solutions for Express Press [Heart N Soul Graphic Designs [Heaven Sent Promotions and_|Promotional Designs [Riverciy Screen Printing &  [ROSCO \mpvmts and
For: s
° GLE L R | Atamo Tees & Advertising Design, Inc Business and Photography Apparel, LLC y
(— opL  [1027 BanderaRoad 12814 Cogburn 34125 Grove Street 395 Summit Point Drive, Sute |9901 1H 10 West 1860 E St Louis St 13529 Chandelle Drive 5611 San Pedro Ave 8150 Brookriver Dr Sute S- (1709 South IH-35 1205 Avence 8
1 155
San Antonio San Antonio Fort Worth Henrietta San Antonio Springfield Newala san Antonio Dallas San Marcos Freeport
Estimated TX 78245 ITX 78249 TX 76110 Iy 14467 Tx 78230 MO 65802 0K 74857 T 78212 X 75247 TX 78666 ITX 77541
Description Annual  ((210) 664-0566 (210) 699-3800
uan
Subtotal 515,674 69] $22,081 35 $19,225.85 $17,586.66 520,833 00) $15.670.00) 521,002 05 $19.796 65 $14,97500) $21263 87
Prompt Payment Discount 0%| 0% 0% 0% 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $15,874 69| 22,081 35 $19,22585 $17.586.66 $20,833.00) $15,670.00 2079203 1979665 $14,975.00) $2126387
kem § Total: $15,874 69| 52208135 $19,225 85 17,586 66 $20,633.00 $15,670.00 $20,79203 19,796 65 $14,975 00| $21.263 87|
6 T-Shirt, Colored Wicking (Light and Dark) NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS
100% Polyester Wicking Knit 9.000
Brand Name Augusta, Team 365 Gildan Portand Company| Sport Tek Men's PosiCharge Augusta) A4 Sport Tek Badger| Same as tem 5 Sport Tek
Compettor Tee
Style # 790, 791] 790, 791, TT11, TT11Y| Gaz0) PCago) ST350) 790) N3142 ST350 + YST350, 790 €2.510000. C252000) ST350 (4XL Largest Size)
(Augusta - 5|
81 Short Sleeve T-Shirt Colored Wicking (Light and Dark)
Youth Xsmall - xlarge 4000
Price (per each) $3 50| $535 5439 $376 $462) 5370 5436 5425 5454
Extended Pnce (per each) $1280000 $14,000 00 521,400 00) $17,560 00 $15,040 00 $18,480 00 $14,800.00 $17,440 00 $17.00000 $18.160 00|
Adut Small - Xiarge 4,000
Price (per each) $320) 5350 $5.60 34566 5430 $462) $3.70) $498| $425 3519
Extended Price (per each) $12,600 00 $14,000 00 $22.400 00) $18,640.00 $17,200.00 $18,480.00 $14800.00 $19,920 00 $17.00000 $20.760.00)
Adut 2X 500
Price (per each) $3.20] $4 95| 56,60} $573] $537, $6.62] $4.70] $6 23| $425 $6.59)
Extended Price (per each) $1,600 00 $2,475.00) $3,300 00| $2,865.00) $2,685 00| $3,310.00) $2,35000) $3,115.00) $2,125.00| $3.295 00|
Adut 3% 250
Price (per each $5 46 5 95 5760 36 48 752 5762 $5.20) $873 $675 5859
Extended Price (per each) $1,365 00 $1,487.50) 51,2900 00| $1,62000) $1.880 00| $1,905.00) $1,300.00) $2,182 50 1,667 50| $2.147 50|
Adut 4x 125
Price (per e: 36 64 6 95| No Bid| $701 $8 60| 3862 $5.70) 5998 $675 $10.00]
Extended Pnce (pel each) $830.00) 3868 75| $876.25 $1,075 00| $1,07750) $71250 $1,247 50 $84375 $1.250 00|
Adut 5X 125
Price (per each) 78] 3895 No Bd No Bd No Bid 5962 No 8d $1225] $1200) No 8id
Extended Price (per each) $98250) $1,11875) $1,20250) . $1,531 25| $1,500 00|
62 Color Imprint
1 Color Imprint $07 $072) 5075 5024 5038 5075 $1.00 5045 $065 $129)
2 Color imprint 09| s091 $1.25 5030 5049 5050 51.10) 50.60) 50.80| 50,32
3 Color Imprint $11 $1.08) $145 5046 5056 5050 $115 5069 5095 5032
4 Color Imprint $130 $1.26) $1.65 5052 5065 50,50 $1.25 $0.80 $110 $032)
2nd Location Color imprint so 70} 5072 $1.25 $0 24 standard| 5038 50.75) 5050 $100 50865 5129
50,83 Sleeve
At Change per Hour $5 51000} No charge $46.00] $0.00) No charge 5000 $1000) $15.00) Waned 525.00]
Set Up Fee $50 $10 00| No charge| 520 00 per screen| $16.20 Per Color, Per No charge 5000 $10.00 per color $15.00} $15.00 per color $10.00]
ocation|
Subtotal 30,392 $33,974 69| $49,006 35 $41,629.60 $37.898.66 $44,458 00 $33,967 50 4545980 $40,190 40 50.00 $45,65104)
Prompt Payment Discount [ 0%) 0%|
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount 530,392 20f $33,974 69| $49,006 35 $41,629.60 §37,898 66 $44,456 00 $33.967 50 45,005 20 540,190 40| 5000 $45,651.04)
kem 6 Total: | 530,392 $33,974 69| $49,006 35 $41,629 60 $37,898.66 $44,456.00 $33,967 50 45,005 20 $40,190 40 $0.00 $45,651.04)
4 T-Shirt, (Tall) Wicking, White NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS
100% Polyester Wicking Knit 300
Brand Name Sport Tex] Sport TeH Sport Tek Sport Tek Sport Tek Men's Tail Sport-Tek Jerzees Dri Power, Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Sport Tek
PosiCharge Competior Tee
Style # TST350) TsT3s50) TST350) TST350 TST350 TST350) 29MT| TST350 TST350) TST350| TST350 (only available in adut
sizes large-4XL)|
74 Short Sleeve v-snm (Tall) Wicking, White
Youth XsmuM 50
Price (per ea No Bdf $5 50| No Bid No Bid No Bid| 5599 No Bidf No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid
xtended Prm (pereach) $275.00] 5296 50)
Adut Smail - Xlarge 50
Prce (per eac) 35 09) $5.50) 57.75) 5667 $537 LT &XLT) $593) $4.47 $623 $6 50 Large & X-Large| $599 $6 49
Extended Price (psrealm) $25250) $275 $387.50) $333 50) $268 50 $296.50) 522350 531150 25 00) $299 50| $32450
Adult 2 50
Price (per each) 36,05 56 65) $875 $7.72) $6.45 57.93) 5447 57.48 775 $6.99 $7.99
Extended Prie (per each) $30250) $332 50} $437 50} $386.00 $32250 $396.50| $223 50} 337400 $387 50| $349 50| $399 50|
Adut 3% 50
Price (per each 58,05} 38 85) 510 75| $9:82 $8.60) $8.93 $5.02 $9.98| $1050) $8.99 5999
Extended Price (per each) $402 50} $442 50} $537 50} $491.00 $430.00 $446 50) $251 00| $499 00| $525.00 $449 50| $499 50|
 Adut 4x 50
Price (per each) 59 05| 59 85) $1175] $1087] 5967 5993 No B §1123) $1175 5999 510 99|
Extended Price (per each) $453.00f $492 50) $587.50 $54350 548350 $496 50 $561 50) $587 50| $499 50) $549 50)
Adutt 5X 50
Price (per each) No 8] 9,85 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid $1093 No Bid| No Bid| No Bid NoBid| No Bid
Extended Price (per each) $492 50 §546 50|




Opened:
For:

16100012605

June 26, 2020
Annual Contract for Promotional T-Shirts.

Non-Local

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Local

Description

Estimated
Annual
Quantity

(210) 664-0566 (

Local Local
A7 Sports Center [Bankson Group LTD dba
[Alamo Tees & Advertisng
1027 Bandera Road 12814 Cogbumn

San Antonio San Antonio
TX 78245 X 78249

210) 699-3800

Fort Worth
TX 76110

Advertising Matters, LLC

Design, inc

3412 'S Grove Street 395 Summi
u

Henretta
INY 14467

[Ai-Star Custom Apparel and

it Point Diive, Sute

[American Soltons for
Business
9901 1H 10 West

san Antonio
TX 78230

Express Press,
1860 E StLous St

Springfield
MO 65802

Desgns

[Heaven Sent Promations and

Non-Local
Desirs

Hear N

Newalla
OK 74857

and Photagraphy
13529 Chandelle Drive

[Apparel, LLC
5611 San Pedro Ave

san Antonio
Tx 78212

Non-Local
Riercy Screen Printing &

Non-Local
[RGSCO Imprints and

8150 Brooknver Dr Sutte S-
155

Dallas
ITX 75247

Y
1709 South IH-35

San Marcos
TX 78666

120 S Averue B

Freeport
TX 77541

72

Color Imprint
1 Color Imprint

2 Color imprint

3 Color Imprint

4 Color imprnt

2nd Location Color Imprnt

Art Change per Hour
Set Up Fee

Subtotal

Prompt Payment Discount

Total Cast with Prompt Payment Discount
kem 7 Total:

| T-Shirt (Tall) Wicking Colored (Light and Dark)
100% Polyester Wicking Knit
[Brand Name

Styte #

0 70}

30 90§

$110)

$130)

35.00)

5 00]
$1,425 20]
0%]

$1,425 20}
Incomplete Bic|

Sport Ted

TsT350]

5108

s1000]
31000}

52,334 69

52,334 69)

Span-T

$0 50|

$1.20)

$1.00 1 0r 2 color|

No charge|
No charge|

$1,95510)

0%}
$1,955 10|
$1,955 10|

Sport Tek

TST350}

5024

50.30|

50 24 standard|
50 83 Sieeve|

346 0f
$20 00 per screen|
$1,822.35|

0%
$1,822 35|
51,822 35|

NAS
Sport Tek|

TST350]

5038

$0.49)

3000
$16 20 Per Color, Per
Locaton
$1,52315,
0%)
$1,523 16|
$1,52316)
NAS
Sport Tek Men's Tall

PosiCharge Competor Tee|
TSTas0)

50.75|

$0 50

50 50}

No charge
No charge|
52,482 00)

0%

52,482 00)
2,482 00)

Sport-Tek|

TST350}

$1.10)

$1.15)

5125

5050)

50 00|
50,00

$703 09|
0%

$703.00)
$703 00|

29MT|

$10 00
$10.00 per color| $15.00}

Incomplete Bd| $1,859.15|

50 46} $065|

5060} 5080

3069 $0.95|

080 $110)

$15.00]

$1.769 55 $1,859.15)
1% 0%}

$1,75185 $1,859 15|

Sport Tek| Sport-Tek

TST350) TST350)

111 Callfor Pricng|
1235 Callfor Pricing|
3671 5265
72143 $220)
144.267 5190}
288503 $1.80)
504+ $165|

1008+ $155

2500+ Callfor Pricing|

1-11 Callfor Pricng|
12:35 Cailfor Pricing|
3671 $3.05)
72143 $250)
144287 $230)
288-503 $3 10
504+ $190)

1008+ $175|
2500+ Callfor Pricing|

1-11 Caltfor Pricing|
12:35 Callfor Pricing
3671 $3.45)
72143 $300)
144287 5260

111 Callfor Pricing|
1235 Callfor Pricing|
3671 $370)

72143 $340)
144-287 $300}
288503 $285)
504+ $2 40|

1008+ $220)

2500+ Callfor Pricing

1-11 Cailfor Pricing
1235 Callfor Pricing|

2500+ Callfor Pricing|
Waned|
$15.00 per color

$1,598 00|
0%|

$1,598 00|
$1,598 00|

Same as tem 7

50 29|

525 00)
$10.00)
$181087
0%}

$1.810 87|
$1,810 87|

NAS
Sport Tek|

TST350 (ony available in adutl
szes large-4XL )|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation ]
[
Opened: June 76, 2020 Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local on-Local Non-Local ;
- A7 Sports Center [Bankson Group LTD dba Advertising Matters, LLC [Al-Star Custom Apparel and _|American Solutions for [Express Press. [Heart N Soul Graphic Designs [Heaven Sent Promotions and_|Promotional Designs. [Rivercity Screen Printing & [ROSCO Imprints and
b (00T GOy Proaionai 1St [ Alamo Tees & Advertisng \ Inc Business and Photography Apparel, LLC Embroidery Embrowdery
6100012605 GoL 1027 Bandera Road 12814 Cogburn 3412 S Grove Street 395 Summit Point Drive, Sutte (9901 IH 10 West 1860 E St Louss St 13529 Chandelle Drive 5611 San Pedro Ave 8150 Brookriver Dr Sutte S- 1709 South 1H-35 120 S Avenue B i
1 155 2
san Antonio San Antonio Fort Worth Hennetta San Antono Sprngfield Newalla san Antonio Datas San Marcos. Freeport 1
Estimated |TX 78245 [TX 78249 TX 76110 INY 14467 TX 78230 MO 65802 OK 74857 TX 78212 TX 75247 [ TX 78666 TX 77541
Description Annual  [(210) 664-0566 (210) 699-3800
Quantity g
84 Short Sleeve T-Shirt (Tall) Wicking Colored (Light and Dark)
Youth Xsmall - Xlarge 50
Prce (per each) No 8] $550 No B No Bi| o Bd| 5593 NoBd No B NoBid No Bial
Extended Price (per each) $275.00} $296 50
| Adut Small - Xiarge 75
Price (per each) $505) 5550 800 3667 $557 LT & XLT) $593 $525 3623 $6 50 Large & X-Large| 36 49
Extended Price (per each) $37875) 5412 50} $600.00) $50025 $40275| $444.75) $39375 $467 25| $487 50) 548675
| Adutt 2X 100
Prce (per each) $6 05) $6 65 $9.00 $772 5645 $793 $525 5748 5775 5799
Extended Price (per each) 5605 00) $665 00} $900 00) 77200} $645.00) 5793 00) $525 00} $748 00 775 00| $798.00)
| Adult 3X 100
Prce (per each) 5805} 5885 $11.00 5982 $860) 38 93| 3602 59 98] $1050) 5999
Extended Price (per each) $805 00} $885 00} $1.100.00) 5982 00| 860 00| $893 00| $602 00} $996 00| $105000) $999 00)
|Adult 4X 100
Prce (per each) $90¢] 5985 $1200 51087 5976 $983 No B 5123 $1175 51099
Extended Price (per each) $906 00f 3985 00) $1,200 00) 5108700 $976.00) $993 00) $1.123.00) $1,175 00| $1,099 00|
| Adutt 5X 75
Prce (per each) No aidf 5985 No Bid| No Bid No B $10.93 No Bidf No B No Bid| No Bid|
Extended Price (per each) $738 75 819 75)
82 Color Imprint
1 Color imprint s070) 5072 5050 5024 3038 50.75| 100 5046 5065 5129
2 Color Imprint 30 90] $0 91| $1.00| $0 30| $0 49| $0 50 $110] $0 60| $0 80| $0 32|
3 Color Imprnt $110§ $1 08§ $1.20] $0 46| $0 56 $0.50 $115] $0 69| $0 95| $0 32|
4 Color Imprnt s130) 5126} $1.40) 5052 5065 50 50f $125 3080 $110) 5032
2 Location Color imprint s070) 5072 $100 $0 24 standard| 3038 5075| 5050 $100 5065 5129
50 83 Sieeve|
Art Change per Hour 55 00] $10.00) No chargel 34600 5000 No charge| 50,00 $1000 $15.00 Waned| $25 00|
Set Up Fee 35 00f $10.00) No charge| $20 00 per screen $16.20 Per Color, Per| No charge| 50 00} $10.00 per color| $15.00 $15 00 per color| $10 00|
tion|
Subtotal $2,709 4s} $3 985 94 53,805 10) $3,409 60| 2,902 41 $4,243 00| $162575 $3,359 80| $3,521 65| $0.00) $3.42229)
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%] 0%) 0% 0% 0%, 0% 1% 0% 0%| 0%|
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $2,709 45§ $3,985 94 $3,805 10| $3,409 60 $2.902 41 $4,243 00 $1,525 75 $3,326 20 $3,521 65 $0 00| $3,422 29)
em 8 Total: incomplete Bic} $3.985.94] 53,805 10) $3,409 60 5290241 34,243 00| $1525 75| Incomplete B $352165| $0.00) 53,422 29)
Payment Terms. Net 30) Net 30 Net 30) Net 30 Net 30} Net 30 Net 30) 1%, 10 Days| Net 30| Net 30} Net30
Estimated Annuai Total $132.678 35, $148071 27 $191.47455) $199.33755 $144930 79) $196.26025 $120082 50 $19123573 $169.759 45 $46,87550) $207 565 39
[Estimated Annual Award 343837 8822189




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 6, 2021
Local
For: Annual Contract for Vehicle Decals RONVAC Corp dba FASTSIGNS
Downtown
6100013394 HH 2897 NE Loop 410, Suite 101
] San Antonio,
Item Description s tt\nnual X 78218
Quantity 210-298-8990
1 Vehicle Decals, Small Decal Size, 5-7/8"
Diameter
1A 5-7/8" Small City Seal Decal 350
Price Per Each $2.83
Extended Price $990.50
2 Vehicle Decals, Large Decal Size, 10" X 10"
2A 10" X 10" Large City Seal Decal 1,000
Price Per Each $6.60
Extended Price $6,600.00
3 Line 1 - City of San Antonio Text
3A Line 1 Text: City of San Antonio BLACK 2,000
Price Per Each $2.04
Extended Price $4,080.00
3B Line 1 Text: City of San Antonio WHITE 24
Price Per Each $2.04
Extended Price $48.96
4 Line 2 - Department Name
4A Line 2 Text: 1-19 Letters BLACK 2,250
Price Per Each $2.04
Extended Price $4,590.00
4B Line 2 Text: 1-19 Letters WHITE 24
Price Per Each $2.04
Extended Price $48.96
5 Line 3 - Department Name Continued
5A Line 3 Text: 20-39 Letters BLACK 10,000
Price Per Each $2.04
Extended Price $20,400.00
5B Line 3 Text: 20-39 Letters WHITE 24
Price Per Each $2.04
Extended Price $48.96
6 Numbers
B6A 2" NUMBERS - 0 TO 9 BLACK 12,000
Price Per Each $0.15
Extended Price $1,800.00
6B 2"NUMBERS -0 TO 9 WHITE 72
Price Per Each $0.15

Extended Price

$10.80

12



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 6, 2021
Local
For: Annual Contract for Vehicle Decals RONVAC Corp dba FASTSIGNS
Downtown
6100013394 HH 2897 NE Loop 410, Suite 101
. San Antonio,
Item Description ERRG) .Annual TX 78218
Quantity 210-298-8990
T SET-UP CHARGE FOR TITLES NOT
IDENTIFIED
7A SET-UP CHARGE 1

Price Per Each
Extended Price

Payment Terms

Estimated Annual Total

$300.00
$300.00

Net 30

$38,918.18

Estimated Annual Award

$38,918.18

212



